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United States Court of Appeals 
for the Federal Circuit 

UNDER SEAL (NON PUBLIC ORDER) 

__________________________ 

IN RE COMPLAINT NO. 23-90015 
__________________________ 

Before the Judicial Council of the Federal Circuit 
 

PER CURIAM.  
ORDER 

Summary 
Judge Pauline Newman is 96 years old and has served 

with distinction as an active judge on this Court for 39 
years.  She has been a highly valued and respected col-
league, and her many contributions to the Court, to the pa-
tent system, and to the law are recognized by all.  Her 
colleagues on this Court have recently paid tribute to 
Judge Newman as “the heroine of the patent system”1 and 
“the most beloved colleague on our court.”2   

Unfortunately, earlier this year mounting evidence 
raised increasing doubts about whether Judge Newman is 
still fit to perform the duties of her office.  When such evi-
dence is brought to the attention of the Chief Judge and the 
Judicial Council, there is an obligation to investigate the 
matter under the procedures established by the Judicial 

 
1 The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore, Anniversaries and 

Observations, 50.4 AIPLA Q. J. 515, 524 (2022).  
2 The Honorable Raymond Chen, Tribute to Judge 

Pauline Newman, 74 N.Y.U. Ann. Surv. Am. L. 3, 3 (2018). 
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Conduct and Disability Act of 1980 (Act)—the self-policing 
mechanism Congress created to address (among other 
things) judges who may no longer be fit for judicial office.  
Failing to act under the circumstances here would breach 
our obligations under the Act, display disregard for the 
rights of litigants bringing their cases before this Court, ig-
nore the rights of court staff to be free from increasingly 
dysfunctional behavior in the workplace, and undermine 
public confidence in the judiciary.  

These are very sad proceedings for all involved.  Judge 
Newman and her counsel have aggressively sought to dis-
credit this entire process by trying their case in the press 
while conjuring a narrative of “hostile,” “disrespect[ful],” 
and “appalling” treatment marked by exercises of “raw 
power,” all borne out of “personal animosity” toward Judge 
Newman.  August 31 Response (Response) 1, 20 n.16, 53.  
There is no evidence to support these claims.  From the out-
set, the Chief Judge and other members of the Court ap-
proached Judge Newman in a respectful manner to 
attempt to address a difficult situation with concern for a 
valued colleague hoping for an informal resolution that 
would have avoided this process.  See March 24 Order at 2; 
Ex. 1 (emails between Chief Judge Moore and Judge New-
man).  Multiple colleagues attempted to speak to Judge 
Newman about her fitness.  She refused to speak to them 
at all or quickly terminated an attempt to discuss the issue.  
The Chief Judge shared a draft complaint with Judge New-
man detailing some of the concerns that had been raised 
and sought to meet with her.  Ex. 1.  Judge Newman re-
fused multiple requests for a meeting.  

This matter became a formal proceeding because Judge 
Newman left no other option.  The Court and all of its staff 
have been trying to work with and support Judge Newman. 
But sadly the circumstances became such that these pro-
ceedings could no longer be avoided given our obligations.   
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On March 24, 2023, the Chief Judge, pursuant to the 
Act and its implementing rules, identified a Complaint and 
appointed a Special Committee (Committee) to investigate 
information indicating that Judge Newman may no longer 
be able to perform the functions of her office.  The investi-
gation began promptly.  And it soon bore out the essential 
allegations in the Complaint regarding Judge Newman’s 
cognitive state. 

The investigation included more than 20 interviews 
with court staff.  Those interviews, along with numerous 
emails sent by Judge Newman, provided overwhelming ev-
idence that Judge Newman may be experiencing signifi-
cant mental problems including memory loss, lack of 
comprehension, confusion, and an inability to perform 
basic tasks that she previously was able to perform with 
ease.  The evidence revealed instances in which, when 
Judge Newman struggled with basic tasks, she became 
frustrated, agitated, belligerent, and hostile towards court 
staff.  The staff report that the behaviors suggesting that 
Judge Newman may have a disability emerged over two 
years and have increased in frequency and severity.  With 
no rational reason—other than frustration over her own 
confusion—Judge Newman has threatened to have staff ar-
rested, forcibly removed from the building, and fired.  She 
accused staff of trickery, deceit, acting as her adversary, 
stealing her computer, stealing her files, and depriving her 
of secretarial support.  Staff have described Judge New-
man in their interactions with her as “aggressive, angry, 
combative, and intimidating”; “bizarre and unnecessarily 
hostile”; making “personal accusations”; “agitated, bellig-
erent, and demonstratively angry”; and “ranting, rambling, 
and paranoid.”  Indeed, interactions with Judge Newman 
have become so dysfunctional that the Clerk of the Court 
has advised staff to avoid interacting with her in person or, 
when they must, to bring a co-worker with them.  This be-
havior has taken a significant toll on court staff.   
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These reports are not of isolated incidents based on a 
few interactions with only one or two staffers.  They come 
from interactions with staff members across a broad range 
of departments from the Clerk’s Office to Information Tech-
nology (IT) to Human Resources (HR) to the General Coun-
sel’s Office to Judge Newman’s own chambers staff.  
During this investigation two of Judge Newman’s five 
chambers’ staff members resigned and requested no fur-
ther contact with her.  One twice asked for assistance un-
der the Court’s Employment Dispute Resolution program 
(EDR), but Judge Newman repeatedly refused to partici-
pate in the EDR processes.  A third, on advice of counsel, 
invoked the Fifth Amendment’s privilege against self-in-
crimination and refused to answer even the most basic 
questions about what goes on in Judge Newman’s cham-
bers, about her responsibilities, or about Judge Newman’s 
mental fitness. 

The evidence from staff is essentially undisputed.  And 
the concerns about disability it supports are confirmed by 
evidence regarding Judge Newman’s workload and produc-
tivity.  Judge Newman acquiesced in several significant re-
ductions in her workload starting in 2021.  Despite the 
reduced workload, data from the Clerk’s Office shows that, 
over the last two years or so, she has taken four times as 
long to issue half the number of opinions as her colleagues.   

The Committee’s investigation culminated in an order 
on May 16 directing Judge Newman to undergo two medi-
cal examinations, directing her to provide to one of the ex-
aminers specified medical records of relevance to assessing 
disability, and requesting that she sit for an interview with 
the Committee.  The two medical examinations were to be 
performed by independent medical providers:  a 30-45-mi-
nute interview with a neurologist, with no required inva-
sive procedures; and a full neuro-psychological 
examination that would involve approximately six hours of 
cognitive testing.  As was explained to Judge Newman, this 
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testing was recommended by the Committee’s medical con-
sultant, who has been retained by other courts in similar 
circumstances, and who was recommended to the Commit-
tee by the Administrative Office of the U.S. Courts.      

Despite the large amount of very troubling evidence, 
Judge Newman refused to comply with the Committee’s or-
der.  The total burden of compliance would be an appoint-
ment with a neurologist for no more than 30-45-minutes, a 
full neuro-psychological examinations lasting about six 
hours, and an interview that might explore the evidence 
that is so troubling.  The burden is small, the basis for con-
cern about disability very substantial, and the job at issue 
of great public importance.  Yet Judge Newman refused. 

The issue now before the Council is: Did Judge New-
man commit misconduct in refusing to follow the May 16 
Order, which ordered medical examinations, the production 
of medical records and requested an interview?  We answer 
in the affirmative.  The evidence raising concerns about 
disability, just summarized, amply justified issuance of the 
Order.  The effect of Judge Newman’s refusal to comply 
with the Order was to thwart this Council’s ability to de-
termine whether Judge Newman has a disability that ren-
ders her unable to perform the duties of her important 
office.  An unjustified thwarting of a key part of the inves-
tigation into disability is recognized under the Act as mis-
conduct.  That is what occurred here. 

We find no merit in Judge Newman’s arguments for 
why the Council should not draw that conclusion.  

First, Judge Newman argues that this matter should 
have been (and still should be) transferred to another cir-
cuit—and that the denial of her transfer request justifies 
her refusal to comply with the May 16 Order.  Yet Judge 
Newman fails to recognize that transfer is appropriate only 
in “exceptional circumstances.”  See Rule 26.  And here, the 
Council concludes that no circumstances have warranted, 
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or currently warrant, taking this step, which would be ex-
traordinary in the context of this disability proceeding.   

In support of transfer, Judge Newman argues that the 
members of this Council have personal knowledge of dis-
puted evidentiary facts concerning this proceeding—and 
thus are biased.  Setting aside the Council’s disagreement 
with her accusations of improper bias, Judge Newman fails 
to appreciate both what is currently at issue and what due 
process requires of adjudicators in this context.  Since June 
1, 2023, the investigation has centered on whether Judge 
Newman’s refusal to comply with the May 16 Order consti-
tuted misconduct.  Although members of the Council inev-
itably have personal experiences with Judge Newman, the 
Committee did not rely on and the Council is not relying on 
those experiences.  In particular, no judge has been a wit-
ness, and the evidence supporting the May 16 Order and 
its enforcement, which is at issue now, in no way depends 
on testimony from fellow judges.  And to the extent Judge 
Newman maintains that the members of this Council can-
not be impartial because they know and have worked with 
her, the argument sweeps too broadly.  As a general mat-
ter, due process in this context does not require that adju-
dicators be totally ignorant concerning background 
information involving parties.  And, as it pertains to the 
Act specifically, the rules explicitly contemplate that cir-
cuit judges will institute, investigate, and ultimately de-
cide disability proceedings concerning one of their 
colleagues. 

Judge Newman cites no example of transferring a dis-
ability proceeding concerning a circuit judge.  Instead, her 
examples of prior transfers all involve a circuit judge’s dis-
crete alleged acts of past behavior that were charged as 
misconduct.  This is an important distinction: unlike dis-
crete acts of past misconduct, which could potentially be 
pursued from afar without serious detriment, this case has 
involved ongoing behavior that was having ongoing effects 
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on the functioning of court staff and the functioning of this 
court.  Ready access to the Committee was therefore vitally 
important to ensure that all relevant information was cap-
tured and timely reported—all in an environment that en-
sured affected staff that they were being heard.  Indeed, by 
the time Judge Newman first requested transfer—on April 
21, 2023—the Committee had already conducted more 
than a dozen interviews and a deposition, two of her staff 
had resigned just days earlier, and many troubling events 
were occurring in real-time.  Given these and other consid-
erations discussed in more detail in this order, granting 
Judge Newman’s transfer request was never a sound 
course.  

Judge Newman has not shown—nor do we see—excep-
tional circumstances in this case that have warranted, or 
currently warrant, transfer.  Indeed, relevant considera-
tions—e.g., avoiding delay, preserving superior investiga-
tive ability, and the need to timely accommodate court staff 
in view of Judge Newman’s ongoing behavior—all weighed 
strongly against transfer (and certainly against finding the 
requisite exceptionality).   

Second, Judge Newman claims that the process was 
unfair because she was never given an opportunity to con-
test the information provided by court staff.  Judge New-
man was given an opportunity to dispute the employee 
statements.  She did not take it.  After being provided cop-
ies of all affidavits and the deposition transcript considered 
by the Committee, Judge Newman made the strategic 
choice not to “delv[e] into the minutia of these affidavits.”  
July 5 Br. at 15.  Instead, she chose to dismiss them as re-
flecting “petty grievances” and to argue that “even assum-
ing” the information in them was true, it “doesn’t even 
approach probable cause to believe that Judge Newman is 
mentally and/or physically disabled.”  Id.  Indeed, Judge 
Newman expressly agreed that there was no need for an 
evidentiary hearing in this matter.  June 15 Letter at 3.  In 
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addition, the Committee advised Judge Newman that it 
sought an interview with her so that she could provide the 
Committee information from her perspective, “including 
correcting any error of fact” in the Committee’s orders.  
May 16 Order at 23–24.  She refused that opportunity as 
well.  She now adds that, even if the staff statements are 
true, there is nothing wrong with how she treated staff and 
she can “run her chambers as she sees fit.”  Response 48.   

Third, Judge Newman has submitted two medical re-
ports from providers of her choosing and claims that these 
reports should put to rest any question about her mental 
fitness.  The reports from Judge Newman’s own selected 
providers, however, are not remotely an adequate substi-
tute for the thorough medical examinations ordered by the 
Committee based on the recommendations of the Commit-
tee’s consultant.   

The first consists of a report largely based on admin-
istration of a Montreal Cognitive Assessment (MOCA), a 
one-page test that takes about 10 minutes to administer.  
The report on its face showed inconsistencies between 
Judge Newman’s reported score and the stated fact that 
she was unable to write (due to a broken wrist), which 
would have prevented her from completing three parts of 
the test.  Properly scored and converted to the scale for a 
full test, it appears that Judge Newman scored below the 
normal range on that test.  And a declaration provided by 
the physician who administered that test does not dispute 
that assessment.   

The second report is based in part on a different 11-
minute cognitive exam, the Modified Mini-Mental State 
(3MS), that tests such things as whether Judge Newman 
can point to her chin, knows the year, and can name a few 
four-legged animals.  It does not remotely provide good 
cause for Judge Newman refusing to take the full neuro-
psychological examination (six hours) requested by the 
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Committee.  The manual for the 3MS test expressly indi-
cates that the test was not designed as a screening tool for 
dementia and is not sensitive enough to detect dementia in 
early stages.  Ex. 2 at 2 (Manual for the Administration 
and Scoring of the Modified Mini-Mental State (3MS) Test) 

The nature and importance of the job of an active judge, 
and the overwhelming evidence of behavior by Judge New-
man indicating a cognitive decline, requires the more thor-
ough and sensitive full neuro-psychological examination 
ordered by the Committee. 

Finally, Judge Newman attacks the May 16 Order by 
pointing to earlier orders and actions and seeks to paint a 
portrait of hostility and bad faith on the part of the Chief 
Judge and the Committee.  The Council has examined the 
specifics of this redirection of focus away from the May 16 
Order.  We reject the specific allegations and the overall 
portrait.  The sad, difficult proceedings have been con-
ducted from the outset responsibly and in good faith.  The 
May 16 Order was proper and sound, and Judge Newman 
was required to comply with it. 

The Judicial Council unanimously concludes that 
Judge Newman’s refusal to comply with the special Com-
mittee’s May 16 Order constitutes serious misconduct 
which warrants a one-year suspension from cases.  We are 
acutely aware that this is not a fitting capstone to Judge 
Newman’s exemplary and storied career.  We all would pre-
fer a different outcome for our friend and colleague.  How-
ever, we have a solemn obligation under the Act and an 
obligation to the litigants before our Court and court staff 
to take action—and not to simply look the other way—
when it appears that a judge of this Court is no longer ca-
pable of performing the duties of her judicial office.  Main-
taining public confidence in the judiciary demands no less.  
And that duty constrains us in this case.  Judge Newman 
can obviate the suspension at any time by complying with 
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the Committee’s May 16 Order and permitting the Com-
mittee to conclude its investigation into her fitness.   
I. Procedural Background and Course of the Inves-

tigation 
On March 24, 2023, Chief Judge Moore entered an or-

der pursuant to Rule 5(a) of the Rules for Judicial-Conduct 
and Judicial-Disability Proceedings identifying a com-
plaint concerning Judge Newman based on information 
providing probable cause to believe that Judge Newman 
“has engaged in conduct prejudicial to the effective and ex-
peditious administration of the business of the courts’ 
and/or ‘is unable to discharge all the duties of office by rea-
son of mental or physical disability.”  March 24 Order at 1 
(quoting 28 U.S.C. § 351(a)).  The order referred to her hav-
ing suffered a heart attack in June 2021, requiring hospital 
care, and a fainting incident in May 2022, and it noted that 
Judge Newman’s workload had been reduced through sev-
eral measures, including no longer having to sit on motions 
panels.  Id.    

As the basis for finding probable cause, the order noted 
that judges and court staff had provided information rais-
ing concerns (i) that Judge Newman was responsible for 
extensive delays in resolving cases and appeared unable to 
complete her opinions in a timely fashion (despite her re-
duced workload), and (ii) that Judge Newman appeared to 
suffer from “impairment of cognitive abilities (i.e., atten-
tion, focus, confusion and memory).”  Id. at 2.  The Order 
further recounted that, after receiving initial information, 
the Chief Judge had conducted a limited inquiry pursuant 
to Rule 5 that provided substantial additional information 
supporting the finding of probable cause.  See id.  Over four 
pages, the Order recounted additional details concerning 
Judge Newman’s exceptional delays in resolving cases and 
information from staff describing behavior that raised con-
cerns about Judge Newman’s cognitive state, including 
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allegations of “inappropriate behavior in managing staff.”  
See id. at 2-5.   

The March 24 Order also recounted that the Chief 
Judge had sought to pursue an “informal resolution” with 
Judge Newman pursuant to Rule 5.  The Chief Judge met 
with Judge Newman and explained the concerns that had 
been raised about Judge Newman’s delays in resolving 
cases and her mental fitness.  On March 17, the Chief 
Judge provided Judge Newman a copy of the order identi-
fying a complaint that would be issued if an informal reso-
lution could not be reached.  Judge Newman refused 
multiple requests to discuss the matter or the draft com-
plaint with the Chief Judge.  Ex. 1.  Left with no other 
choice, the Chief Judge issued the order identifying a com-
plaint on March 24, 2023.   

In a separate order entered on March 24, 2023, pursu-
ant to Rule 11, the Chief Judge appointed a Special Com-
mittee (Committee) to investigate the complaint and 
prepare a report and recommendation for the Judicial 
Council.3   

The Committee immediately began interviewing court 
staff to gather information.  In addition, pursuant to Rule 
13(a) & (c), the Committee retained the services of Dr. 

  as an expert consultant.  Dr.  has 
served as a consultant on judicial disability proceedings in 
other circuits and has been relied upon in the Colorado 

 
3 Pursuant to Rule 12(a) and 28 U.S.C. §§ 353(a)(1) & 

363, the Chief Judge was required to make herself a mem-
ber of the Committee.  In addition, she appointed Judges 
Prost and Taranto.   
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Supreme Court’s attorney disciplinary body as a medical 
expert.4    

On April 7,5 after the Committee had conducted multi-
ple interviews with court staff and consulted with Dr. 

, the Committee issued an order determining that it was 
necessary for the Committee’s investigation to have Judge 
Newman undergo a neurological examination and full 
neuro-psychological testing to determine whether she suf-
fered from a disability.  Dr.  had advised that these 
examinations were necessary to ascertain with a reasona-
ble certainty whether a disability existed.  As the April 7 
Order recounted, Dr.  had identified a qualified neu-
rologist and neuropsychologist to perform the examina-
tions on an expedited basis.  The order provided the names 
of these specialists.  It also noted that “Dr.  is also 
available to speak to Judge Newman to answer any ques-
tions about the nature of the examination and testing” and 
provided Dr. s telephone number.  April 7 Order at 
2.  The order cautioned that refusal to comply without good 
cause shown could result in the investigation being ex-
panded to consider whether failure to cooperate constituted 
misconduct under Rule 4(a)(5).  Id. at 2-3.  

Judge Newman failed to respond to the April 7 Order 
(or to request an extension of time to respond).  On April 
13, pursuant to Rule 13(a) at the Committee’s request, the 
scope of the investigation was expanded to include whether 

 
4 Dr. s qualifications are set out in the R&R.  

See R&R 12, 58–59. 
5 On April 6, an order was entered expanding the scope 

of the investigation to address an incident in which Judge 
Newman had apparently violated the confidentiality provi-
sions of the EDR plan.  That incident is discussed, as rele-
vant, below. 
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Judge Newman’s failure to cooperate constituted miscon-
duct.  

On April 17, the Committee issued an order seeking 
certain medical records and an interview with Judge New-
man.  Dr.  had advised the Committee that Judge 
Newman’s medical records related to an alleged cardiac in-
cident and an episode of fainting could shed light on a con-
dition relevant to assessing her cognitive state.  
Accordingly, the order required Judge Newman to provide 
medical records related to the health incidents described in 
the March 24 Order (i.e., what the March 24 Order de-
scribed as a heart attack and an incident of fainting).  April 
17 Order at 1.  The order also required Judge Newman to 
provide records “of any treatment or consultation in the 
last two years regarding attention, focus, confusion, 
memory loss, fatigue or stamina.”  Id. at 2.  Finally, the 
order requested that Judge Newman sit with the Commit-
tee for a videotaped interview.  Id.  The order proposed that 
Judge Newman should provide the medical records by May 
5, 2023, and inform the Committee by April 21 whether she 
would supply the medical records and sit for an interview 
or else “provide good cause why an extension of time is 
needed to respond to this [o]rder.”  April 17 Order at 2.6 

 On April 21, 2023, counsel for Judge Newman filed a 
letter brief (April 21 Letter) suggesting that Judge New-
man might be willing to cooperate with the Committee’s 
orders but insisting that the Committee first address a 

 
6 On April 20, an order was entered expanding the 

scope of the investigation to include whether three addi-
tional incidents constituted misconduct by Judge Newman.  
Those incidents are discussed, as relevant, below. 
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request by Judge Newman to transfer this proceeding to 
another circuit.  April 21 Letter at 3.7    

On May 3, the Committee issued an order responding 
to the April 21 Letter. (May 3 Order).  The order declined 
the transfer request, explaining that, under the Rules, a 
discretionary transfer may be considered only in “excep-
tional circumstances,” id. at 10 (quoting Rule 26).  The or-
der responded to Judge Newman’s assertion that judges on 
the Committee and the Judicial Council “likely” would be-
come witnesses by pointing out that such a concern was 
premature.  The result of the medical examinations would 
likely determine the course of the investigation and need 
for other evidence.  Accordingly, the order denied the re-
quest without prejudice to renewing it after Judge New-
man had complied with the Committee’s orders regarding 
medical examinations and medical records.  Id. at 12–14.8 

The May 3 Order also renewed the Committee’s orders 
regarding medical examinations and medical records.  It 
detailed additional information establishing a reasonable 
basis for those orders and set a deadline of May 10 for 
Judge Newman to indicate whether she would comply.   

 
7 The April 21 Letter also raised a matter outside the 

purview of the Committee.  On March 8, 2023, the Judicial 
Council had voted unanimously to preclude the assignment 
of new cases to Judge Newman.  In her April 21 Letter, 
Judge Newman challenged that action as unlawful. 

8 The Committee had also referred Judge Newman’s re-
quest for a transfer to the Judicial Council, which issued 
its own order denying the request without prejudice to re-
newal after Judge Newman complies with the Committee’s 
orders regarding medical examinations, medical records 
and an interview.  May 3 Judicial Council Order. 
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On May 10, 2023, Judge Newman objected to the Com-
mittee’s May 3 Order.9  See May 10 Letter.  With respect to 
the medical examinations, Judge Newman raised three 
concerns.  First, she argued that she should be permitted 
to choose the professionals who would conduct any exami-
nations.  Second, although the Committee had made Dr. 

 “available to speak to Judge Newman to answer 
any questions about the nature of the examination and 
testing,” April 7 Order at 2, Judge Newman—without con-
tacting Dr. —complained that the testing was of 
“unknown duration and scope.”  May 10 Letter at 4.  Third, 
Judge Newman objected to the lack of any defined limita-
tion on the use of the examination results.  Id.  As for the 
medical records, Judge Newman argued that they were ir-
relevant.  Id. at 3–4.  The May 10 Letter also reiterated 
Judge Newman’s request that the proceeding be trans-
ferred to another circuit.10    

On May 16, 2023, the Committee issued an order re-
sponding to Judge Newman’s objections.  (May 16 Order).  
The order clarified that the medical examinations would be 
non-invasive and would consist of an in-person examina-
tion by a neurologist lasting 30-45 minutes and a full bat-
tery of neuro-psychological testing with a 
neuropsychologist, which would involve an interview and 
tests involving answering questions and performing tasks 
“designed to test all major areas of neurocognitive function-
ing.”  May 16 Order at 21–22.  That testing could take up 
to six hours.  The Committee agreed that, if the neurologist 

 
9 Judge Newman also filed a complaint in federal dis-

trict court against the members of the Committee and the 
entire Judicial Council.  See Newman v. Moore, No. 1:23-
cv-01334-CRC, Dkt. 1 (D.D.C. May 10, 2023). 

10 It also repeated her request that the Judicial Council 
immediately restore her to the rotation for new case assign-
ments.  See supra n.7. 
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believed that any additional tests were required, “such 
testing can be the subject of further discussion between the 
Committee and Judge Newman after th[e] initial examina-
tion has taken place.”  Id. at 22.  The Committee explained 
that the results would be used solely to aid the Committee 
in its determination of whether Judge Newman has a dis-
ability and for the preparation of its report and recommen-
dation to the Judicial Council.  Id. at 23. 

With respect to medical records, the May 16 Order 
“more clearly define[d] [the] requests for medical records.”  
May 16 Order at 2.  In addition to records related to any 
treatment concerning “mental acuity, attention, focus, con-
fusion, memory loss, fatigue, or stamina,” the Committee 
explained that it sought records “that relate to Judge New-
man’s alleged cardiac issues and fainting episode.”  Id. at 
4.  The order explained that the Committee’s consultant, 
Dr. , had advised that “medical records related to a 
cardiac event and a fainting episode . . . may very well shed 
light on the observed changes in Judge Newman’s behav-
ior.”  Id. at 5.  To address privacy concerns, the Committee 
clarified that the medical records could be provided solely 
to the neurologist who would evaluate Judge Newman and 
not to the Committee.  Id. at 6. 

The May 16 Order detailed the information providing 
a reasonable basis for concern about Judge Newman’s cog-
nitive state.  It also explained that the Committee sought 
an interview with Judge Newman in part to provide her an 
opportunity to provide information, “including correcting 
any error of fact” in the Committee’s orders and to “clarify 
these matters.”  Id. at 23–24. 

The Committee concluded the May 16 Order by: (1) re-
quiring (for the third time) that Judge Newman undergo 
the required medical examinations; (2) requiring (for the 
third time) that she produce the medical records; and (3) 
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requesting (for the second time) that she sit for an inter-
view with the Committee.  Id. at 25.   

On May 25, 2023, Judge Newman refused to comply 
with the May 16 Order (May 25 Letter).       

 On May 26, at the request of the Committee pursuant 
to Rule 13(a), the scope of the investigation was expanded 
to include whether Judge Newman’s refusal to cooperate 
with the May 16 Order constituted misconduct. 

On June 1, the Committee determined that Judge 
Newman’s refusal to comply with the Committee’s order 
impaired the Committee’s ability to make an informed as-
sessment of whether Judge Newman suffers from a disabil-
ity.  See June 1 Order at 2–3.  Accordingly, the Committee 
narrowed the focus of its investigation to address the ques-
tion whether Judge Newman’s refusal to cooperate with 
the Committee’s order constituted misconduct.  Id. at 3–4.  
Given that narrowed focus, the Committee determined, 
and Judge Newman agreed, that no evidentiary hearing 
under Rule 14 would be required because the misconduct 
issue could be determined based on the paper record show-
ing Judge Newman’s responses to the Committee’s order 
and because there were no percipient fact witnesses with 
relevant evidence on that issue.  See June 1 Order at 4-5; 
June 15 Letter at 3 (“We agree with this assessment.”).11 

 
11 On June 5, the Judicial Council, treating Judge New-

man’s requests that she be restored to the rotation of new 
case assignments, see supra nn.7, 10, as a request for re-
consideration of the Council’s March 8 order, issued an or-
der considering de novo whether Judge Newman should be 
suspended from new case assignments.  The Judicial Coun-
cil explained under its authority under 28 U.S.C. § 332(d), 
it was suspending Judge Newman from new case 
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The June 1 Order required Judge Newman to submit a 
brief, limited to the misconduct issue, by July 5, and set 
oral argument for July 13.  To ensure that Judge Newman 
could challenge the reasonable basis for the Committee’s 
order, the Committee also provided Judge Newman all of 
the witness affidavits and the single deposition transcript 
on which the Committee had relied.  June 1 Order at 5.     

Judge Newman thereby had the opportunity to respond 
to all the material the Committee had in its possession sup-
porting the Committee’s order.    

Judge Newman submitted her brief on July 5 along 
with medical evidence, and on July 13 the Committee 
heard argument.  Judge Newman’s July 5 Brief expressly 
requested, pursuant to Rule 23(b)(7) “the public release of 
this letter and any Order or communication issued in re-
sponse thereto.”  July 5 Br. at 1 n.1. 

On July 31, 2023, the Committee issued its Report & 
Recommendation (R&R) and, pursuant to Judge Newman’s 
request, publicly released it (with appropriate redactions 
to protect the privacy of witnesses).          
II. The R&R Sets Out Overwhelming Evidence that 

Provided a Reasonable Basis for the Commit-
tee’s May 16 Order 
The Committee’s investigation uncovered overwhelm-

ing evidence of behavior by Judge Newman that provided 
a reasonable basis for concluding that she may suffer from 
a disability that renders her unable to discharge the duties 

 
assignments based on her lengthy delays in issuing opin-
ions.  It was “concerned that assigning additional cases to 
Judge Newman now will only interfere with her ability to 
clear her current backlog and exacerbate delays in her al-
ready long-delayed opinions.”  June 5 Judicial Council Or-
der at 4.  



IN RE COMPLAINT NO 23-90015 
 
 

19 
 

of her office.  We find that the Committee was justified in 
issuing its May 16 Order concerning medical examinations, 
medical records, and an interview. 

A. The Evidence of Troubling Behavior in Inter-
actions with Staff Provided a Sufficient and In-
dependent Basis for the May 16 Order 
Affidavits prepared after more than 20 interviews with 

Court staff reflect consistent reports of deeply troubling in-
teractions with Judge Newman that suggest significant 
mental deterioration including memory loss, confusion, 
lack of comprehension, paranoia, anger, hostility, and se-
vere agitation.  Critically, these reports are not isolated in-
cidents of occasional forgetfulness based on a few 
interactions with only one or two staffers.  To the contrary, 
they come from interactions with staff members across a 
broad range of departments from the Clerk’s Office to In-
formation Technology (IT), to Human Resources (HR), to 
the General Counsel Office, to Judge Newman’s own cham-
bers staff.  And contrary to Judge Newman’s assertions, the 
reports indicate that the behaviors suggesting that Judge 
Newman may have a disability emerged over two years and 
increased in frequency and severity.  Judge Newman has 
never specifically disputed any of the staff accounts, many 
of which are independently substantiated by Judge New-
man’s own emails attached as exhibits.   

1. Evidence of Memory Loss, Confusion, and 
Lack of Comprehension 

Judge Newman has been having trouble recalling 
events, conversations, and information just days old and 
having trouble comprehending basic information that court 
staff communicate to her.   Aff. [1] ¶ 10 (“I have on 
multiple occasion[s] seen Judge Newman have trouble re-
calling events and information.”); id. ¶¶ 11–12 (chambers 
staff member describing Judge Newman forgetting recent 
conversations and that “Judge Newman did not recall the 
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opinion that was issued a day earlier”);    
Aff. [2] ¶¶ 7–11 (“We have to walk her through the same 
steps over and over and she does not seem to remember 
them from day to day.”);  Aff. [3] ¶ 4 (reporting that 
Judge Newman asked her the same question related to 
compensation for a temporary employee four separate 
times by email in an approximately 24-hour period);12 

   Aff. [4] ¶¶ 37–39 (reporting Judge Newman 
could not comprehend the location of her files on her com-
puter after five separate emails explaining the matter to 
her).  At times she seems confused and suspicious and to 
be struggling to comprehend or remember what she is be-
ing told.     Aff. [4] ¶5 (“[I]t appeared to me 
that from one email to the next Judge Newman either did 
not read or did not recall the lengthy prior explanations I 
provided to her.”).   

Her judicial assistant, who spoke to her by phone every 
workday and was present in chambers every workday be-
tween approximately December 2021 (when he started in 
that role) and April 2023 (when he resigned), observed 

 
12 The HR Director tried repeatedly to work with Judge 

Newman both to bring back her requested temporary judi-
cial assistant and to post an opening for a new permanent 
person.   Aff.  [3] ¶ 2; id. ¶ 3 (“I had over 20 email 
and phone call exchanges with Judge Newman over this 
time trying to get her approval [for temporary and perma-
nent hiring].”).  It is clear from the emails that any delay 
in Judge Newman’s secretarial support was due to her non-
responsiveness or confusion.  Id. ¶ 3 (“It took a long time 
for Judge Newman to permit me to move forward on both 
the temporary rehire and the permanent requirement . . . I 
had to answer the same questions repeatedly and then wait 
for answers on those same issues to move forward.”); see 
also Ex. 3 (email chain between Judge Newman and HR 
Director).   
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Judge Newman’s “memory loss and confusion has in-
creased significantly since [he] started at the court.”  

 Aff. [1] ¶¶ 1, 4, 5, 10.  The IT Help Desk Manager 
reported: “Having worked with Judge Newman for years, I 
have noticed significant deterioration in her memory, con-
fusion, and ability to understand and execute simple tasks 
over the last year.”     Aff. [2] ¶ 12.  The 
Director of IT indicated that he has worked with Judge 
Newman for many years and that, while he was amazed at 
how quickly and easily she picked things up when she was 
in her 80s, he noticed a change: “over the last few years, 
I’ve noticed a significant increase in Judge Newman forget-
ting how to perform basic tasks that used to be routine for 
her.”   Aff. [5] ¶ 2. 

Judge Newman’s judicial assistant reported that, in 
daily telephone calls with her, he would have to repeat in-
formation about the status of cases over and over to her 
and that she would forget whether she had voted on cases 
or had circulated opinions to the panel for vote.  See  
Aff. [1] ¶¶ 12–13.  In one non-case-related incident, Judge 
Newman selected pictures of herself from her personal col-
lection for use in a display the library was preparing—yet 
when these pictures were shown to her the next month, she 
had no idea where they had come from and even stated that 
she had never seen them before.  Id. ¶ 11 (“She seemed to 
have entirely forgotten about our prior recent meetings.”).  
In her last three oral argument sittings, she showed up to 
court without any of the materials she would typically 
bring to court (such as briefs and bench memos).  Id. ¶ 23. 

In a recent episode, Judge Newman indicated that she 
was not required to comply with a Court rule that requires 
a judge to circulate votes on opinions within 5 days of re-
ceiving a proposed opinion from the judge assigned the 
opinion.  See id. ¶ 22.  This rule was unanimously adopted 
by the Court (including Judge Newman) in March 2018.  
Judge Newman said that she did not have to comply with 
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this rule because Chief Judge Markey told her she could 
take 30 days to vote.  Id.  Chief Judge Markey has been 
dead for 17 years and has not been a member of the Court 
for 32 years. 

In another instance, Judge Newman was unable to 
complete the Court’s mandatory security awareness train-
ing, because she was simply “unable to retain the infor-
mation” from a 10–20-minute video even after watching it 
multiple times.   Aff. [5] ¶ 5.  The IT Director indi-
cated that Judge Newman repeatedly failed the short mul-
tiple-choice test—even though retesting involves 
presentation of the same multiple-choice questions each 
time.  Id.  Ultimately, the IT Director watched the video 
with her and reported that he had to “feed her the answers 
to the questions in order for her to pass.”  Id. 

Staff reported evidence of cognitive problems in various 
contexts—such as inability to perform simple tasks from 
one day to the next, even though she performed them inde-
pendently for years without difficulty.     
Aff.  [2] ¶ 10 (“Judge Newman was simply not comprehend-
ing the simple process for using the application that she 
used to have no problem handling on her own.”);  Aff. 
[5] ¶ 2;  Aff. [1] ¶ 23.  “She never used to have a prob-
lem with these routine tasks but now seems to repeatedly 
forget how to do them.”     Aff. [2] ¶ 9;  
Aff. [5] ¶ 4 (“she often cannot recall routine steps or pro-
cesses and we will need to walk her through the entire pro-
cess and repeat the steps over and over again.  These are 
things like remoting into the system that used to be no 
problem for Judge Newman until more recently.”).   

These events do not involve difficulty adapting to new 
technology, see Response 52–53, but rather inability to per-
form the same tasks that Judge Newman once performed 
independently with ease and the need to be repeatedly re-
instructed on how to complete them.   Aff. [5] ¶¶ 2,4 
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(“I’ve noticed a significant increase in Judge Newman for-
getting how to perform basic tasks that used to be routine 
for her.”);    Aff. [2] ¶¶ 7–9, 10 (“She never 
used to have a problem with these routine tasks” for “pro-
cesses [that] have not changed” “but now seems to repeat-
edly forget how to do them.”).   

Another Clerk’s Office staff member reported an inci-
dent about 16–22 months ago in which he had to assist 
Judge Newman with walking to the courtroom and where 
she had to stop and sit outside the robing room to “gather 
the energy to stand.”   Aff. [6] ¶ 5.  He said that 
“[s]he seemed lost and confused, like she wasn’t fully 
there.”  Id.  He also, like other employees, reported having 
to answer the same questions from her over and over in the 
same conversation.  Id. ¶ 3.  He indicated that Judge New-
man was “suspicious and confused and struggled to com-
prehend” how an error in calendaring had occurred.  Id.  He 
explained it to her repeatedly, but she acted “distrustful.”  
Id. 

2. Staff Report Evidence of Agitation and Un-
warranted Paranoia 

Judge Newman has frequently claimed that her email 
and computer were being hacked—also, at times, that her 
phones were being bugged—and her complaints recently 
increased from once or twice a week to almost daily or every 
other day.  See    Aff. [2] ¶¶ 3, 7–10;  
Aff. [1] ¶ 14;  Aff. [5] ¶¶ 2–4, 6;  Aff. [7] ¶ 4.  
Staff described her demeanor when making these com-
plaints as “agitated” and “paranoid” and the conversations 
as sometimes “bizarre” and “nonsensical.”   Aff. [7] 
¶ 8 (“I would describe Judge Newman’s response as non-
sensical because there was no reason to believe any of that 
was happening.”); see    Aff. [2] ¶ 8 (“She 
seems agitated and paranoid, and we frequently have to 
calm her down in order to help her with her problem.”); see 
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also  Aff. [8] ¶ 5 (“I found Judge Newman’s behavior 
during this whole event to be very bizarre and confusing.”).   

In the past, Judge Newman claimed that the culprits 
who were hacking and bugging her devices were bloggers 
and the media who were out to get her and bring her down.  

 Aff. [1] ¶ 14.  More recently, she claimed that it is 
the Court itself hacking, bugging, and deleting information 
on her devices.     Aff. [2] ¶ 3;  Aff. 
[7] ¶¶ 4, 8.  At one point, she suggested that the Court was 
interfering with mail at her residence as well.   Aff. 
[7] ¶ 8.   

In each instance, IT staff scanned her devices and 
found no evidence to justify or support Judge Newman’s 
concerns.   Aff. [1] ¶ 14 (“ITO would inform me that 
there were no concerns or IT issues.”);  Aff. [5] ¶ 3 
(describing that IT would “scan for malware and viruses, 
[and] there would be nothing that would suggest any mali-
cious interference with her computer”).  Her claims about 
hackers usually stemmed from her having forgotten where 
she saved a file or email, and even after the IT staff located 
the file or email for her (on her desktop or in one of her 
folders), she sometimes would continue to allege that hack-
ers were responsible for hiding the file.   Aff. [5] ¶ 3 
(“Judge Newman routinely blamed her inability to find a 
file or email on someone ‘hacking’ her computer . . . I would 
usually be able to find the file she was looking for on a desk-
top folder or other location where she had forgot she saved 
it to.  Rather than take responsibility for the errors, she 
would blame hackers or the computer.”);  Aff. [1] ¶ 
14 (“She seemed constantly paranoid about this despite no 
actual basis for her to be concerned.”);    Aff. 
[2] ¶ 8 (stating Judge Newman’s concerns “seem to be eas-
ily explained by . . . forgetting what she was doing or not 
realizing that the network disconnected her based on inac-
tivity”).   
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3. Concerns Raised by Events Surrounding 
Chambers Staff 

Recent events surrounding the departure of one of 
Judge Newman’s law clerks and her judicial assistant have 
raised concerns on multiple fronts, including (1) her inabil-
ity to remember (or unwillingness to comply with) the 
Court’s EDR process, its confidentiality, and outcomes es-
tablished in that process, (2) her inability to remember or 
comprehend repeated explanations given to her about sim-
ple staffing and IT matters related to the departure of 
these employees from her chambers, and (3) her hostile and 
accusatory interactions with staff based on perceived 
wrongs that never actually occurred.  To summarize, on 
April 19, 2023, two of Judge Newman’s own chambers staff 
(one law clerk and her judicial assistant) came unsolicited 
to the Committee to report troubling behavior by Judge 
Newman, requested assistance from the Committee, and 
resigned from her chambers.  Both expressly requested no 
further contact with Judge Newman.   Aff. [9] ¶ 
17; Exs. 4 (email from Chief Judge Moore to Judge New-
man and chambers staff regarding  ), 5 (email 
from Chief Judge Moore to Judge Newman and chambers 
staff regarding  ).   

The resignation of Judge Newman’s judicial assistant 
was prompted, in part, by Judge Newman’s failure to man-
age a third member of her staff.  Judge Newman (1) per-
mitted her career clerk to call her judicial assistant in the 
middle of the night, including 3:00 am calls to request per-
sonal services (such as a 6:00 am wake-up call for the ca-
reer clerk), (2) refused her judicial assistant’s requests for 
help, (3) refused to participate in the Court’s EDR process, 
and (4) inappropriately shared confidential details regard-
ing the EDR matter with 95 court staff members and stated 
that her judicial assistant’s concerns were, in Judge New-
man’s view, not “significant.”  April 6 Order at 6;  
Aff. [10] ¶¶ 1, 3–4;  Aff. [1] ¶ 35 (“Despite my 
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requests to stop, the clerk continued to contact me outside 
of regular working hours after bringing the matter to 
Judge Newman’s attention.”); Ex. 6 (email from Judge 
Newman to 95 staff members).  Judge Newman sent this 
email to the court staff distribution list just three hours af-
ter being reminded not to use the court distribution for 
emails containing sensitive matters.  Ex. 6.  The EDR pro-
cess and its confidentiality are hallmarks of the judiciary’s 
workplace conduct program.  EDR Plan for the Federal Cir-
cuit § IV.B.1 (“All individuals involved in the processes un-
der this Plan must protect the confidentiality of the 
allegations of wrongful conduct . . . Information will be 
shared only to the extent necessary and only with those 
whose involvement is necessary to address the situation.”).   

Citing several specific examples, her judicial assistant 
filed a request for assisted resolution alleging that Judge 
Newman “was being abusive and retaliating against me” 
and “created a very hostile work environment for me.”  

 Aff. [1] ¶¶27, 31.  Through the EDR process, the ju-
dicial assistant was given an alternative workstation out-
side Judge Newman’s chambers as he continued to work 
for Judge Newman.  Id. ¶¶ 31–32.  In response, Judge New-
man told other members of her chambers staff that her ju-
dicial assistant could no longer be trusted.   Aff. 
[9] ¶ 4 (law clerk stating he was informed by Judge New-
man to no longer include   on chambers commu-
nications “because he could not be trusted”).  Judge 
Newman refused to participate in the EDR process or to 
respect the process, including the workstation move.  Staff 
members reported that on April 18, Judge Newman stated 
her intention to have her judicial assistant forcibly re-
moved from the building or arrested.  See    
Aff. [2] ¶ 6 (“Judge Newman then said that she was going 
to have  ‘removed from the court’ or ‘arrested.’”); 

 Aff. [7] ¶ 19 (“Judge Newman stated that she would 
have  removed from the court or arrested.”).  Although 
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Judge Newman had been informed that her judicial assis-
tant was temporarily provided an alternative workplace 
under the Court’s EDR plan, she refused to accept that ac-
commodation (or could not remember it), and on April 19 
she gave the judicial assistant an ultimatum: return to 
chambers immediately or she would accept his resignation 
(i.e., he would lose his job).   Aff. [1] ¶ 34 (“I under-
stood Judge Newman as saying that she was going to ter-
minate me immediately unless I dropped my request for an 
alternative work arrangement under the court’s Employ-
ment Dispute Resolution Plan . . . .”);  Aff. [10] ¶ 8.   

In light of these events, the judicial assistant resigned 
from Judge Newman’s chambers, he was placed on the 
Clerk’s Office staff, and an email was sent to Judge New-
man on April 19, 2023, informing her that the judicial as-
sistant was no longer a member of her chambers and that 
he wished for there to be no further communication to him 
by any member of the Newman chambers, including the 
Judge.  See Ex. 4;  Aff. [10] ¶ 9. 

On the same day, one of Judge Newman’s law clerks 
also sought to and did remove himself from Judge New-
man’s chambers.  He informed Judge Newman that he was 
uncomfortable performing personal work for her rather 
than court-related work.   Aff. [9] ¶ 6.  He indi-
cated that he was uncomfortable in chambers after Judge 
Newman told him that her judicial assistant could not be 
trusted and should be excluded from all chambers commu-
nications.  Id. ¶¶ 2–4, 7, 9–16.  He stated that he started 
teleworking to avoid the “drama, politics, and stress” in 
chambers.  Id. ¶ 7.  He requested to be transferred to an-
other chambers.  Id. ¶¶ 11, 14.  Judge Newman refused to 
let him work for another judge, indicating that the optics 
would not be good for her and that he had two choices: stay 
or resign.  Id. ¶ 14.  The law clerk resigned, and he was 
taken on as a law clerk by another judge of the Court; he 
requested no further contact with Judge Newman, and 
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Judge Newman received an email to that effect on April 19, 
2023.  Id. ¶ 17; see Ex. 5. 

Judge Newman acknowledged receiving the email 
about her law clerk, indicated that her clerk’s resignation 
was “appropriate,” and stated that the clerk’s separation 
from her chambers should be expeditiously processed.  See 
Ex. 5.  Yet, eight days later, Judge Newman emailed all 
judges on the Court indicating that she had not “released” 
the law clerk and that his continued service at the Court in 
another chambers was “in violation of my right to law clerk 
services.”  Ex. 7.  Similarly, Judge Newman was fully in-
formed that her judicial assistant had resigned on April 19.  
See Ex. 4.  Yet again 8 days later, she emailed all judges 
stating: “I never released my judicial assistant [] from my 
chambers staff.  His movement to your staff, without con-
sultation with me, violates his confidentiality and other ob-
ligations to me.”  Ex. 7.   

Despite being repeatedly told that the judicial assis-
tant chose to leave her chambers because of her alleged 
abusive treatment of him, Judge Newman has accused the 
Court, various judges, the Chief Judge, and the Clerk of 
Court on multiple occasions of having improperly taken her 
judicial assistant away and/or depriving her of secretarial 
services.  See Exs. 3, 8–9; see    Aff. [4] ¶¶ 4, 
10–11, 13 and attached exhibits (quoting Newman May 17 
email stating that he “deprived [her] of secretarial ser-
vices” (alteration in original)).    

These facts raise concerns about Judge Newman’s con-
fusion, memory, and ability to interact with court staff—all 
of which contribute to our concerns that she may have a 
disability that renders her unfit to continue as an active 
judge.   

Moreover, Judge Newman’s career clerk, who has been 
with her for several years, on advice of counsel, refused to 
answer basic questions from the Committee about her 
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responsibilities in chambers or about Judge Newman’s 
mental fitness, instead invoking the Fifth Amendment 
privilege against self-incrimination.  That invocation was 
proper only if it was reasonable to believe that answering 
questions about the clerk’s duties could expose the clerk to 
criminal liability.  See Doe ex rel. Rudy-Glanzer v. Glanzer, 
232 F.3d 1258, 1263 (9th Cir. 2000).  For example, when 
asked, “Q.  We understand that you are her career clerk.  
Can you tell us about that role and what your responsibili-
ties are? A. I am going to invoke my right under the Fifth 
Amendment to avoid self-incrimination.”   Deposi-
tion at 4:5–9.  She further invoked the Fifth Amendment 
when asked about her perceptions of Judge Newman’s abil-
ity to carry out her job.  Id. at 30:4–9.   

4. Dysfunctional Behavior Suggests Disability 
and Creates Workplace Abuse Concerns 

Judge Newman has baselessly and relentlessly accused 
various staff of stealing her computers, stealing her files, 
depriving her of secretarial services, and acting as counsel 
against her.     Aff. [4] ¶¶ 4, 10–11, 13, 25–40 
and attached exhibits;    Aff. [11] ¶¶ 2–6, 8; 
Exs. 3, 8, 9 at 9;  Aff. [1] ¶ 14.  Staff described Judge 
Newman in their interactions with her as “aggressive, an-
gry, combative, and intimidating”; “bizarre and unneces-
sarily hostile”; making “personal accusations”; “agitated, 
belligerent, and demonstratively angry”; “ranting, ram-
bling, and paranoid”; and “mumbling” and “pacing.”  

   Aff. [4] ¶ 37;    Aff. [11] ¶ 5; 
   Aff. [2] ¶ 3;  Aff. [8] ¶¶ 3, 5;  

Aff. [7] ¶ 19;  Aff. [1] ¶ 33. One staff member indi-
cated that “Judge Newman is simply losing it mentally.”  

   Aff. [2] ¶ 12.  Given that this behavior is 
reported to occur in scenarios where it is clear that Judge 
Newman is confused or has forgotten how to perform tasks 
that she could previously do, or is unable to comprehend 
instructions, there is a reasonable basis to conclude that 
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this inappropriate conduct towards staff is related to a dis-
ability.    

Judge Newman has become convinced that, when her 
judicial assistant’s computer was moved out of her cham-
bers along with him (as is standard practice), see  

  Aff. [4] ¶ 28, files from her chambers were removed 
with it.  Multiple staff members from the IT Department 
and the Clerk’s Office have explained to her over and over 
again that all chambers information was stored on her 
chambers’ shared network drive, not the hard drive on that 
computer; that the hard drive on that computer had specif-
ically been checked multiple times and contained none of 
her chambers’ information; and that IT could help her lo-
cate whatever information she needs.  See    
Aff. [4] ¶¶ 27–40 and attached exhibits;    
Aff. [11] ¶¶ 2–6.  Judge Newman, however, either was un-
able to understand or refused to accept these explanations.         

The Clerk of Court13 detailed Judge Newman’s re-
peated email accusations that he was involved in “illicit re-
moval” of equipment from her chambers and that he 
participated in the theft or removal of chambers records in-
cluding her financial disclosure information—along with 
accusations that he was acting as Chief Judge Moore’s law-
yer, that he was Judge Newman’s “adversary,” and that he 
repeatedly withheld secretarial services from her.   
May 31 Aff. [4] ¶ 4 and attached exhibits.  He reported how 
he had to explain to Judge Newman five separate times 
that no one had stolen her computer or her records and that 
he verified that fact and had the IT Department verify it 
on multiple occasions.  Id. ¶¶ 25–40; see also   

 Aff. [4] ¶ 27 & Ex. C at 2 (“Because all of your chambers 
materials, drafts, and documents are stored on your cham-
bers network drive and not the local desktop, nothing about 

 
13 Before July 1, the court’s current Clerk of Court was 

Deputy Clerk and at times Acting Clerk of Court. 
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the move of this desktop ever hindered, restricted, or inter-
fered with access by either you or your chambers staff to 
these materials.”).  He described Judge Newman’s behavior 
towards staff as “agitated, belligerent and demonstratively 
angry.”  Id. ¶ 37 and attached exhibits.  And he has stated 
that “the hostile nature of Judge Newman’s personal accu-
sations against me stands in sharp contrast to how I have 
interacted with any of the other 50-or-so federal judges 
with whom I have worked both in the Federal Circuit and 
in other federal courts since I began working in the federal 
judiciary in 2004.”  Id. ¶ 5.   

After Judge Newman had once again accused the 
Clerk’s Office employees of stealing her computer and files, 
on May 16, 2023, IT staff were sent to her chambers to as-
sist her.     Aff. [11] ¶ 2; see also  Aff. 
[8] ¶¶ 1–5.  The IT staff told Judge Newman that they knew 
exactly where her financial disclosure information was lo-
cated on her desktop and offered to show her.    

 Aff. [11] ¶¶ 3–5.  She angrily refused to let them touch 
her computer.  Id. ¶ 3.  They offered to show her law clerk 
where the file was located if she preferred.  Id. ¶ 6.  She 
refused that assistance as well.  Id.  She was “clearly upset 
and frustrated and was walking back and forth mumbling 
about how her computer and phone had been taken away 
from her when that was not the case.”  Id. ¶ 8; see also 

 Aff. [8] ¶¶ 3, 5 (“Judge Newman was pacing back and 
forth and visibly angry and frustrated . . . . I found Judge 
Newman’s behavior during this whole event to be very bi-
zarre and confusing.”).  Judge Newman became angry, said 
that her judicial assistant had stolen her computer, phone, 
and files, and demanded “that she wanted her ‘twenty-
year-old computer’ back.”     Aff. [11] ¶ 4.  
Her anger was so intense it raised fears that she might col-
lapse.  Id. ¶ 7 (“I got worried that Judge Newman was get-
ting so angry that she might collapse or have a heart attack 
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if the conversation continued.”); id. ¶ 8 (reporting being 
shaken by the exchange). 

Judge Newman’s accusatory interactions with staff 
about her supposedly stolen computer continued unabated 
even into July of this year, when she claimed that “decades 
of my work and my information” were on the computer and 
accused staff of “clever dissembling,” being “shameful,” and 
engaging in “trickery” after they again repeatedly ex-
plained that none of her information was on the hard drive 
of that computer.  See Ex. 9 at 29.  In a single two-day pe-
riod from July 6 to July 7, more than two dozen emails 
passed between Judge Newman and the Director of IT, the 
Help Desk Manager, and the Clerk of Court regarding her 
allegations that they stole her computer and files and their 
attempts to explain to her that her files all reside on her 
chambers’ shared drive and none of her files were on the 
judicial assistant’s hard drive.  See generally Ex. 9; id. at 4 
(Director of IT confirming “   has no access to 
Judge Newman’s shared drive nor has any of Judge New-
man’s data stored locally on his PC.”); id. at 5 (IT staff 
member confirming the same).  The staff respectfully and 
patiently explained to Judge Newman that “[e]very cham-
bers stores those items on their network drives which are 
accessible to every computer in that chambers.  The items 
you describe are located on your network drive.”  Id. at 18; 
see also, e.g., id. at 22 (Clerk of Court explaining to Judge 
Newman that “I am at a loss for how different a way I can 
again explain what I have explained to you repeatedly for 
months.  Your files are on your network drive.  You have 
access to everything.”); id. at 9 (Director of IT again ex-
plaining “[w]e have checked, double checked and triple 
checked and there is no data on any local computer or drive 
that belongs to you.  All of your data is on the Newman 
share.”); id. at 12 (Director of IT confirming a third time 
that “no Newman Chambers files reside on   
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PC.  There is nothing to return you as we informed you pre-
viously that all Newman Chambers files were moved to the 
Newman Share . . . .”); id. at 15 (Clerk of Court explaining 
“we have offered repeatedly to assist you with locating any 
files you cannot find or access.  However, through our many 
conversations, we have yet to learn of any file or record of 
your chambers that is actually missing or unavailable.”); 
id. at 26 (“Please let us know what you cannot locate.  Our 
staff is available and willing to assist you.”).  

Various employees have described the toll that recent 
encounters with Judge Newman have taken on them, in-
cluding by causing them serious anxiety, stress, and dis-
comfort.     Aff. [4] ¶¶ 5, 36 (“   was 
audibly upset and bothered and he said it was due to how 
Judge Newman behaved and treated him.”); id. ¶ 6 (stating 
interactions with Judge Newman caused “emotional stress 
and discomfort, including loss of sleep and heightened anx-
iety”);    Aff. [11] ¶ 8 (“I was left shaken and 
upset from this experience.”);  Aff. [1] ¶ 37 (“The past 
few months have been extremely stressful and have caused 
severe anxiety and emotional distress brought on by Judge 
Newman’s recent behavior towards me.”);  Aff. [9] 
¶ 14 (“[W]orking in [Judge Newman’s] chambers was hurt-
ing my ability to complete my work, taking a toll on my 
mental health, and harming my relationships at the 
court.”);  Aff. [10] ¶¶ 9, 10 (describing   
as “visibly emotional” due to Judge Newman’s behavior 
and having confided “the toll that this entire experience 
was taking on his physical and mental well-being, includ-
ing seeking help from medical professionals”).  Interactions 
with Judge Newman are now so dysfunctional that the 
Clerk of Court has advised staff to attempt to avoid inter-
acting with her in person or, when they must, to bring a co-
worker with them.      Aff. [4] ¶ 6;  Aff. 
[8] ¶ 1;    Aff. [11] ¶ 1.  
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5. The Response Alleges that She Can “Run 
Her Chambers as She Sees Fit” 

Rather than dispute the specific evidence provided by 
staff members, Judge Newman insists that none of it indi-
cates any cause for concern and that short of “obvious red 
lines such as criminal activity or sexual harassment,” she 
“is free to run her chambers as she sees fit”—even if it takes 
a toll on the health of employees.  Response 48.  Judge New-
man’s assertion that it is “entirely appropriate” to refuse to 
participate in the EDR process and “refus[e] to accept” an 
alternative work arrangement under the Court’s EDR 
plan, Response 48 n.38, is simply not consistent with court 
rules or current workplace conduct standards.  And where 
an alternative work arrangement was created specifically 
for the benefit of an employee who had raised concerns 
about abuse and retaliation by Judge Newman, it is espe-
cially inappropriate for Judge Newman to then threaten to 
fire the employee (and tell others that she would have him 
arrested and removed from the building) unless he ignores 
the alternative work arrangement.  Such behavior is not 
reasonably defensible.14  Indeed, it is so far outside the 
norm that, coupled with the other evidence described 
herein, it supports the concern that Judge Newman’s be-
havior may be the result of cognitive impairment.   

 
14 The Response suggests that if Judge Newman 

“treated staff more harshly than was necessary,” it may be 
because of the “Committee’s unjustified actions which have 
taken an enormous toll on Judge Newman.”  Response 53-
54.  But in her August 25, 2023 discussion with Dr. Carney, 
Judge Newman responded to a question about this proceed-
ing’s effects on her mental state: “‘none!  To my amaze-
ment, even in this turmoil-well perhaps that’s the fatal 
flaw—it’s not getting to me.’  She stated her mood remains 
upbeat.”  Ex. 10 (Carney Rep.) at 4.   
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In Adams, the behavior of Judge Adams towards others 
in the courthouse was held sufficient to support an order 
compelling medical examinations for disability as deter-
mined by the special committee.  See In re Complaint of 
Judicial Misconduct, C.C.D. No. 17-01 at 2–10, 16–17, 24–
29, 35–36 (U.S. Jud. Conf. 2017).  So too here.  It is con-
sistent with the Act to conclude that a Judge who remains 
unaware of basic standards of conduct towards employees, 
who demonstrates memory loss, confusion, lack of compre-
hension, and who lashes out at staff with baseless accusa-
tions of theft or hacking, might be impaired by a cognitive 
disability, requiring the Committee-specified medical ex-
aminations as part of a complete investigation. 

We find that the evidence contained in the employee 
affidavits and deposition created a reasonable basis for the 
Committee’s May 16 Order directing medical examinations 
and the specified medical records to ascertain whether 
Judge Newman may have a disability.  And the evidence 
also supports the Order’s request that Judge Newman sit 
for an interview, in which she could enhance the accuracy 
of the proceeding by, among other things, correcting any 
errors in the evidence or aid understanding of its implica-
tions. 

6. The Response Incorrectly Claims Lack of an 
Opportunity to Counter the Employee Alle-
gations 

Judge Newman’s August 31 Response complains for 
the first time that she was never given an opportunity to 
contest the information provided in affidavits in the record.  
Response 39–40.  That assertion is incorrect.  The Commit-
tee detailed much of the evidence in its May 3 Order then 
again in its May 16 Order and its June 1 Order.  And in 
none of her responses did she challenge any of the evidence.  
In its June 1 Order, the Committee recognized that Judge 
Newman might wish to contest the Committee’s recited 
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bases for its Order and for that very reason provided Judge 
Newman all the affidavits and the deposition transcript on 
which the Committee had relied.  June 1 Order at 5.  She 
chose not to challenge them.  Instead, in her July 5 Brief 
she made the choice not to “delv[e] into the minutia[e] of 
these affidavits,” but instead to dismiss them as reflecting 
“petty grievances” and to argue that “even assuming” the 
information in them was true, it “doesn’t even approach 
probable cause to believe that Judge Newman is mentally 
and/or physically disabled.”  July 5 Br. 15.  Other aspects 
of the affidavits she dismissed as “hardly worth responding 
to.”  Id.  Having bypassed the offered opportunity to contest 
the information in the affidavits, Judge Newman cannot 
claim now that she was never given the opportunity to do 
so.15   

To the extent Judge Newman now alleges that the 
Committee did not permit her to include basis-contesting 
(or other) evidence in her July 5 Brief or to request an evi-
dentiary hearing (for example, to cross examine the affi-
ants), she waived those arguments.  In its June 1 Order, 
the Committee explained its tentative view that “[t]here 
are no percipient fact witnesses to additional events that 
are relevant to the misconduct determination” and that 

 
15 In addition, the Committee made clear in its May 16 

Order that it wanted to interview Judge Newman so that 
“she could provide the Committee with information rele-
vant to the Committee’s investigation, including correcting 
any error of fact.”  May 16 Order at 23–24 (emphasis 
added).  Judge Newman refused to take that opportunity 
to contest any information the Committee had gathered.  In 
fact, at the end of the oral argument on July 13, the Com-
mittee offered Judge Newman’s counsel extra time to ad-
dress any topics he wished to, and he declined to use that 
time to challenge the affidavits.  Oral Arg. Tr. at 39:22–
40:6.   
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“the question whether Judge Newman’s responses to the 
Committee’s orders constitute ‘refusing, without good 
cause shown, to cooperate in the investigation,’ Rule 
4(a)(5), can be determined based upon the paper record es-
tablished by the Committee’s orders and Judge Newman’s 
filed responses, along with any legal argument Judge New-
man wishes to submit.”  June 1 Order at 4.  Judge New-
man’s counsel quoted that language and expressly stated: 
“We agree with that assessment.”  June 15 Letter at 3.  If 
Judge Newman wanted to contest the decision not to hold 
an evidentiary hearing and conduct cross examination, she 
had the opportunity to do so, having been provided the ev-
idence no later than June 1.  Judge Newman made no such 
request in her filings on June 15, July 5, July 12, July 24, 
or August 14.  Nor did she make any such request at the 
oral argument conducted on July 13.  In short, Judge New-
man had many chances to challenge the Committee’s evi-
dence and she chose not to do so.  Even now, she makes no 
specific allegations of any error in the many staff accounts 
of deeply troubling interactions, many of which are corrob-
orated by Judge Newman’s emails.  Her claim that she be-
lieved she could not provide contrary evidence is also belied 
by the fact that she did provide new evidence with her July 
5 submission and more new evidence and a declaration 
with her August 31 submission.   

* * * 
The evidence received from court staff, standing alone, 

provides a reasonable basis for the Committee’s May 16 Or-
der concerning medical examinations, medical records, and 
an interview.  Judge Newman had many opportunities and 
never disputed it.   

B. The Evidence of Productivity Deficiencies, 
Even With a Reduced Workload, Supports the 
Committee’s Order 
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In addition to the overwhelming evidence of Judge 
Newman’s troubling interactions with staff, evidence from 
the Clerk’s Office supports our conclusion that the Com-
mittee had a reasonable basis for the ordered medical eval-
uations, records, and interview.  The Clerk’s Office data16 
demonstrate that Judge Newman—despite having a signif-
icantly reduced workload compared to other active judges 
on the Court—takes an extraordinarily long time to pro-
duce opinions.  From October 1, 2020 through September 
30, 2021, Judge Newman authored only 25 opinions (in-
cluding dissents/concurrences), while the average active 
judge authored 44 opinions.  See    Aff. [12] ¶¶ 
10, 12;     Aff. [13] ¶¶ 14, 15.  Judge 
Newman averaged 249 days to author a majority opinion—
more than four times as long as other active judges (61 
days).     Aff. [12] ¶¶ 11, 13. 

Despite reductions in Judge Newman’s workload, this 
trend has continued in recent months.  The court has tried 
to support Judge Newman for years, reducing her work in 
response to concerns about her productivity.  Judge New-
man last participated in motions panels in January 2021.  

    Aff. [13] ¶ 23.  Motions panels are 
a time consuming and required aspect of an active judge’s 
workload.  Active judges participate in 3–4 months of mo-
tions panels each year.  In 2023, there have been approxi-
mately 70 motions resolved by written opinions each 
month.  In 2022, there were an average of 63 motions re-
solved by written opinion each month. R&R 54 n.16.  Judge 

 
16 Judge Newman does not meaningfully dispute the 

Clerk’s Office data, but instead points to analyses of pub-
licly available data purportedly showing Judge Newman’s 
productivity and delay are unexceptional.  For the reasons 
explained in the Committee’s R&R, see R&R 56–58, the 
Council credits the data from the Clerk’s Office.   



IN RE COMPLAINT NO 23-90015 
 
 

39 
 

Newman has not disputed that she acquiesced in the 2021 
reduction in workload by excusing her from the motions 
panel duties.   

Further reduction in her workload occurred from May 
2022 through April 2023—a period in which Judge New-
man sat on half the number of cases as her colleagues (65 
compared to 128 for an average active judge).  Judge New-
man acquiesced in this reduction as well.  There is no evi-
dence that she ever objected to sitting less than her 
colleagues, and her monthly requests were consistently 
worded to indicate she would sit “as needed.”  Ex. 11.   

Despite a substantially reduced workload, from Octo-
ber 2021 through March 2023, Judge Newman authored 
(including dissents/concurrences) less than half the num-
ber of opinions of an average active judge (28 compared to 
61 for an average judge) and her opinions took approxi-
mately four times as long to issue (199 days compared to 
53 days).17  See    Aff. [12] ¶¶ 15, 17;  

   Aff. [13] ¶¶ 17, 18.  She took four times 
as long to write half the opinions while sitting on half the 
number of cases as her colleagues.18 

 
17 Judge Newman was not merely an outlier from the 

average active judge, but from all active judges who sat the 
full period reviewed.  The next closest judge authored 55 
opinions (43 majority and 12 dissents/concurrences) with 
an average time to issuance of 106 days.     

 Aff. [13] ¶ 19.  Thus, the next closest judge wrote 
approximately twice as many opinions in approximately 
half the time. 

18 On March 8, 2023, when the Council unanimously 
voted not to allow new case assignments to Judge Newman 
because of her extraordinary delays, she had 9 majority 
opinions that had been pending for an average of 126 days.  
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The Council finds these data raise a concern that Judge 
Newman is no longer capable of efficiently and effectively 
carrying out the work of an active judge and support the 
Committee’s conclusion that there was a reasonable basis 
to seek medical examinations, medical records, and an in-
terview to determine if these delays are attributable to a 
disability.  See 28 U.S.C. § 351. 
III. The Refusal to Comply with the May 16 Order 

Was Not Excused by Good Cause 
Judge Newman’s refusal to comply with the Commit-

tee’s May 16 Order was not excused by good cause.  Judge 
Newman’s two main arguments are that this JC&D matter 
should be transferred, and she has already provided two 
medical reports.  She also has attacked earlier orders and 
actions by the Chief Judge or Committee as a basis for ex-
cusing non-compliance with the May 16 Order.  We find 
these arguments meritless.  

A. The Request for Transfer Does Not Provide 
Good Cause for The Refusal to Comply with the 
May 16 Order 
Judge Newman has maintained, and continues to 

maintain, that this matter should be transferred to the 

 
On May 25, when Judge Newman asked the Council to re-
consider paneling her for new cases, she still had 7 of those 
9 opinions which had been pending for an average of 163 
days.  As of September 1, 2023, Judge Newman had issued 
4 non-precedential majority decisions, and they took her on 
average 255.5 days each.  She continued to have 3 majority 
opinions in her backlog which averaged 257 days (one of 
which was the oldest case in the court).  In the last six 
months while sitting on zero motions panels, and zero new 
cases, Judge Newman has taken on average 255.5 days to 
write her 4 majority opinions.    
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judicial council of another circuit—and that, barring trans-
fer, she has good cause to refuse to comply with the Com-
mittee’s May 16 Order.  We disagree on all counts.  We 
conclude that the decision not to transfer does not excuse 
Judge Newman’s refusal to comply with the Order and that 
granting Judge Newman’s transfer request19 was never ap-
propriate—and certainly is not at this point. 

Under the rules, transfer is warranted only in “excep-
tional circumstances.”  See Rule 26; Implementation of the 
Judicial Conduct and Disability Act of 1980, Report to the 
Chief Justice of the Judicial Conduct and Disability Act 
Study Committee, 239 F.R.D. 116, 214 (Sept. 2006) (Breyer 
Committee Report) (“Transfers should not be a regular oc-
currence.”).  Judge Newman has not identified (nor do we 
see) exceptional circumstances warranting transfer.  In-
deed, her response to the R&R never once acknowledges 
this demanding standard.   

Judge Newman’s arguments for transfer—by way of 
seeking to justify her refusal to cooperate—generally rely 
on (1) inapplicable authority or (2) unfounded accusations 
of bias.  As explained below, her authority is unpersuasive, 
and her arguments as to bias—essentially, that because 
the judges of this circuit have worked with her, they cannot 
be impartial—if accepted, would convert the relatively rou-
tine into the exceptional, with adverse consequences for the 
policies of the Act and of proper judicial administration 
more generally. 

 
19 Under Rule 26, Judge Newman’s transfer request 

(and the decision not to grant that request) more precisely 
refers to a request that the Chief Judge or Council ask the 
Chief Justice of the United States to transfer.  For simplic-
ity’s sake, and because the distinction is immaterial to our 
discussion, we characterize the request as concerning 
transfer itself.  
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As to authority, while Judge Newman insists that mat-
ters involving a circuit judge that get to the Committee 
stage are always transferred, her examples consist only of 
cases involving isolated alleged instances of past miscon-
duct not related to disability.  Response 73–74.  She gives 
no example—nor are we aware of any—where a case in-
volving disability was transferred.  And for good reason.  
Although an investigation into a discrete incident or set of 
incidents that occurred entirely in the past could poten-
tially be pursued from afar without serious detriment, this 
case, by contrast, involved ongoing behavior that was hav-
ing ongoing effects on the functioning of court staff in the 
court’s building and the functioning of this court.  As a re-
sult, ready access to the Committee was vitally important 
both for ensuring that all relevant information was cap-
tured in the investigation and for providing court staff con-
fidence that they were being heard.  The importance of that 
access is underscored by one of the Breyer Committee Re-
port’s factors counseling against transfer—i.e., “outside 
judges’ relative ignorance of local circumstances and per-
sonalities.”  239 F.R.D. at 215; see R&R 87–88.20     

As to alleged bias, Judge Newman argues that mem-
bers of the Judicial Council have “personal knowledge of 
disputed evidentiary facts concerning the proceeding” and 
are therefore biased—requiring transfer.  See Response 

 
20  As the Committee has observed, the Breyer Commit-

tee Report’s factors counseling against transfer weigh 
against transfer in this case.  See, e.g., May 3 Order at 10–
11; R&R 91 (“For the reasons stated, based on considera-
tions set forth in the Breyer [Committee] Report, we think 
it was proper in this matter not to . . . transfer.”). 
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71–73.21  This argument is unpersuasive on a couple of lev-
els.   

First, this investigation has significantly narrowed—
from originally considering whether Judge Newman suf-
fered from a disability, to now (since June 1, 2023) consid-
ering whether her failure to cooperate constitutes 
misconduct under the rules.  As the R&R explained, it 
would “present a different question if a particular interac-
tion between judges provided the core evidence of sus-
pected disability and that interaction was likely to be a 
subject of dispute at a hearing.”  R&R 73.  But here, “[t]here 
were no personal interactions between Judge Newman and 
other judges that would come up as disputed facts.”  Id.  In-
deed, the only question before the Council is whether to 
adopt the proposal set forth in the R&R. 

Second, Judge Newman’s argument simply proves too 
much.  The argument appears to be that judges on this 
court have views of Judge Newman by virtue of having in-
teracted and worked with her, and that such knowledge 
prevents impartiality and demands transfer.22  See 

 
21 In advancing this argument, Judge Newman quotes 

from 28 U.S.C. § 455, the judicial recusal statute.  Assum-
ing, arguendo, that this statute applies in this context, 
each member of the Council has carefully considered 
whether recusal/disqualification was required under § 455 
and determined that it was not.  Each member of the Coun-
cil likewise carefully considered whether recusal/disquali-
fication was required under Rule 25 and determined that 
it was not. 

22 To the extent that Judge Newman believes that 
judges who attempted unsuccessfully to broker an informal 
resolution with her to avoid these proceedings, March 24 
Order at 5–6, are necessarily biased or must necessarily 
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Response 71–73.  The implication of this argument is that 
circuit judges—who will necessarily interact with their col-
leagues in the same circuit—may not sit on disability pro-
ceedings concerning those colleagues.  This is plainly not 
the case.  To the extent she claims the Judicial Council 
members are biased against her because she dissents more 
than any other judge on the court, she identifies no reason 
why her long practice of dissenting especially often would 
somehow now be the cause for the present inquiry.  Her as-
sertions of bias are grounded in little more than an asser-
tion that her colleagues are biased simply because they 
know and work with her. 

Rule 25 provides particular standards for disqualifica-
tion.  And the commentary to that rule expressly states 
that “a judge is not disqualified simply because the subject 
judge is on the same court” and that bias or prejudice war-
ranting disqualification must be “created by circumstances 
other than an association with the subject judge as a col-
league.”  Rule 25 cmt.  As the R&R explained, by design, 
the statute and rules anticipate that judges will institute, 
investigate, and ultimately decide disability proceedings 
about their colleagues.  See, e.g., 28 U.S.C. §§ 351–353 (re-
quiring chief judge to receive and review complaint and 
form special committee); Rule 11(a) (requiring chief judge 
to review complaint), 12(a) (requiring the special commit-
tee to consist of chief judge that identifies complaint); see 

 
recuse, that is not correct.  It has historically been, and 
should continue to be, the case that when a judge reaches 
the stage where there are concerns about mental fitness, 
the judge’s colleagues step in to try to address the issue in-
formally with the judge (and, sometimes, family and others 
closest to the judge).  Doing so is not only consistent with 
the rules, but entirely appropriate.  If attempting to speak 
with a judge after concerns have arisen necessitated 
recusal, it would stymie the informal resolution process.    
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also R&R 73–74.  Congress and the Judicial Conference 
were certainly aware of § 455, and also of the reality that 
“[j]udges at every level of the system interact with each 
other frequently and in many ways.”  Irving R. Kaufman, 
Chilling Judicial Independence, 88 Yale L.J. 681, 711–12 
(1979) (describing how circuit and district judges, espe-
cially within a single circuit, commonly get to know each 
other).  The way Congress structured the Act and the Judi-
cial Conference structured the rules suggests that both 
bodies concluded that § 455 posed no barrier to judges de-
ciding disability proceedings about their fellow judges, in-
cluding those on the same court.23   

The bases for deciding not to grant Judge Newman’s 
transfer request were, and remain, sound.  These bases—
which easily support the conclusion that this matter does 
not present the requisite “exceptional circumstances”—
were described in the R&R.  See R&R 86–92.  But they are 
worth recounting here, particularly by way of addressing 
Judge Newman’s latest criticisms of those bases. 

At the outset, we note that Judge Newman first sug-
gested transfer of this matter on April 21, 2023.  By that 
point, the Committee had already conducted more than a 
dozen interviews and a deposition, and many troubling 
events were occurring in real time.  Just two days earlier, 
on April 19, two of Judge Newman’s chambers staff came 
unsolicited to the Committee to complain about their 

 
23 We note also that, in 28 U.S.C. § 372(b), Congress 

provided that a majority of the members of a circuit’s judi-
cial council may sign a certificate of disability as to one of 
their fellow circuit judges (the certificate to be presented to 
the President).  This provision is another instance in which 
Congress contemplated, and deemed unproblematic, an as-
sessment by a circuit’s judges as to another judge on their 
circuit. 
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treatment by Judge Newman and to request the court’s as-
sistance in relocating them.  Both indicated that working 
with Judge Newman was taking a toll on their mental 
health, and both requested no further contact with Judge 
Newman.  The Chief Judge, in consultation with the Com-
mittee, was able to relocate both employees, providing 
them real-time relief. 

Indeed, the ongoing nature of Judge Newman’s trou-
bling interactions with staff demonstrates why it was espe-
cially important for this matter not to be transferred to 
another circuit.  Behavior that tended to confirm concerns 
about Judge Newman’s mental state occurred on an almost 
weekly basis during most of the Committee’s investigation.  
Because the Committee consisted of members of this court, 
staff were able to report concerns to the Committee on an 
almost real-time basis, and they did.  That ensured that 
the Committee developed a complete picture of the nature 
of Judge Newman’s behavior as efficiently as possible and 
also reassured staff that they had an immediate avenue for 
presenting concerns raised by Judge Newman’s behavior so 
that they could be addressed in this process.  If the inves-
tigation had been transferred to another court, unknown to 
the staff and less accessible to them, the investigation 
could not have been carried out in the same expeditious 
manner.  Acting expeditiously is one of the Committee’s 
charges, as the Committee explained.  See R&R 87–88; see 
also 28 U.S.C. § 353(c); id. §§ 352(a), 353(a); H.R. Rep. 96-
1313 at 11; May 16 Order at 24; May 22 Order at 2–3.   

Judge Newman disagrees that the Committee’s ability 
to gather information efficiently and timely address em-
ployee concerns was relevant to the transfer decision—or 
indeed, that the information gathered from employees was 
relevant to the Committee’s investigation at all.  See Re-
sponse 100–01.  But we find her disagreement is not well 
reasoned.  For example, as to the relevance to the transfer 
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decision, Judge Newman speculates that if the matter had 
been transferred, nothing would have precluded “forward-
ing memoranda of . . . conversations or affidavits submit-
ted by the staff” to another judicial council.  Id. at 100 
(citing the speed of electronic transmission).  Yet this argu-
ment fails to meaningfully engage with the Committee’s 
observation (which we endorse) that (1) “another court 
could not, from afar, create an environment in which this 
[c]ourt’s staff could raise concerns based on their interac-
tions with Judge Newman in an almost real-time fashion”; 
(2) “without that ready ability to report incidents, . . . im-
portant information in this investigation might have been 
lost”; and (3) “[p]articularly in this case, placing distance 
between the individuals who witness and experience a sub-
ject judge’s behavior and the investigating body would have 
inhibited, not promoted, the aims of the Act.”  R&R 89.  In-
deed, as a factor counseling against transfer, the Breyer 
Committee Report notes that “transfers may increase time 
and expense if there is the need to ship files, arrange wit-
nesses, and handle other matters from a distance.”  239 
F.R.D. at 215. 

As to Judge Newman’s suggestion that concerns ex-
pressed by staff are not relevant to the investigation, we 
think it beyond reasonable dispute that these concerns—as 
to, among other things, memory loss, confusion, and lack of 
comprehension—are relevant as substantiating the Com-
mittee’s order.  Cf. Response 101 (characterizing the per-
ception of Judge Newman’s behavior only as “unnecessarily 
hostile”).  And, to the extent her suggestion of irrelevance 
rests on a belief that the Committee deems her delays in 
resolving cases alone a sufficient basis for its order, see id., 
the Committee has not limited its basis in that fashion.        

In sum, we agree that the decision not to grant Judge 
Newman’s transfer request was sound and are unper-
suaded by her arguments to the contrary. 
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Judge Newman also maintains that we should grant 
her transfer request now.  See Response 104.  We reject 
that request.  Transfer at this point, when the four-month 
investigation involving more than 20 interviews with staff 
is complete, there have been more than a dozen orders, 
Judge Newman has filed at least half a dozen substantive 
letters or briefs, oral argument was conducted, and the 
Committee issued a 111-page R&R with over 300 pages of 
supporting evidence, simply makes no sense.   

Moreover, Judge Newman’s prior representations 
make clear that there is no handing this off to another cir-
cuit to just “wrap it up.”  She has claimed that the process 
was tainted from the outset, that all the employee affida-
vits were effectively coerced, and that a do-over is neces-
sary.  While she has indicated that she may be open to some 
kind of medical examinations if this proceeding is trans-
ferred, see Response 62, she has avoided any suggestion 
that, if the matter were transferred, she would undergo the 
full neuro-psychological testing that was recommended by 
Dr.  and is the subject of the May 16 Order.  In fact, 
Judge Newman says she “will not, under any circum-
stances, submit” to the requests for the medical examina-
tions and medical records made by the Committee “either 
now or in the future.”  Response 105 n.60; id. at 112 n.67 
(indicating a “do-over” would be necessary if another circuit 
determined these proceedings were “marred with impropri-
ety”).  And while she implies (in carefully qualified lan-
guage) that she will undergo “appropriate medical 
examinations,” Response 65 (emphasis added), she has also 
stated that if transferred she intends to open a new nego-
tiation, “including on selecting medical providers and set-
ting the appropriate parameters of any examination,” May 
25 Letter at 3.  She has also pointedly reminded the Com-
mittee that the “effect” of transfer is that “the transferee 
council is not bound by any evidence, reports, or decisions 
made by the transferor council,” and she has expressly 
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“reserve[d] the right to request that the transferee council 
restart the entire process.”  May 10 Letter at 5.  These var-
ious representations belie Judge Newman’s assurance that 
transfer is appropriate because “the only question now is 
the evaluation” of the gathered evidence.  Response 101 
(emphasis in original).  What she describes as “evaluation” 
is, in effect, a do-over. 

Retaining this case also protects court employees by 
permitting the Chief Judge and Council to respond to 
Judge Newman’s ongoing conduct.  The Breyer Committee 
Report notes that the tendency of judges to fall victim to “a 
kind of undue ‘guild favoritism’ through inappropriate 
sympathy with the judge’s point of view or de-emphasis of 
the misconduct problem” in these types of proceedings was 
an important consideration in creating the report.  239 
F.R.D. at 119.  The report embodies this concern in its guid-
ance on transfer considerations by recognizing that judges 
outside the subject judge’s circuit might be “disinclined to 
go through the emotionally draining work of imposing 
tough sanctions on judges not of their own circuit.”  Id. at 
215.  Judge Newman’s conduct, which raises concerns 
about her cognitive state, includes threatening to have em-
ployees arrested, retaliating against employees for report-
ing concerns about Judge Newman, and berating staff 
regarding baseless allegations that she has been deprived 
by them of her computer, files, and secretarial services.  We 
have an obligation to ensure that court employees are free 
from such abuse.  Also important is ensuring that the harm 
to the public (e.g., litigants) is avoided by expeditiously re-
solving this matter.  This conduct continues to have collat-
eral effects on this circuit’s staff and the effective 
administration of court business.  Another circuit is not 
well positioned to hear, assess, and remedy those problems.  
Nor could another circuit handle the resolution as expedi-
tiously as this circuit; that drawback, if this matter were 
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transferred, would further subject court staff to the conduct 
described above. 

Finally, to the extent Judge Newman suggests that the 
decision not to grant her transfer request stems from a de-
sire to “shield” the Committee’s work from review by an-
other tribunal, see Response 101, the suggestion reflects a 
fundamental misunderstanding of this process.  The rules 
already provide for review by the Committee on Judicial 
Conduct and Disability of the Judicial Conference of the 
United States (JC&D Committee) appointed by the Judi-
cial Conference of the United States.  Rule 21.  And they 
ensure that the JC&D Committee, in its review of a matter, 
is independent of the circuit from which the matter arises.  
Rule 21(c) (“Any member of the Committee from the same 
circuit as the subject judge is disqualified from considering or 
voting on a petition for review related to that subject judge.”). 

Accordingly, transfer is not warranted at this time.  For 
the reasons previously articulated, Judge Newman’s re-
quest to transfer is denied without prejudice to refiling af-
ter she has complied with the Committee’s May 16 Order. 

B. The Medical Evidence is Not Good Cause for 
Her Refusal to Comply with the May 16 Order 
The Response argues that two medical reports pro-

vided show that Judge Newman suffers from no disability 
and thus justify (retroactively) her refusal to comply with 
the Committee’s order.  Specifically, it argues that the re-
ports of Dr. Ted Rothstein and Dr. Regina Carney obviate 
the need for the medical examinations and records ordered 
by the Committee and therefore render her refusal to coop-
erate with the order excusable.  We reject this argument 
for several reasons. 

First, it is settled precedent that a subject judge may 
not circumvent the investigation process by submitting 
tests of her own choosing in lieu of those ordered by the 
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Committee.  The holding of the JC&D Committee in the 
Adams case flatly contradicts the suggestion that—by 
simply providing alternative tests from her own provid-
ers—Judge Newman can effectively override the Commit-
tee’s decision that it is necessary to have the examinations, 
including a full neuro-psychological assessment, of Judge 
Newman by independent providers chosen by the Commit-
tee.  See In re Complaint of Judicial Misconduct, C.C.D. 
No. 17-01 (U.S. Jud. Conf. 2017) (Adams).  One of the core 
issues in Adams was whether a judge subject to a disability 
inquiry could refuse to undergo tests ordered by an inves-
tigating committee and administered by providers selected 
by the committee on the ground that the judge preferred 
different tests administered by different providers.  As the 
JC&D Committee explained: “While Judge Adams has ex-
pressed a preference for being evaluated by an expert of his 
choosing and an opportunity to direct to some extent the 
nature of the examination, we conclude that the Special 
Committee and the Judicial Council appropriately exer-
cised their discretion in determining that an examination 
by an independent expert is necessary to ensure accuracy 
and reliability of the procedures and examination results.”  
Id. at 32; see also id. at 36 (“We share the Judicial Council’s 
view that input from an independent medical expert is nec-
essary to fully and fairly assess Judge Adams’s mental con-
dition and fitness to continue to serve as a judge.”).  Here, 
Judge Newman’s counsel admitted that (her first exam-
iner) Dr. Rothstein had a long-time personal relationship 
with Judge Newman,24 and counsel also has stated that he 
was classmates in medical school with (the second exam-
iner) Dr. Carney,25 who was flown from Florida to 

 
24 Oral Arg. Tr. at 38:18–24. 
25 Ryan Davis, 2nd Doc to Evaluate Judge Newman Says 

She’s Fit to Serve, Law360 (Sept. 7, 2023), available at 
https://www.law360.com/ip/articles/1718953/2nd-doc-to-
evaluate-judge-newman-says-she-s-fit-to-serve. 

https://www.law360.com/ip/articles/1718953/2nd-doc-to-evaluate-judge-newman-says-she-s-fit-to-serve
https://www.law360.com/ip/articles/1718953/2nd-doc-to-evaluate-judge-newman-says-she-s-fit-to-serve
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Washington, D.C., to interview Judge Newman and per-
form the 11-minute cognitive test featured in the resulting 
report. 

Adams makes it clear that it is misconduct for a subject 
judge to refuse to comply with an order from a special com-
mittee for medical examinations on the ground that the 
judge would prefer different tests administered by different 
providers.  We continue to believe that it is important that 
independent medical practitioners be selected to perform 
the medical examinations.  Insisting upon an examination 
by an independent provider “is necessary to ensure accu-
racy and reliability of the procedures and examination re-
sults.”  Adams at 32.  The rule from Adams serves an 
important interest: ensuring that what may well be the 
most critical piece of the investigation—medical evalua-
tions designed to ascertain whether the subject judge suf-
fers from a disability impairing the ability to effectively 
discharge the duties of office—are as accurate and reliable 
as possible.   

Second, the two reports Judge Newman has proffered 
are not remotely substitutes for what the May 16 Order di-
rects, including the specified full neuro-psychological ex-
amination (and medical records).  Neither the 10-minute 
partial MOCA nor the 11-minute 3MS are substitutes for 
the ordered full neuro-psychological examination (six 
hours) that Dr.  advised was both necessary and 
that has been done in previous judicial disability inquiries.  
Nothing submitted by Judge Newman provides any ade-
quate explanation for how the radically different, lesser ex-
aminations reflected in Dr. Rothstein’s and Dr. Carney’s 
reports are appropriate substitutes for the much more ex-
tensive examinations required by the May 16 Order.  Given 
the demanding nature of an active judge’s job, it would be 
surprising if there were any sound basis for any such equa-
tion.  There is nothing remotely adequate offered here. 
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1. Dr. Rothstein’s Report 
The Rothstein report relies on the Montreal Cognitive 

Assessment (MOCA), a screening test that takes only about 
10 minutes to administer.  See Rothstein Rep. (Ex. 12), 13 
(MOCA test).  The R&R pointed out flaws on the face of the 
report that made the Rothstein report unreliable.  And the 
new declaration from Dr. Rothstein, submitted to the 
Council with Judge Newman’s August 31 Response, actu-
ally confirms the problems with his original report identi-
fied in the R&R.  See Rothstein Decl. (Ex. 12).  

The full MOCA provides a total of 30 possible points.  
See R&R 100–102; Ex. 13.  Dr. Rothstein noted that Judge 
Newman was unable to write (due to a broken wrist) and 
thus could not complete portions of the test worth 2 points 
and that she missed four points (4 of the 5 memory ques-
tions), which led him to report a score of 24 out of 28.  As 
the R&R explained, however, if Judge Newman could not 
write, she also could not have completed another portion of 
the test (drawing a clock) worth 3 points and thus Dr. Roth-
stein inaccurately scored her test.  See R&R 102.  Dr. Roth-
stein’s new declaration confirms that Judge Newman could 
not draw a clock.  Rothstein Decl. ¶ 11.  Therefore, he erred 
in crediting her with the 3 points related to the clock.  Dr. 
Rothstein does not dispute that if the 3 points attributable 
to drawing the clock are properly taken out of Judge New-
man’s score, she actually scored a 21 out of 25.  According 
to the MOCA website this translates to a scaled score of 25 
out of 30, which is below the normal range.  R&R 102–03, 
available at https://mocacognition.com/faq/ (last visited 
September 17, 2023).  Though that analysis was detailed 
in the R&R, Dr. Rothstein’s new declaration does not dis-
pute the conclusion about the proper score.   

Dr. Rothstein’s new declaration also confirms another 
problem with his earlier submission.  He admits that he did 
not review any of Judge Newman’s medical records before 

https://mocacognition.com/faq/


IN RE COMPLAINT NO 23-90015 
 
 

54 
 

forming his opinion but relied on her oral reports.  Roth-
stein Decl. ¶ 9.    

2. Dr. Carney’s Report 
The report from Dr. Regina Carney submitted with the 

Response was based on an interview with Judge Newman, 
a review of some medical records (it is not clear how com-
plete the reviewed records were) and some information 
about a judge’s job (it is not clear what), and administration 
of a Modified Mini-Mental State Exam (3MS).  Dr. Carney 
reports that it took Judge Newman 11 minutes to complete 
the test.  Carney Rep. at 5.  The test consists of 34 questions 
that require the subject to answer such queries as “Can you 
touch your nose,” “Who is the president of the United 
States,” to count from 1 to 5 in forward and reverse, and to 
recall three words throughout the course of the approxi-
mately 10-minute examination.  See Carney Rep. Ex. 1.  Ac-
cording to the creators of the test, the 3MS was not 
designed “as a screening tool for dementia” and “many of 
the items in the . . . 3MS are not sensitive for detecting 
dementia in its early stage.”  Evelyn Teng & Helena Chui, 
Manual for the Administration of the Modified Mini-Men-
tal State (3MS) Test (1996) at 2 (3MS Manual); see also Lei 
Feng et al., The Modified Mini-Mental State Examination 
test: Normative Data for Singapore Chinese Older Adults 
and Its Performance in Detecting Early Cognitive Impair-
ment, 53 Singapore Med. J. 458 (2012) (concluding the 3MS 
“has limited value in detecting early cognitive impairment; 
tests with better performance should be considered in clin-
ical practice.”).  According to the 3MS Manual, this test is 
better suited to “monitoring the progression of dementia to 
its middle and late stages.”  Ex. 2 at 2.   

3. Inadequacy for the Disability at Issue  
Besides the just-identified problems, we do not see the 

two reports as adequate substitutes for compliance with 
the May 16 Order because they do not come close to 
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persuasively taking account of the actual requirements of 
the job at issue.  To effectively discharge the duties of an 
active circuit judge requires far more than the basic abili-
ties tested by the MOCA and 3MS.  The job of an active 
judge involves a heavy workload of cases many of which 
involve complex records, technical or otherwise specialized 
facts, application of law to fact and often novel legal issues.  
“It is axiomatic that the work of a lifetime appointed fed-
eral judge is demanding and requires the highest degree of 
functionality.”  Adams at 29.  In a typical month, an active 
Federal Circuit judge is assigned to three to four panels, 
each panel consisting of four argued cases and two cases 
submitted on the briefs, for a total of 18 to 24 cases per 
month.  And all of these cases are heard in a single week.  
Each can involve extensive briefing and even more record 
material that the judge must review, comprehend, and an-
alyze to resolve often-numerous disputes about often-com-
plex and specialized factual and legal issues.  The 
concentration and memory required is a league apart from 
the ability to recall simple “everyone knows” facts and a 
handful of words, and the stamina required is beyond that 
tested by the MOCA (10 minutes) or 3MS (11 minutes).  For 
each panel, a judge hears two consecutive hours of oral ar-
gument (four cases with argument lasting 30 minutes).  
Thus, a Federal Circuit judge needs to be able to distin-
guish between and decide 18 to 24 cases, 12 to 16 of which 
are argued in a single week.   

This Court has the difficult and unenviable task of as-
certaining whether Judge Newman suffers from a disabil-
ity rendering her “unable to discharge the duties of [her] 
particular judicial office.”  Rule 4(c) (emphasis added).  We 
find that neither Dr. Rothstein’s report nor Dr. Carney’s 
report permits the Judicial Council to make that determi-
nation.  Judge Newman has not established that these re-
ports are adequate substitutes for the medical 
examinations and medical records required (and interview 
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requested) by the May 16 Order.  In particular, given the 
nature and demands of the job as an active judge, and the 
large body of evidence demonstrating Judge Newman’s po-
tential cognitive problems, the full neuro-psychological 
battery of tests required by the May 16 Order is necessary.  
The Council concludes that neither Dr. Rothstein’s nor Dr. 
Carney’s reports provide retroactive good cause for Judge 
Newman’s refusal to comply with the Committee’s order. 

C. The Criticisms of Earlier Orders and Actions 
Do Not Undermine the Duty to Comply with the 
May 16 Order 

 Judge Newman’s Response has sought to establish 
good cause for non-compliance with the May 16 Order by 
attacking earlier orders and actions and trying to construct 
a general picture of a hostile, bad-faith course of action, rid-
dled with improprieties, by the Chief Judge and the other 
members of the Special Committee.  This attack on how the 
three judges carried out their difficult statutory obligations 
is unwarranted and does not undermine the amply sup-
ported May 16 Order.  The Council itself unanimously took 
some of the complained-of steps, e.g., the suspension of new 
case assignments.  And it has scrutinized all the Response’s 
particular assertions about and characterizations of events 
out of which the Response creates its accusatory portrait.  
After thorough consideration and review of the record, we 
conclude that the assertions and characterizations are in-
correct and unfounded and that the overall portrait wholly 
lacks merit.  We see nothing in the Chief Judge’s and Com-
mittee’s course of action but good faith execution of a diffi-
cult, statutorily assigned task.  We thus reject the 
Response’s pervasive attempt to establish good cause for 
non-compliance with the May 16 Order by focusing on 
other orders and actions. 
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 We divide our discussion of the Response-raised mat-
ters separate from the May 16 Order into two sections.  We 
first address the Response’s effort to undermine the May 
16 Order by criticizing certain aspects of the Chief Judge’s 
March 24 Order (identifying a complaint) and the Commit-
tee’s April 7 Order (the first medical-examination order).  
We then address the assortment of other attacks on how 
the Chief Judge and Committee proceeded. 

1.  The Criticisms of the March 24 and April 7 
Orders Do Not Undermine the May 16 Order 

The Response seeks to undermine the duty to comply 
with the May 16 Order by focusing on asserted flaws in two 
earlier orders—the March 24 Order identifying the com-
plaint and the April 7 Order that first required medical ex-
aminations.  The core argument is that (a) these orders 
were critically dependent on statements that Judge New-
man suffered a “heart attack” and underwent coronary 
stent surgery in 2021 and had a “faint[ing]” episode in 2022  
and these statements are unsupported (even “fabricated”) 
and (b) everything that followed must as a consequence be 
thrown out as illegitimate.  Response 6, 41–43.  This con-
tention is incorrect in both its premises and in its conclu-
sion about the implication for the present matter of non-
compliance with the May 16 Order. 

The premises of the Response’s argument regarding 
the March 24 Order are defective for multiple reasons.  
First, the Response is flawed regarding the existence of the 
episodes at issue.  As to a 2022 “faint[ing]” episode, there 
is evidence of just such an occurrence.    saw 
Judge Newman in 2022 being assisted back to chambers 
and was told in Judge Newman’s presence that she had just 
fainted and could not walk without assistance.  See  
Aff. [1] ¶ 6.  As to a “heart attack,” the Committee quickly 
recognized that “heart attack” was too specific a term if 
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understood to refer to a myocardial infarction, and it 
sought information about the broader category of “cardiac 
event.”  See, e.g., May 16 Order at 4–5; R&R 81–82    

 affidavit states that Judge Newman had a cardiac 
condition and “at least one cardiac-related procedure.”  

 Aff. [1] ¶ 9.  When asked at oral argument before 
the Committee about whether Judge Newman had experi-
enced a cardiac event and was hospitalized for it in 2021 
and/or 2022, her counsel refused to say.  Oral Arg. Tr. 
17:23-18:5; 18:22-19:4; 20:11-19; R&R 82.  The record thus 
does not refute the assertion of a 2022 fainting episode or 
the existence of a 2021 cardiac event serious enough to re-
quire a visit to the hospital or insertion of a stent or other 
treatment.  Judge Newman presented medical evidence in 
both her July 5 and her August 31 submissions, yet she re-
fused to submit any medical evidence from her cardiologist 
or pulmonologist regarding her cardiac events and proce-
dures.  She refused twice to interview with the Committee 
where she could have clarified these facts and chose not to 
submit her own declaration on these points.   

Second, the Response is also critically wrong about the 
role of these two recited incidents in the March 24 Order.  
The two physical episodes at issue were merely possible 
causes of the symptoms, such as memory, confusion, and 
stamina problems, that were the basis for the March 24 Or-
der.  The points Judge Newman focuses on were mentioned 
on the first page of the order as historical background to 
explain why Judge Newman was, with her acquiescence, 
operating under a reduced caseload—a fact that (at least 
as of 2022) is undisputed and borne out by data from the 
Clerk’s Office.  But the March 24 Order did not rely on the 
heart attack (or surgery) or fainting as the basis for identi-
fying a complaint.  To the contrary, the Order set out infor-
mation about Judge Newman’s behavior (including 
“allegations that Judge Newman has exhibited 
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inappropriate behavior in managing staff” and staff con-
cerns about, e.g., her memory, confusion, and focus), noted 
that Judge Newman had agreed to forgo motions-panel 
participation and acquiesced in a greatly reduced work-
load, and laid out data from the Clerk’s Office showing 
striking deficiencies in processing cases even with a dimin-
ished workload.  Whether there were particular physical 
causes of the symptoms, reflected in particular cardiac or 
fainting episodes at particular times, was not critical to the 
basis for the identification of the complaint, though such 
causes could ultimately be relevant to determining the na-
ture, extent, and duration of any disabilities. 

The Response’s criticism of the April 7 Order, which 
was the first Committee order to require medical examina-
tions, is defective for at least the same reasons.  The Re-
sponse asserts that the Committee lacked a reasonable 
basis for the April 7 Order, but the core argument is that 
the order, which referred to the March 24 Order and did 
not further discuss the basis for concern about disability, 
was infected by the same error regarding a “heart attack” 
as the March 24 Order.  Response 36–37 (stating that “ab-
sent these allegations, the Committee was left with noth-
ing at all” on which to base its order for medical 
examinations).  But as explained, that assertion incorrectly 
assigns the dispute about a “heart attack” a role contrary 
to its actual role regarding the issue of disability. 

In asserting that the Committee had no other basis for 
its April 7 Order, the Response states that, as of April 7, 
the “Committee had yet to speak to any of Judge Newman’s 
staff.”  Response 8.  That is wrong.  The March 24 Order 
makes clear on its face that, even before that Order was 
entered, one of Judge Newman’s chambers staff had re-
ported troubling conduct by Judge Newman.  The R&R fur-
ther explains that, after the Committee was appointed on 
March 24, the Committee “immediately undertook 
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interviews with court staff to gather relevant information.”  
R&R 12 (emphasis added). And it is apparent from the se-
quence of the Committee’s orders that much of the infor-
mation ultimately memorialized in the form of affidavits 
had been provided to the Committee in interviews long be-
fore the affidavits were executed.  In addition, as the April 
7 Order makes clear, the Committee had already engaged 
a consulting expert (Dr. ) and relayed information 
to him, and he had found the information sufficient to call 
for the medical examinations the Committee was ordering.  
April 7 Order at 1–2.  The April 7 Order also provided Dr. 

s contact information so that Judge Newman or her 
representatives could ask him directly about the examina-
tions and the selected providers.  Judge Newman’s sugges-
tion that the Order was based on “nothing” but the 
disputed “heart attack” event is contrary to the record.  

In any event, even if there was some error in the March 
24 and April 7 Orders regarding the factual points on 
which the Response focuses, it is entirely proper to require 
compliance with the May 16 Order, where, as shown above, 
there are ample bases for this later-issued order independ-
ent of any such errors.  An investigation is launched on in-
itial information, the point of the investigation is to 
uncover the truth, and the facts uncovered may be different 
from some of the initial allegations that first raised con-
cerns, but they may be equally or even more supportive of 
the concerns.  That is just what happened here regarding 
concerns about disability.   

We note that the Committee did not recommend, and 
the Council is not considering, a misconduct charge based 
on refusal to comply with the April 7 Order.  Instead, the 
Committee provided further explanations to Judge New-
man in response to her objections, presented further infor-
mation discovered in the investigation, and entered new 
orders that were based on a fuller record and set out 
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additional information in support, both regarding the med-
ical examinations and medical records.  It is the last of 
those new orders, the May 16 Order, that is the subject of 
the Committee’s recommendation and is now before this 
Council. 

Thus, after issuing an April 17 Order regarding medi-
cal records, the Committee entered an order on May 3 that 
detailed over several pages its reasonable basis for requir-
ing medical examinations and certain medical records, 
which included the staff concerns of memory loss, confu-
sion, lack of focus, inability to understand and execute sim-
ple tasks that she had previously been able to perform, and 
agitation, paranoia, and hostile behavior.  May 3 Order at 
3–9.  Several staff indicated that the dysfunctional behav-
iors began over the past 1-2 years and had increased in fre-
quency.  By the time of the May 3 Order, Judge Newman 
had been provided a detailed account, based on information 
from the investigation, of the Committee’s basis for order-
ing medical examinations and medical records.   

Even the May 3 Order is not the one now at issue.  The 
Committee received objections from Judge Newman’s coun-
sel, including that the requested medical examinations 
were of unknown scope or duration and that there were no 
defined limits on how the results would be used.  May 10 
Letter at 4.  The Committee issued its May 16 Order to re-
spond to those objections and include even more detail 
about the reasonable basis for the testing (and also further 
defined the required medical records and directed that they 
be supplied to the neurologist, not to the Committee). 

The operative May 16 Order—and whether the Com-
mittee had established a reasonable basis for that order—
is all that is material for evaluating the current issue of 
misconduct.  Whether the record was sufficient at some 
earlier stage in the process does not determine the issue 
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before the Council concerning a new, later order.  Even in 
administrative law, when a new order supersedes an ear-
lier order and only the prospective demands of the new or-
der are at issue, the agency, to support the new order, 
generally is “not limited to its prior reasons.”  Department 
of Homeland Security v. Regents of the University of Cali-
fornia, 140 S. Ct. 1891, 1907–08 (2020); see also Biden v. 
Texas, 142 S. Ct. 2528, 2544 (2022) (same).  All the more so 
for an investigation, which, in the ordinary course of pur-
suing its aim of uncovering the truth, will lead to changes 
in the investigators’ actions according to changing infor-
mation.  That aspect of an investigation is particularly im-
portant for a disability investigation, in which a complaint 
can be expected to set out reasons for concern about present 
continuing abilities, rather than specific past-conduct 
“charges” to be proved in ordinary misconduct proceedings.  
Here, the “misconduct” is the stymieing of an underlying 
disability inquiry.  

If the approach suggested in the Response were correct, 
then if a special investigating committee under the Act 
ever acted too swiftly in ordering some investigative step, 
but responded to objections, developed further information, 
and then reissued its order based on a more developed rec-
ord, the later order would somehow still be measured 
against the more limited record available at an earlier 
time.  That cannot be the rule.  Responding to objections 
from a subject judge and establishing additional infor-
mation justifying investigative steps are exactly what spe-
cial investigating committees should do. 

2.  The Criticisms of Other Actions by the Chief 
Judge or Special Committee Leading to and in 
the Investigation Do Not Undermine the Duty 
to Comply with the May 16 Order   
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 The Response seeks to call into question the duty to 
comply with the May 16 Order by attacking an assortment 
of actions by the Chief Judge or the Committee to paint a 
picture of hostility or bad faith.  The Council rejects these 
attacks and the whole picture. 
 a.  The Response claims that Judge Newman was not 
given the Rule 11(f) notice and opportunity to respond to 
the Complaint the Chief Judge was proposing to identify 
and that “had such an opportunity been provided, the 
March 24 Order could have avoided the factual errors, and 
there would be no predicate for the investigation in the first 
place.”  Response 90.  But as the attached emails demon-
strate, the Chief Judge did provide the proposed Complaint 
to Judge Newman on March 17 (a week before it was even-
tually filed), asked her to review it, and offered to meet 
with Judge Newman to discuss it.  Ex. 1.  Judge Newman 
refused.  The accusation of denial of notice and opportunity 
to respond is false. 

b.  More generally, we find that the email communica-
tions between the Chief Judge and Judge Newman during 
the period March 9 through March 24 refute the Response’s 
accusation of hostility.  They paint a picture of a Chief 
Judge trying in a respectful manner to meet with Judge 
Newman to discuss the troubling concerns that had been 
raised.  They reveal admiration of Judge Newman and con-
cern for her legacy.  They show a good faith effort by the 
Chief Judge to pursue the judiciary’s customary means of 
engaging in informal discussions when concerns about a 
relevant disability arise and become so strong that it is no 
longer responsible to avoid the difficult topic of whether the 
judge at issue should step back from the job.   

In early March 2023, the information about disability 
concerns was at the point where identifying a complaint to 
launch an investigation under Rule 5 was called for in 
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order to fulfill the clear purposes of the JC&D Act—unless 
the disability concerns were dispelled or made moot by a 
voluntary resolution.  Judge Newman’s refusal of engage-
ment made the launch of the formal proceeding unavoida-
ble.  The Chief Judge’s communications with Judge 
Newman show no hostility or bad faith.  They reflect good 
faith, and human sympathy in fulfilling a sad, painful re-
sponsibility. 

c.  The Response asserts that, in a slightly earlier con-
versation in March 2023, the Chief Judge told Judge New-
man that taking senior status was “non-negotiable.”  
Response 4; id. at 84.  The Response itself puts quotation 
marks around the term but cites no source, so it appears 
not to be reporting a word used but instead to be charac-
terizing what Judge Newman felt, or recalls, was being 
conveyed.  Regardless, for the Council’s decision, it is un-
necessary to establish whether the word was used or even 
whether the thought was conveyed.  Even if so, there would 
be no bad faith in indicating that the disability concerns 
were so serious that taking senior status was the minimum 
needed to avoid an investigation.  Such a statement does 
not prejudge the results of the investigation.  
 d.  The Response attacks a decision by the Chief Judge 
made in February 2023, before the events of March 2023 
precipitated the current proceeding.  Over three pages, the 
Response argues that it was improper for the Chief Judge, 
in February, to not calendar Judge Newman for the April 
sitting because of the Federal Circuit rule (Clerical Proce-
dure # 3 ¶ 15) that a judge should not be assigned to a new 
sitting when the judge has a backlog of assigned opinions 
not circulated within a specified period.  Response 80–83.  
The Response’s argument is about one of the backlog cases, 
which was undeniably very old and had been submitted on 
the briefs without oral argument and therefore was as-
signed to Judge Newman (by herself) some weeks before 
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the date it appeared on the court’s calendar.  The Response 
prefers to start the count for the Clerical Procedure period, 
not from the date of assignment, but from the later calen-
dar date; but starting the count with the actual assignment 
is obviously reasonable, not at all suggestive of bad faith.  
Decisively, moreover, Judge Newman’s judicial assistant 
had emailed the Chief Judge in February to state that it 
looked like sitting in April was barred by the Clerical Pro-
cedure.  Ex. 11.  The Chief Judge followed the view commu-
nicated by Judge Newman’s chambers.  When the April-
sitting assignments were sent to all judges in mid-Febru-
ary, it was immediately apparent that Judge Newman was 
not being assigned to sit.  Yet Judge Newman never ob-
jected—just as she never objected when, in early 2021, she 
stopped being put on motions panels (a regular active 
judge’s duty) or when, around the start of 2022, her panel 
assignments were substantially reduced in number.  There 
is no basis for finding bad faith in the Chief Judge’s Febru-
ary 2023 assignment decision. 

e.  The Response suggests that hostility or bad faith is 
evinced in the Committee’s partial denial of an extension 
request during the investigation.  When the Committee is-
sued its May 16 Order, it set a deadline of May 23 for Judge 
Newman to respond—not for her to undergo the examina-
tions or supply the records or sit for the interview.  It ex-
plained the statutory bases for expedition, May 16 Order 
at 24; see 28 U.S.C. § 353(c) (expedition directive for Special 
Committee); id. § 352(a) (expedition directive for Chief 
Judge in initial review); id. § 353(a) (promptness directive 
for Chief Judge to appoint Special Committee); H.R. Rep. 
96-1313 at 11, and it noted the difficulty of arranging ap-
pointments with examiners.  May 16 Order at 25.  On May 
20, Judge Newman’s counsel asked for a 16-day extension, 
explaining that he had flown to Israel on May 16 for “family 
functions,” including “a traditional Jewish baby-naming 
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ceremony.”  Dolin May 20 Letter.  The Committee extended 
the deadline to May 26, noting the importance of expedition 
and that this was the third order concerning medical exam-
inations.  May 22 Order at 1–4.  Judge Newman’s counsel 
met the deadline with a three-page response, filed May 25, 
refusing compliance with the May 16 Order. 

The Response now observes that May 26 was “a major 
Jewish festival of Shavuot (‘Festival of Weeks’),” evidently 
suggesting insensitivity on the Committee’s part.   Re-
sponse 18 n.15.  But the Response’s suggestion of insensi-
tivity is baseless.  The extension request made no mention 
of the holiday, which was unknown to the Committee.  The 
Committee’s partial denial of the extension properly served 
the statutory expedition policy and is not evidence of hos-
tility or bad faith. 

f.  The Response points to the July 13 oral argument 
(hearing) and declares: “It should not go unsaid that the 
hearing was conducted in an extraordinarily and uniquely 
hostile fashion.  None of the attorneys appearing at the 
hearing has ever before experienced such a level of hostility 
and disrespect from any judge at any level of the judiciary.”  
Response 20 n.16.  The Council has read the transcript of 
the hearing and/or listened to the audio recording.  Exs. 14, 
15.  We conclude that this accusation is baseless.  Pressing 
for focus on the matters viewed by the bench as of likely 
importance, and for answers actually responsive to the 
bench’s questions, is not reflective of hostility or disrespect, 
but of the proper effort to advance understanding during 
the limited time counsel has available.  The Response’s ac-
cusation on this point is completely meritless, as well as 
inappropriate. 

g.  Judge Newman claims that when her staff asked to 
reschedule interviews, the Committee refused.  Response 
10.  But only one of Judge Newman’s staff asked to 
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reschedule, and the Committee agreed to reschedule to the 
day he chose.  See Ex. 16.   

h.  The Response complains that the Committee sub-
poenaed Judge Newman’s career clerk to appear for a for-
mal deposition within 48 hours, with “no reason to believe 
the career clerk would decline a simple request for an in-
terview.”  Response 96.  But the timing reflected the proper 
effort to follow the statutory policy of expedition.  And the 
Committee had reason for the formality.  Even before the 
career clerk’s broad refusal to answer questions at the dep-
osition, the Committee reasonably doubted the career 
clerk’s likely cooperation with the present inquiry, as the 
career clerk had just been non-cooperative with EDR in-
quiries.  See  Aff. [10] ¶¶ 1–4.  Moreover, the Coun-
cil sees nothing improper about the Committee’s 
questioning at the deposition when the career clerk repeat-
edly asserted the privilege against self-incrimination to re-
fuse to provide almost any information.   

i.  The Response suggests bad faith or hostility in the 
Committee’s response to a request for Clerk’s Office data 
in mid-August, after issuance of the R&R.  Response 92–
94.  We find that the Committee had ample reasons for re-
fusing the request—that it was untimely, waived, and un-
justified by any concrete showing of problems in the 
already-furnished data that would be material to the spe-
cific issue presented, namely, whether the May 16 Order 
was justified and non-compliance with it constituted mis-
conduct.  The Council sees no bad faith or hostility in that 
ruling. 

* * * 
 In short, the Council sees no merit in the picture 
painted by the Response of bad faith or hostility by the 
Chief Judge or the Committee.  That picture is therefore a 
diversion from the proper inquiry, namely, the basis for the 
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May 16 Order itself and the importance of complying with 
it under the Act and Rules. 
IV. The Refusal to Comply with the May 16 Order 

Constituted Serious Misconduct 
Judge Newman committed misconduct by refusing to 

comply with the May 16 Order for medical examinations, 
medical records, and an interview, and her refusal to com-
ply constituted serious misconduct.  Rule 4(a)(5) expressly 
provides that “[c]ognizable misconduct includes refusing, 
without good cause shown, to cooperate in the investigation 
of a complaint.”  Judge Newman’s refusal to cooperate was 
a serious matter because it prevented the Committee from 
being able to fulfill its assigned task under the Act—
namely, making an informed assessment (and recommen-
dation for the Judicial Council) about whether Judge New-
man suffers from a disability.  

That is a serious matter because it prevented the 
proper functioning of the self-policing mechanism that 
Congress established to ensure that the judiciary would ef-
fectively have authority to keep its own house in order.  As 
relevant here, the Act creates a mechanism, important in a 
system that provides judges life tenure to ensure independ-
ence, to address the unfortunate reality that some judges 
may become unfit to perform the duties of their office.  The 
Act gives the judiciary the responsibility for regulating it-
self in that regard through investigations such as this.  Ac-
cordingly, all judges have an obligation to cooperate with 
proceedings under the Act to ensure that self-policing by 
the judiciary can function properly.  Refusing to cooperate 
without adequate justification—as Judge Newman has 
done here—brings the statutory mechanism for addressing 
disability to a grinding halt and thereby undermines the 
interests of litigants, employees, the public, and the judici-
ary in having that mechanism work.   
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V. The Renewable One-Year Suspension from New 
Cases is an Appropriate Sanction     
We find that Judge Newman’s assertion that a one-

year suspension from case assignments would be too severe 
a sanction is misplaced.  As explained in the R&R, the sanc-
tion must be sufficient to convey the seriousness of miscon-
duct that has prevented the proper functioning of the self-
policing mechanism Congress created for the judiciary.  
And the renewable character, if circumstances continue to 
justify the suspension, is essential to the purpose: to put 
the Act process back in motion rather than leave it 
thwarted in the face of reasonable concerns about disabil-
ity. 

Judge Newman’s arguments concerning Adams also 
draw the wrong lessons from that case.  See Response 106.  
It is true that, upon remand from the JC&D Committee, 
the special committee in Adams recommended only a six-
month suspension based on Judge Adams’ misconduct in 
refusing to comply with orders for medical examinations.  
There, however, the JC&D Committee had just vacated the 
original sanction imposed by the Sixth Circuit Judicial 
Council because the council did not have any basis for find-
ing that the concerns about a disability in that case affected 
Judge Adams’ “capability of discharging his adjudicative 
responsibilities,” and instead were “limited to Judge Ad-
ams’s conduct in the context of the court’s internal admin-
istrative responsibilities.”  Adams at 37.  Here, in contrast, 
the evidence developed by the Committee calls into ques-
tion Judge Newman’s ability to carry out the case-deciding 
function at the level and with the timeliness required of an 
active judge.  The concerns about disability are not, as in 
Adams, wholly unconnected to Judge Newman’s role in de-
ciding cases.  To the contrary, the evidence shows that pan-
eling Judge Newman on cases without getting to the 
bottom of her potential disability will have a direct and del-
eterious effect on the efficient administration of the 
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business of the Court.  In addition, in Adams, the Sixth 
Circuit Judicial Council had originally decided that Judge 
Adams’ misconduct (which included both refusing to com-
ply with an order for medical examinations and a particu-
lar incident with a show cause order) warranted a 
suspension from new cases for two years and the reassign-
ment of his entire docket of pending cases.  See Order of 
June 27, 2018, at 2, In re Complaint of Judicial Miscon-
duct, No. 06-13-90009 (Sixth Circuit Judicial Council).  
Given the different nature of the disability concerns raised 
in this case, and the extensive evidence showing their di-
rect connection to Judge Newman’s “adjudicative responsi-
bilities,” we conclude that a one-year suspension—in 
between the original two-year sanction and the later rec-
ommended six-month sanction in Adams—is warranted.  

To the extent Judge Newman points to the length of 
suspensions issued in other misconduct cases, those deci-
sions are less relevant comparators.  They involved sanc-
tions as punishment for misconduct such as harassment 
and unwanted physical advances (or crimes such as perjury 
or allowing counsel to make false factual assertions in the 
proceeding itself).  Those matters do not provide a relevant 
benchmark for a case such as this involving (i) a suspected 
disability that directly affects a judge’s adjudicative re-
sponsibilities and (ii) thwarting the process for fulfilling 
the duty to get to the bottom of (and address) the suspected 
disability.  

Judge Newman is also incorrect in arguing that the 
Council lacks authority to suspend her from sitting on 
cases en banc.  See Response 113.  Section 354(a)(1)(C) of 
the Act says that the Council “shall take such action as is 
appropriate to assure the effective and expeditious admin-
istration of the business of the courts within the circuit,” 
and section 354(a)(2)(A)(i) gives one example in “may” lan-
guage that does not exhaust the scope of the broader 
“shall”: the Council may order that “no further cases be 
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assigned” to a judge who has committed misconduct or who 
has been found to suffer a disability.  28 U.S.C. § 
354(a)(1)(C), (a)(2)(A)(i).  The provisions authorize the ju-
dicial council (even obligate it where appropriate to ensure 
effective and expeditious judicial administration) to sus-
pend the judge from hearing cases of any sort.  The general 
directive in 28 U.S.C. § 46(c) that the court en banc “shall 
consist of all circuit judges in regular active service” cannot 
trump that more specific authority and obligation granted 
to the Council for addressing situations of misconduct or 
disability.  See generally, e.g., Corley v. U.S., 556 U.S. 303, 
316 (2009) (noting that “a more specific statute will be 
given precedence over a more general one”).  Judge New-
man can, at any time, end this suspension, by complying 
with the May 16 Order and allowing the Committee to com-
plete its investigation.   

* * * 
The Council has considered all of Judge Newman’s re-

maining arguments and find them to be without merit.26   
Unanimous Judicial Council Order 

The Judicial Council has unanimously determined, 
based on the Committee’s R&R and underlying evidence, 
that there is an adequate basis for deciding whether Judge 
Newman’s refusal to cooperate with the Committee’s order 
for medical evaluations, medical records, and an interview 
constitutes sanctionable misconduct.  See Rule 20.  After 
due consideration of these materials, the Judicial Council 
FINDS: 

 
26 The Council sees no need for oral argument in this 

matter.  Pursuant to Rule 20(a) Judge Newman was pro-
vided an opportunity to submit argument in writing and 
submitted a 120-page brief.   
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(1) The evidence establishes reasonable concerns that 
Judge Newman suffers from a disability preventing her 
from effectively discharging the duties of her office.  In light 
of the evidence, the Committee had a reasonable basis on 
May 16 to require Judge Newman to undergo the specified 
medical evaluations and produce the specified medical rec-
ords and to request that she sit for the specified interview. 

(2) The Judicial Council is being deprived of infor-
mation that is important to a fully informed determination 
with reasonable medical certainty of whether Judge New-
man has a disability that renders her unable to effectively 
discharge the duties of her office as an active judge because 
she has refused to undergo the ordered medical evalua-
tions, refused to produce relevant medical records, and re-
fused to sit for an interview.  See Rule 4(c).  

(3) Judge Newman has not established good cause for 
her failure to cooperate with the Committee’s investigation 
through her refusal to undergo the ordered testing, produce 
medical records, or sit for an interview. 

(4) Judge Newman’s refusal, without good cause, to co-
operate with the Committee’s investigation constitutes se-
rious misconduct, as it has prejudiced the effective and 
expeditious administration of the business of the courts.  
Rule 4(a)(5). 

Given these findings, the Council ORDERS: 
(1) Judge Newman shall not be permitted to hear any 

cases, at the panel or en banc level,27 for a period of one 
year beginning with the issuance of this Order, subject to 
consideration of renewal if Judge Newman’s refusal to co-
operate continues after that time and to consideration of 

 
27 This includes all cases in which oral argument has 

not yet occurred.   
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modification or rescission if justified by an end of the re-
fusal to cooperate. 

(2) The Committee shall maintain jurisdiction over this 
matter. 
SO ORDERED:   September 20, 2023.  



United States Court of Appeals for the Federal 
Circuit 

UNDER SEAL (NON-PUBLIC ORDER) 

__________________________ 

IN RE COMPLAINT NO. 23-90015 
__________________________ 

Before the Judicial Council of the Federal Circuit 
 

PER CURIAM.  
 

STATEMENT OF RIGHTS UNDER RULE 20 AND 21 
 Pursuant to Rule 20(f) of the Rules for Judicial-Conduct and Judicial-Disability 
Proceedings, the Judicial Council notifies Judge Newman that she is entitled to a 
right to review of the Council’s decision as provided in Rule 21(b).  The Council will 
transmit the order and memoranda incorporated by reference in the order to the 
Committee on Judicial Conduct and Disability for review in accordance with Rule 21.  
Judge Newman may file a Petition for Review to the Committee on Judicial Conduct 
and Disability.  The Rules regarding the deadline and page limits for the Petition for 
Review may be found in Rule 22.    

duntemar
Cross-Out



Redacted Supporting 
Attachments1 

1  The attachments have been redacted and reordered to protect confidentiality.  
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From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
To: Judge Pauline Newman
Subject: Fwd: Publication of AIPLA QJ 50-4 Anniversary Issue
Date: Thursday, March 9, 2023 8:02:50 PM
Attachments: 50-4 Anniversary Issue.pdf

I hope you will take a moment to read my article in the AIPLA. I talk extensively amount how
much I respect you and what you have meant for me and our court. I recognize that you have
been in my words the heroine of the patent system. Please let us celebrate this amazing career
and life you have lived.  Think very hard about the difference you have already made to
people like me. Your legacy will not be any particular case but rather the impression you leave
behind.  
With affection and admiration,
Kimberly

Get Outlook for iOS



From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
To: Judge Pauline Newman
Subject: meeting
Date: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 11:29:00 AM

Polly,

I think we should meet soon to talk.  As you know, there is a process underway
and there is both an informal and a formal component to this process.  I continue
to hope that you and I can reach an agreement informally.  Can we set a time on
March 24 or March 29?  It would be just the two of us.  

Kimberly

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit



From: Judge Pauline Newman
To: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
Subject: RE: meeting
Date: Thursday, March 16, 2023 11:40:09 AM

Kimberly,
I am willing to talk.  I request that you restore me to the May hearing calendar
before we meet.
Polly.



From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
To: Judge Pauline Newman
Subject: RE: meeting
Date: Thursday, March 16, 2023 12:07:00 PM

Polly,

The May hearing calendar is already set.  And I know you are aware, the judicial
council voted that you should not hear new cases during this process.  It is my
hope that you and I can meet soon to try to resolve the process.  Please let me
know what day and time you prefer March 24 or March 29 or if you want to meet
sooner, I will be in tomorrow March 17. 

Kimberly

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit



From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
To: Judge Pauline Newman
Subject: RE: meeting
Date: Thursday, March 16, 2023 4:43:00 PM

I understand you might be in tomorrow.  I will be here.  Please let me know if
you’d like to meet.  

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit





From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
To: Judge Pauline Newman
Subject: CONFIDENTIAL
Date: Friday, March 17, 2023 12:00:00 PM
Attachments: JMD draft order (3.16.2023).docx

Polly,

It was my hope that we would be able to talk about this, but your refusal to agree
to a meeting or to respond to your colleagues’ calls or emails has left me with no
choice but to email you the attached order.  I have not formally docketed this
order yet.  I will do so on Friday, March 24 at 9am.  I wanted to give you an
opportunity to review the complaint prior to docketing it and beginning the
formal process.  If you wish to discuss this with me prior to the formal docketing,
I am available to do so and continue to hope that informal resolution might be
possible.  Because of the sensitive nature of the document, I will send you a
separate email with the password for the document.  

Kimberly

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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 Introduction 
 
 
Main differences between the 3MS and the MMSE 
 
 The Modified Mini-Mental State (3MS) test has been 
designed to enhance the usefulness of the popular Mini-
Mental State Examination (MMSE) (Folstein, Folstein, and 
McHugh, 1975).  Compared with the MMSE, the 3MS has more 
standardized administration and more graded scoring; it 
also assesses a broader variety of cognitive domains and 
covers a wider range of difficulty levels.  The 3MS can 
extract more information about the subject's cognitive 
status than the MMSE; it is also more sensitive than the 
MMSE in detecting within-individual changes over time (Teng 
and Chui, 1987).   
 
The 3MS is not just a screening test for dementia 
 
 Neither the MMSE nor the 3MS has been designed 
primarily as a screening tool for dementia.  For this 
purpose the 3MS Test is only marginally better than the 
MMSE (Tombaugh, McDowell, Kristjansson, and Hubley, 1996); 
as a matter of fact, comparable screening efficacy can be 
achieved with the use of a much shorter test, a short 
version of the Cognitive Abilities Screening Instrument, or 
CASI-Short (Teng, Hasegawa, Homma, et al., 1994).  Although 
many of the items in the MMSE and the 3MS are not sensitive 
for detecting dementia in its early stage, they are useful 
for other purposes, including that of monitoring the 
progression of dementia to its middle and late stages. 
 
This Manual contains answers to many frequently asked 
questions 
 
 This manual has been prepared after more extensive use 
of the 3MS by us and others since the first article on the 
3MS was published (Teng and Chui, l987).  In this manual we 
have incorporated answers to many questions that frequently 
arise during the administration and scoring of the 3MS.  
Minor changes have been made from the original article.  
For example: the order of asking the time and place of 
birth has been switched; the three choices for spatial 
orientation have been modified.  Wherever information 
provided in this manual differs from that in the original 
article, follow this manual. 
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From: Judge Pauline Newman  
Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 3:40 PM
To  
Subject: Re: Governance and Education Travel Report (fka Non-Case Related Travel Report) Report Due May 15

 since I don’t at present have a JA, by action of the Chief Judge, please advise how the court proposes to assist in handling these reporting
requirements. 
PN 

Sent from my iPhone

1



On May 8, 2023, at 4:23 PM, wrote: 

Judge Newman, 

Almost all the senior judges enter this information in Infoweb themselves and many of them do not have secretarial 
support. This is a mandatory report required by all judges; only you have your information about your travel. You will 
need your credentials for .Intilweh, and here are the instructions on how to enter the data. It is a very user-friendly 
system. Perhaps one of your law clerks could assist you. If your staff has any questions, I'd be happy to answer them. 

Best, 

-udge Kimberly A. Moore 
U S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
717 Madison Place NW 

DC20439 

2 



From: Judge Pauline Newman 
Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 5:11 PM 
To: 
Cc: Judge Pauline Newman 
Subject: Re: Governance and Education Travel Report (flea NonCase Related Travel Report) Report Due May 15 

_, I do not choose to do secretarial work, whether or not any senior judges are obliged to do so. My JA routinely keeps these records and fills out these 

forms for my review. It appears that the court chooses to continue to deprive me of routine services. 
PN 

Sent from my iPhone 

3 



From: 

Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 5:21 PM 

To: Chief Judge Kimberly A  Moore 

Subject: Fwd: Governance and Education Travel Report (fka Non-case Related Travel Report) Report Due May 15 

Chief, 

See PN's response below. 

■

4



From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 10:21 AM
To: 
Subject: HR question

Can you please check in with Judge Newman because weeks ago her requests for judicial assistance were approved?  Why hasn’t
this moved forward?  As I understand it:

April 19:   resigned from Judge Newman’s chambers on April 19, 2023 and asked that there be no further
communication between him and Judge Newman.  He was assigned to our Clerk’s Office where he now works. 

Judge Newman requested that she be permitted to bring back her former judicial assistant, , who her chambers claimed was
ready and willing to come back.  As I understand it, you contacted the AO to determine how to bring back a retired
annuitant) in a manner which would not diminish her retirement annuity.  I agreed to petition the AO to waive the salary set-off
that  would face as a reemployed annuitant.  This way would receive her full retirement annuity and get paid for any
hours she worked at the court. 

April 24:  I understand you to have communicated the approval to bring  back to Judge Newman on April 24 including the
fact that  will be brought back in a manner which allows her to keep both her full retirement annuity and get paid. 

April 27 (9:43 am):  I sent Judge Newman an email (copying you) which approved her request to advertise to hire a permanent
paralegal/assistant. 

Given that her request for temporary assistance was approved 16 days ago (just 5 days after her assistant resigned) and that her
request to advertise for a permanent replacement was approved 13 days ago, I am confused about her below claims that either I or
the court continue to deprive her of what she refers to as secretarial services. 

Can you update me on this process and reach out again to Judge Newman?

With gratitude,

Kimberly Moore

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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From: Judge Pauline Newman  
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 1:42 PM
To  
Cc: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Subject: Re: HR question

Thank you,  I have been awaiting word that Judge Moore has approved the hiring of a permanent JA on posting of that opening. If I missed receipt of notice of such
approval, please resend. 
PN 

Sent from my iPhone
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From:  
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 2:38 PM
To: Judge Pauline Newman 
Cc: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Subject: RE: HR question

Hi Judge Newman,

The Chief gave approval to recruit for the permanent refill of your JA/paralegal position on April 27th.  Please see the email attached from the Chief at
9:43AM on that date where she states that “HR will begin the process of posting for a replacement. “ Shortly after the Chief’s email, I followed-up with an
email sent directly to you on the same date at 10:23 AM (also attached) letting you know that in light of the Chief’s approval I was sending along a draft
vacancy announcement for your review/approval and that once the announcement was finalized I would post it publicly.

After the two emails attached and referenced above, you and I exchanged several emails regarding the announcement (highlighted below).  The last email
in this exchange is an email I sent to you on May 2nd, in which I attached a draft announcement for a JA rather than a paralegal and asked that you review
and approve so that I could move forward and post it. 

Assistant Circuit Executive for Human Resources
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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From: Judge Pauline Newman 
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 3:48 PM
To:  Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Cc: Judge Pauline Newman 
Subject: RE: Judicial assistant and law clerk positions

Yes indeed; this was the reason for my uncertainty.  Authorizing “beginning the process of posting” is not the same as authorizing hiring the 
replacement.  I ask Judge Moore to confirm that she authorizes hiring the replacement, not just beginning the process of posting.

Similarly, I ask Judge Moore to confirm that there are no obstacles to my proceeding with hiring a fourth law clerk.
PN

10



From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
To:
Subject:
Date:

; Judge Pauline Newman
RE: Judicial assistant and law clerk positions
Tuesday, May 9, 2023 8:40:17 PM

Attachments: image001.png
image002.png

Judge Newman:

There has been nothing uncertain or ambiguous in the communications with you concerning hiring a permanent replacement for your JA/paralegal   On April 27,
2023, emails both from me and from made clear that I had authorized hiring a permanent replacement   The only reason that process has not moved
forward is that you have failed to approve any of the versions of the vacancy announcement that has transmitted for your review

Specifically, in an email at 9:43 am on April 27, I asked you to accept the court’s repeated offer to bring in a temporary assistant and also explained that HR would
begin the process of posting for a permanent replacement   Posting for a replacement necessarily indicates that hiring has been authorized, it makes no sense to
suggest that the court has authorized you to publicly advertise that you are hiring for a vacant position if there is not, in fact, authority to hire for that position   Less
than an hour after my email, at 10:25 am, sent you an email with a draft of the vacancy announcement   Her email made it clear that the full hiring process had
been authorized as she anticipated later steps in the process and asked you how you would like to receive the packages for qualified applicants

On Sunday April 30, 2023, at 6:35 pm you responded to   You did not raise any concern that there was some uncertainty as to whether hiring a permanent
replacement had actually been authorized   Instead, you asked for a copy of the vacancy announcement that had been used to recruit a paralegal for your chambers in
2021   In several further email exchanges with  you went back and forth over the draft vacancy announcement until informed you by email of May 2, 2023
at 2:05 pm that a link you had sent her (showing a vacancy announcement at the D C  Court of Appeals) was not working   included an updated draft of the
vacancy announcement and asked you to approve it for posting   You failed to respond to that request and was unable to move forward  has repeatedly
sought approval from you to move forward with the temporary service your requested and the permanent service you requested   Any failure to acquire these services
for you is due to your failure to authorize to move forward  

If you wish to hire a permanent JA/paralegal, please review and approve the vacancy posting that  has sent to you   

Kimberly Moore

Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
To:
Cc:
Subject: FW: 
Date: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 3:48:00 PM

Effective immediately,  is no longer an employee of the Newman
chambers.  He will no longer answer Judge Newman chambers phone lines or
have access the chambers Y drive or receive emails to -PN.   remains
available to assist with matters of transition and has prepared a transition memo
which will be sent to chambers by .  There should be no direct
communication from any member of the Newman chambers including the judge to

.  All communication with  from any member of the Newman chambers
whether by email, phone, teams or otherwise should be directed exclusively to

 who will them relay the information to . 

Kimberly Moore

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit

1
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From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Sent: Tuesday, April 4, 2023 5:37 PM
To: Judge Pauline Newman 
Subject: 

Judge Newman,

A concern by a member of your staff has been brought to my attention. 
I understand that your law clerk has been contacting your
paralegal in the middle of the night to perform some work-related and
some personal tasks for her.  I further understand that he has let 
know that he does not wish to be contacted outside of business hours
except by you in the case of an emergency.  It is not clear to me how
much you know about these inappropriate contacts so I am calling
them to your attention as supervisor to ensure that this
uncomfortable situation does not continue.  Can you please confirm
receipt of this message? 

Kimberly Moore

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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From: Judge Pauline Newman  
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 3:46 PM
To: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Cc:  

Subject: June Calendar

To Chief Judge Moore,

Yesterday’s notice of the June appeal paneling again excludes me from the entire
June hearing calendar, despite my request.  Please correct this action...

Judge Newman

2



From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 4:05 PM
To: Judge Pauline Newman 
Cc:  Judge Sharon Prost Judge Richard G. Taranto

 Judge Todd Hughes  Judge Timothy B. 
Dyk ; Judge Kara Stoll ; Judge Alan D. Lourie

; Judge Tiffany P. Cunningham  
Judge Raymond Chen  Judge Jimmie Reyna  
Leonard P. Stark 
Subject: RE: June Calendar

Judge Newman,

I am not certain why you would send this email to all law clerks and court staff. 
Given the sensitive nature of the issues involved, I am sending this response only 
to the members of the court’s judicial council.  You have already been informed 
that the judicial council voted unanimously not to assign you to sit on any new 
cases pending the results of the investigation into potential disability/misconduct 
identified in the order which you have been given.  As you know, consistent with 
the rules, a special committee was appointed and that investigation is ongoing. 
To be clear, you will not be assigned any new cases until these proceedings are 
resolved.    

Kimberly Moore

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 4:12:37 PM
To: Judge Pauline Newman 
Subject: RE: 

Judge Newman,

Since I received an email from you a few minutes ago, I know you are on email.
Yet, you did not acknowledge receiving the below email which identifies an EDR
matter related to inappropriate conduct by one of your staff towards another staff
member.  Please let me know that you will address the alleged inappropriate
conduct by  otherwise I need to do so.  I have been advised that I
should make certain that you appreciate that should suffer no adverse
consequences for having come forward. 

Kimberly Moore 

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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From: Judge Pauline Newman < >
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 7:19:29 PM
To: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore >
Cc: -
Subject: Re: 

Judge Moore,

Since you have not responded to my request, I assume you refuse to restore my service as a judge of
the court.  This is more significant than a phone call to a member of my chambers staff. 

Judge Newman 

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 5, 2023, at 4:12 PM, Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
 wrote:

Judge Newman,

Since I received an email from you a few minutes ago, I know you are
on email. Yet, you did not acknowledge receiving the below email
which identifies an EDR matter related to inappropriate conduct by
one of your staff towards another staff member.  Please let me know
that you will address the alleged inappropriate conduct by 
otherwise I need to do so.  I have been advised that I should make
certain that you appreciate that should suffer no adverse
consequences for having come forward. 

Kimberly Moore 

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit

From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Sent: Tuesday, April 4, 2023 5:37 PM
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To: Judge Pauline Newman 
Subject: 

Judge Newman,

A concern by a member of your staff has been brought to my attention. 
I understand that your law clerk has been contacting your
paralegal in the middle of the night to perform some work-related and
some personal tasks for her.  I further understand that he has let 
know that he does not wish to be contacted outside of business hours
except by you in the case of an emergency.  It is not clear to me how
much you know about these inappropriate contacts so I am calling
them to your attention as s supervisor to ensure that this
uncomfortable situation does not continue.  Can you please confirm
receipt of this message? 

Kimberly Moore

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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From: Judge Pauline Newman
Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2023 5:25 PM
To: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
Cc:
Subject: Re: Support services

Judge Moore, 
I never released my paralegal   from my chambers staff. His movement to your staff, without consultation 
with me, violates his confidentiality and other  obligations to me.  
Nor have I released my law clerk  . I observe that he is now listed as “law clerk— chambers of   

” This was not cleared with me, and I was never notified of this move, again in violation of the confidentiality of 
my chambers, and in violation of my right to law clerk services.  
Judge Newman  

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 27, 2023, at 9:43 AM, Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore   wrote: 

Judge Newman,  

Your paralegal ceased to be a member of your chambers staff on April 19, 2023 and the circumstances 
surrounding this are, as you know, a matter of on‐going proceedings.   

You requested to bring in a temporary assistant (you indicated that your prior assistant   was 
willing). This was approved days ago and our HR   has repeatedly tried to process her return but 
you have refused to allow her to proceed.   If there is delay in processing your cases due to not having 
an assistant (despite having three law clerks) that could have been cured by your permitting HR to 
proceed to bring back your prior assistant‐which was repeatedly offered to you.  

Given that you refuse to bring in exactly the temporary assistant services you requested unless the court 
posts an advertisement for a permanent position, and are using your lack of assistant support as an 
excuse for further delays in processing cases please accept the court’s repeated offer to bring in a 
temporary assistant and our HR team will also begin the process of posting for a replacement.    

Kimberly Moore  

Get Outlook for iOS 
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From:    
Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2023 8:23 
To: Judge Pauline Newman   
Cc: Greg.Dolin@ncla.legal; mark.chenoweth@ncla.legal 
Subject: RE: CONFIDENTIAL: Follow‐up 

Judge Newman, 

Respectfully, I have not withheld any information from your counsel and stand by what I stated 
in the below email.  As I previously explained to you by email on April 24, 2023, your concerns 
about staffing for your chambers need to be addressed to the Judicial Council and not me.  I was 
not involved in the decision concerning the removal of staff from your chambers or the question 
of whether to fill the vacancy.  Your request for expansion of services by the Clerk’s Office—
namely direct secretarial support and assistance with editing and preparing opinions—is outside 
of the scope of our authority or services we provide to any other judge of this court.  Accordingly, 
I promptly referred your request to Chief Judge Moore, who responded to you the same 
day.  Absent a contrary direction from either the Chief Judge or the Judicial Council, I cannot 
proceed and so again, I request that you direct your concerns to them. 

The Clerk’s Office remains available to provide the same services to you that we provide to any 
other chambers, which we have done so since the beginning of this matter.  Specifically, we have 
continued to provide you with IT support and assistance; full access to existing communication 
and network systems; and the processing of judicial directions from you and your chambers, 
including promptly issuing an opinion on your behalf earlier this week.  Once you alerted me to 
the issue of a removed desktop from your chambers, I attempted to clarify for you what 
happened; explained that the movement of the desktop from your chambers was standard policy 
when a staff member changes desks; explained that even with the movement of the desktop 
there was no chambers information on the device as all of your chambers records were saved to 
and available on your private chambers network drive; and directed the prompt restoration of a 
desktop to your chambers, which has since happened.  I explained this all to you over several 
email exchanges ending on April 25, 2023. 

You have my consent to share our several email exchanges with your counsel.   

Regards, 
 

 
Chief Deputy Clerk, Clerk’s Office 
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit 

 | www.cafc.uscourts.gov
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From: Judge Pauline Newman    
Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 17:40 
To:   
Cc: Greg.Dolin@ncla.legal; mark.chenoweth@ncla.legal 
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL: Follow‐up 
 

, you have withheld from my counsel the information that you refused to permit filling the paralegal/secretarial 
position in my chambers, unlike all the other judges.  My judicial activity is highly prejudiced.  
 
Judge Newman  
 
 
 
 

Sent from my iPhone 
 

On Apr 25, 2023, at 10:52 AM,   wrote: 

  

Mr. Dolin, 
 
Thank you for speaking with me by phone moments ago.   
  
Appearance and Admission.  Since my earlier message to Judge Newman, the 
Judicial Council has waived the need for formal entry of appearance.  Because you 
clarified that you are now lead counsel on this matter and a member of the Federal 
Circuit bar, this is moot anyway. We do not require any separate filing on this 
point. 
  
Service and Filing.  In order to expedite the receipt by you and the Judicial 
Council of all matters and avoid the need for paper delivery and service, we agreed 
to the following process. 
  

1. If needed, any future filings with the judicial council on this matter can be 
emailed to me at this address.  Please send anything in PDF format 
encrypted using the same password we agreed to by telephone. 
  

2. I will serve any orders and items from the judicial council or the special 
committee to you, Mr. Chenoweth, and Judge Newman by email in the same 
format, again using the same password. 

  
Copy of Current Orders.  I will transmit by email to you today all orders already 
entered in this matter.  The files will be encrypted with the same password.   
  
Access to Court Resources.  While on the phone, you asked for clarification on 
Judge Newman’s ability to access her chambers materials and issue opinions.  I 
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clarified that Judge Newman has continued and continues to have full access to her 
chambers materials and the ability to transmit opinions to the Clerk’s Office for 
issuance.  I noted that I separately clarified this issue for Judge Newman by email 
earlier today.  The Clerk’s Office remains available to provide the same technical 
assistance and support for Judge Newman that we currently provide to all of the 
other judges of the court. 
  
Please let me know if I can clarify anything else.  My direct dial and mobile number 
are below as well if you need to reach me. 
  
Regards, 

 

  
  

 

 
Chief Deputy Clerk, Clerk’s Office 
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit 
  

 | www.cafc.uscourts.gov 
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From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Cc: 

Subject: 

Chief Judge Moore, 

Judge Pauline Newman 

Thursday, July 6, 2023 10:23 AM 

Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 

Return of my chambers computer

I once more request the return of my chambers computer, with my stored information . It is 
apparently being withheld at your instruction, for my requests have all been rejected. Please 
instruct the immediate return of the computer that was taken from my chambers. 

Judge Newman 

Sent from my iPhone 
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From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Cc: 

Subject: 

Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 

Thursday, July 6, 2023 11 :49 AM 

Judge Pauline Newman 

 

RE: Return of my chambers computer 

Judge Newman, 

It is my understanding that you have raised repeatedly the concern that when  
resigned from your chambers his computer had your stored information on it. Our Clerk of 
Court, , and our IT Department, all of whom are copied here, have explained to 
you multiple times that when resigned any of your chamber's information that had been 
stored locally on his computer was uploaded to your chambers y drive and that his computer's 
access to your y drive was immediately disabled by our IT staff. I have been informed that our 
Clerk of Court and our IT Department have both examined  computer on multiple 
occasions and confirmed that there is none of your stored information on his computer and that 
his computer has no access to your y drive. I have further been informed that they have 
communicated this to you repeatedly by email. I copy them on this so that they may confirm yet 
again, as you have been repeatedly told, that there is no computer with your stored information 
being withheld from you. 

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore 
Chief Judge 
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit 
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[Director of IT; Help Desk Manager; Clerk 
of Court]











From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Judge Pauline Newman 

Thursday, July 6, 2023 5:06 PM 

Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 

Cc: 

Subject: 

 

Re: Return of my chambers computer 

I again request that the computer drive containing my information be immediately returned to 
me. 
Judge Newman 

Sent from my iPhone 

7

[Director of IT; Help Desk Manager; 
Clerk of Court] 







From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Judge Pauline Newman 

Thursday, July 6, 2023 9:54 PM 

Chief Judge Kimberly A Moore 

Cc: 

Subject: 

 

Re: Return of my chambers computer 

Judge Moore, 
Correction. My chambers computer was removed and has not been returned, despite my 
frequent requests. I require its return. 
Judge Newman 

Sent from my iPhone 

10

[Director of IT; Help Desk Manager; 
Clerk of Court] 























From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Cc: 

Judge Pauline Newman 

Friday, July 7, 2023 3:44 PM 
 

Subject: 

; Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 

Re: Return of my chambers computer 

To be clear: your position is that if is "contrary to court policy" to return the computer and its drive containing my 

chambers information? 
Judge Newman 

Sent from my iPhone 

21

[Clerk of Court] [Director of IT; Help 
Desk Manager] 













From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Cc: 

Judge Pauline Newman 

Friday, July 7, 2023 4:44 PM 

 

Subject: 

; Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 

Re: Return of my chambers computer 

, 

Where is the drive of my removed computer? Please return it immediately, with its contents as it was removed. 

Judge Newman 

Sent from my iPhone 

27

[Clerk of Court] 
[Director of IT; Help 
Desk Manager] 
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Regina Carney, M.D.

1870 SW 52nd Terrace

Plantation, FL 33317

615-636-5792

Independent Medical Examination

In the Matter of: Judge Pauline Newman

Introduction and Reason for Evaluation and Opinion

My name is Dr. Regina Carney. I am an adult forensic psychiatrist employed full-time by the Miami

Veteran’s Administration Medical Center, and working independently as a consultant on legal cases 
involving individuals with known or suspected psychiatric conditions. My credentials are more fully

described on the curriculum vitae attached hereto as Exhibit 1 I have published the articles and chapters

listed on Exhibit “A” hereto, focusing on cognitive disorders including Alzheimer’s Disease and other 
dementias. I have testified as an expert witness during the past 4 years at trial or at deposition in the case

listed in Exhibit 1.

I received my B.S. degree in biology from Duke University and my M.D. from Stony Brook University

Medical Center in New York. I completed my residency in General Psychiatry at Vanderbilt University

Medical Center in Nashville, Tennessee and completed a fellowship in forensic psychiatry at the University

of Miami Miller School of Medicine in Miami, Florida. Previously, I served in the following positions: 1)

Inpatient Staff Psychiatrist for the Mental Health and Behavioral Science Service at the Bruce W. Carter

VA Medical Center; 2) Supervising Attending Physician for the Adult Outpatient Psychiatry Clinic at the

University of Miami Miller School of Medicine; 3) Medical Director for the Miami Dade Forensic

Alternative Center at the University of Miami Miller School of Medicine; and 4) Assistant Professor at the

University of Miami Miller School of Medicine.

I am board-certified in both Adult Psychiatry and Forensic Psychiatry by the American Board of Psychiatry

and Neurology. Attached as Exhibit A is my current CV. Dr. Gregory Dolin, a Senior Litigation Counsel with

the New Civil Liberties Alliance and an attorney for Judge Newman, retained me to review and evaluate

Judge Pauline Newman, a 96-year-old Judge in the Federal Circuit Court of Appeals, who lives in

Washington, D.C. The fees for my services are borne by Judge Newman and not NCLA.

The findings of this preliminary report are based in part on a three-hour clinical evaluation of Judge

Newman performed by me on August 25, 2023, including administration of The Modified Mini-Mental

State Examination (3-MS).

Other records reviewed and considered in the opinion include:

1) Primary Care Medical Records from One Medical Group for Judge Pauline Newman, dated 02/26/2021-

06/14/2023

2) (Enclosed within above) Cardiology Medical Records from Scott Shapiro, MD, PhD, including an

Echocardiogram performed 05/26/2023

3) Statement of Clinical Impression of Ted L Rothstein, MD, Neurologist, summarizing Clinical Evaluation

and Findings from Examination dated 06/21/2023
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3) Publicly available proceedings at: https://cafc.uscourts.gov/home/the-court/notices announcements/

4) Law360 Article by Andrew Michaels. “Judge Newman's Recent Dissents Show She Is Fit For Service,” 
(06/06/2023)

5) Social Science Research Network Manuscript by Ron D. Katznelson, Ph.D. “Is There a Campaign to 
Silence Dissent at the Federal Circuit? (August 28, 2023).” 

6) Description of duties of a United States Circuit Judge

Informed Consent

Judge Newman was informed that a confidential doctor-patient relationship did not exist due to the

nature of the evaluation process, and that although an opinion would be rendered, medical treatment

would not be provided. She agreed to pay the associated fees for this evaluation. The contract and fee

structure were reviewed. Notably, Judge Newman carefully considered the contract and autonomously

commented on the open-ended nature of the arrangement. She requested and her attorney executed an

addendum to ensure costs beyond a reasonable, specific sum would be mutually agreed upon before

being incurred. Judge Newman was informed that a report of the results of the evaluation would be

provided to the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit in regard to the current investigation. Judge

Newman indicated that she understood this information and agreed to undergo the evaluation. She

provided written consent for disclosure of information to and from the non-public sources named in the

records reviewed.

History of Present Complaint

Judge Newman presented for this evaluation on August 25, 2023 in association with an ongoing complaint

and action filed with the U.S. Court of Appeals by Chief Judge Kimberley Moore, under the Judicial Conduct

and Disability Act. The complaint filed by Chief Judge Moore states that concerns exists within the court

that Judge Newman “has engaged in conduct prejudicial to the effective and expeditious administration 
of the business of the courts” and/or “is unable to discharge all the duties of office by reason of mental

or physical disability.” The complaint detailed allegations of decreased work output with significant and 
habitual delays in “processing and resolution of cases” (resulting in re-assignment of some cases), an

episode of fainting during a hearing followed by Judge Newman’s inability to ambulate independently, 
and potential “impairment of cognitive abilities (i.e., attention, focus, confusion and memory) that render 
Judge Newman unable to function effectively in discharging case- related and administrative duties. It has

been stated that Judge Newman routinely makes statements in open court and during deliberative

proceedings that demonstrate a clear lack of awareness over the issues in the cases.” There was also an

allegation of “inappropriate behavior in managing staff” and a disclosure of sensitive medical information 
to staff.

Judge Newman was suspended from hearing further cases beginning in April of 2023, “pending resolution 
of this investigation.” 

Evaluation and Observations

Judge Pauline Newman arrived 30 minutes early for the evaluation. She was professionally dressed,

appropriate for the weather (mentioning it was likely to rain), and her grooming and hygiene were

unremarkable, with no obvious areas of deficit. Demeanor was calm and cooperative. She had eyeglasses
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that she wore for reading tasks but removed in conversation. She spoke fluently and attended well to the 

interview, handling changes in topic with agility. Her speech was notable for an expanded vocabulary 

consistent with her lifetime work in law. She was careful to clarify any terms that might have been 

unfamiliar to the interviewer; for example, she indicated that her judicial assistant functioned “in effect, 

as my secretary” until the interviewer indicated familiarity with the term “J.A.”, whereupon she used that 

term going forward.  

Interactively, Judge Newman warmed to the interview, and provided full and detailed responses. Judge 

Newman was able to articulate and respond to the concerns raised in a collected manner. She had no 

specific recollection of a negative event or experience that might have given rise to the complaint. She 

was aware that her intellectual abilities and personal medical fitness were being questioned, and stated, 

“If I’m deluding myself, I’d be glad to know that.” When the prospect of a voluntary cognitive evaluation 

during the interview was mentioned, she frowned and opined, “it's totally improper and inappropriate for 

my colleagues to put me through these tests. When people are being evaluated, you eventually get to 

questions that cannot be answered. My experience with my colleagues is that whatever the break-point 

is, then they point out where you could not answer. There is also a totally unscrupulous media that 

misrepresents the results.” The voluntary nature of the cognitive evaluation was reiterated, and the 

matter was agreed to be re-considered at the end of the interview. 

Occupational History and Recent Events 

Judge Newman provided a detailed social, educational, and occupational history that is abbreviated here 

for expediency. She recalled becoming a federal judge in 1984 at the request of President Ronald Reagan, 

from whom she received a personal phone call offering the role. At the time, she has been working for 30 

years in a senior role in the patent system. In regard to the judgeship offer, she stated, “it wasn’t what I 

was looking for, but the court had been formed just a few years before. In regard to the politics, I had no 

idea. I got a call and said I’d be willing.” Judge Newman expressed that she finds her work intellectually 

and philosophically engaging, and enjoys it immensely. She remarked, “it's an extraordinary position; it's 

very difficult work, but it's full of satisfaction for doing something for the nation. Doing some justice.” She 

noted, “I do speak out about what I think. I know very well I’m not popular with my peers. I think one of 

the reasons I’m in trouble is when I think they’re wrong, I tell them. The Supreme Court usually then says 

I’m right - that’s a reassurance.”  

With regard to productivity and quality of her opinions, Judge Newman expressed that she felt “nothing 

has changed. I’m still learning things.” She agreed that human aging was generally associated with some 

natural slowing of work production and physical skills, particularly at extreme ages. However, she also 

noted that “the work does not require a 20-year old's peak [performance]. I see some things more clearly 

due to my experience.” She referenced the statistical review of her work output published by Ron 

Katznelson (listed in records reviewed section of this evaluation) in this vein. 

Judge Newman characterized herself as a generally strong-willed and outspoken individual, even when 

her opinions were not in line with others. She noted, “they are saying I’m grouchy and my staff have been 

leaving. I’ve been arguing with the IT staff because they took my [secretary’s] computer two or three 

months ago.” She also noted that “all of the affidavits saying my behavior is inappropriate have been in 

the past few months, since this complaint was filed. I am not physically disabled, and I’m still writing 

opinions. If I thought I was slipping, I would quit.” 
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Judge Newman expressed understanding that individuals experiencing cognitive decline often exhibit

impaired insight into their deficits. She was open to reflection on the particular threat to one's identity

when a highly distinguished career—one requiring intellectual prowess and fine attention to detail and

context—is brought into question by the prospect of cognitive decline. Unrelated to this discussion, but

brought up at a different point in the evaluation, Judge Newman indicated that she was aware that her

cataracts were impairing her vision. She noted that she had voluntarily allowed her driver’s license to

expire as she felt this condition made it unsafe for her to drive.

Medical History

Judge Newman was able to recount her own medical history accurately, including “a pacemaker due to

what they call sick sinus syndrome, around 2018,” a fractured right wrist a few months ago,

She stated that outside of the surgery to implant the pacemaker,

she has had no other surgeries.

She denied episodes of confusion or getting lost. She denied any instances of seizures, traumatic brain

injury, or noting loss of memory. She recalled a single event of syncope in April of 2023, “I think of 
dehydration. I was not admitted.”

She denied having balance problems. She explained that she fractured her wrist while sprinting to take a

photo of cardinals seen outside her apartment, where she lives alone.

In terms of past psychiatric history, she reported “none! To my amazement, even in this turmoil—well

perhaps that's the fatal flaw—it's not getting to me.” She stated that her mood remains upbeat (“maybe 
some good will come of this”), and her sleep is sufficient and restorative. She denies any personal history

of anxiety, depression, mania, psychosis, or misuse of alcohol or other substances, and denied any family

history of the same. Judge Newman reported that her mother had lived to be well into her late 90s with

no cognitive difficulties.

Current Function in Independent Activities of Daily Living

Judge Newman lives alone in a two-story apartment in Washington, D.C. She has no significant other or

children, but stays in contact with her sister’s family and her friends. She remarked that she has been

grateful to be a generally very healthy individual. She walks around the city for transportation. She

reported that during the COVID public health emergency, she was advised to avoid large crowds due to

her advanced age, and thus requested assistance with getting food. However, she stated that she herself

prepares her own food. Since the announcement of the end of the public health emergency she has

resumed going to the grocery store.

She stated that she has employed an individual to assist her with cleaning her apartment for many years;

“I’m not much of a homemaker.” She pays her own bills, and at the initiation of this evaluation, produced

a check that she filled out accurately and completely for the retainer fee.
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Cognitive Evaluation

Given Judge Newman's advanced educational attainment and exceptional verbal fluency, the possibility

of some degree of successful concealment of an underlying cognitive defect was examined. A quantitative

examination of cognition was thus performed at the end of the interview. The Modified Mini-Mental

Status Exam (3-MS) was administered; this test was chosen specifically to avoid re-testing (“learning”) 
effects related to the recently administered Montreal Cognitive Assessment (MOCA). Having personally

administered the 3-MS several hundreds of times to individuals of varying cognitive abilities, my

experience is that the examination usually requires 20 to 30 minutes to complete. The 3-MS is given in a

highly standardized manner, with scripted prompts for the items. It is scored on a 100-point scale.

Judge Newman was able to read, write with her right hand, and reply appropriately to complete the

examination. Judge Newman completed the 3-MS in 11 minutes, with a final score of 98 out of 100. She

missed 2 points for generating only eight four-legged animals in 20 seconds, out of a possible 10. She was

dismayed to hear of this result and scolded herself for not thinking of barnyard animals as a category. She

scored perfectly on the word recall items, retaining all 3 words after both immediate and delayed time

periods. The original 3-MS scoresheet is attached as Exhibit 1.

Summary and Opinion:

In summary this is a fluent, engaging, strong-willed, highly accomplished and unusually cognitively intact

96-year-old woman with chronic medical issues that appear well-controlled at the current time, with no

evidence of current substantial medical, psychiatric, or cognitive disability. She is ambulatory, provides a

complete and accurate personal, social, occupational, and medical history, and is fully oriented to time,

place, date, situation and the nature of the current investigation. She reports no history of, or current,

psychiatric or cognitive issues including anxiety, depression, or substance use disorders. She appears to

show remarkable resilience; while she noted feeling “defensive” about the investigation, she did not note

persistently anxious or depressed mood. She expressed a positive worldview, and chatted

extemporaneously with the interviewer regarding a recent advance in the treatment of alcoholism that

she had read about.

In my medical and professional opinion, Judge Newman demonstrated no substantial emotional, medical,

or psychiatric disability that would interfere with continuation of her longstanding duties as a Judge in the

U.S. Court of Appeals.



Page 6 of 6

Sincerely,

/s/

Regina Carney, M.D.

Diplomate, American Board of Psychiatry and Neurology

Diplomate, Forensic Psychiatry, American Board of Psychiatry and Neurology

Associate Program Director, Forensic Psychiatry Fellowship

Voluntary Assistant Professor, Department of Psychiatry and Behavioral Sciences

Leonard M. Miller School of Medicine at the University of Miami Adjunct Assistant Professor

Alpha Omega Alpha Teaching Faculty

Herbert Wertheim College of Medicine at Florida International University

Medical Director of Inpatient Psychiatric Services (09/2018-09/2022)

Medical Director of Outpatient Substance Use Disorder Clinic (09/2022-current)

Miami Veteran Affairs Medical Center

1201 NW 16th Street, Room A110

Miami, FL 33125

Phone: 615-636-5792 (cellular)

Email: rcarney0305@gmail.com
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DECLARATION OF TED L. ROTHSTEIN, M.D. 

1. I, Ted J. Rothstein, M.D., am over the age of 18 and make this Declaration in support of 
Judge Pauline Newman’s Response to the Judicial Council in her case before it.  

2. I am a Neurologist practicing in Washington D.C.  I am affiliated with the George 
Washington University Hospital.  I received a medical degree from Virginia 
Commonwealth University School of Medicine. 

3. I have practiced medicine for more than 30 years.  I am Board Certified in Neurology. I 
served an internship at the Queens Hospital in Honolulu, Hawaii, and completed Residency 
in Neurology at University of Washington in Seattle, Washington. 

4. I became Board Certified in Neurology in 1975 and am both a Fellow of the American 
Academy of Neurology and Stroke Fellow of the American Heart Association. 

5. I have 32 peer reviewed publications in scientific journals and 100 presentations in my field. 

6. My most recent publication is Cortical Grey Matter Depletion Links with Neurological Sequelae in 
Post COVID-19 “Long Haulers,” in BMC Neurol. 2023 Jan 17;23(1):22. 

7. I make this Declaration based on personal knowledge as to my background, and 
information gleaned from examining Judge Newman on June 21, 2023.  I produced a report 
based upon that examination on June 21, 2023, and it is attached as Exhibit 1 to this 
Declaration. 

8. My examination of Judge Newman was, except as to adjust to her then broken wrist, 
complied in all respects with the Montreal Cognitive Assessment (“MoCa”) test that is 
standard for assessing cognitive function.   

9. Before administering the MoCa examination I took an oral medical and neurological history 
of Judge Newman.  I also reviewed the analysis of Professor Andrew Michaels of the 
University of Houston on her representative opinions.  At the time of my examination, she 
was under investigation by the Judicial Counsel for “medical impairments.”  My test 
demonstrated she had the cognitive function to continue to function as a judge in the 
court’s proceedings. 

10. It has been suggested that the MoCa test was inconclusive or unscientific because Judge 
Newman could not draw a clock at a particular time given her broken wrist.  

11. The MoCa is a 30-point test and failure to draw a clock does not impede conclusions that 
can be drawn from the 3 points not testable. Moreover, a variety of elements are tested on 
MoCa, and spatial orientation is the only one that could not be evaluated on clock drawing. 

12. Impaired wrist function does not preclude testing of cognitive function. 
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I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.  

  
Executed On: August 29, 2023      /s/ Ted L. Rothstein  
 Ted L. Rothstein, M.D. 
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POINTSVISUOSPATIAL / EXECUTIVE

NAMING

MONTREAL COGNITIVE ASSESSMENT (MOCA ®)
Version 8.1 English

Name:
Education:

Sex:
Date of birth:

DATE:

Copy 
cube

Draw CLOCK ( Ten past eleven )
( 3 points )

[ ] [ ] [ ] [ ] [ ]

/ 5

/ 3

/ 2

/ 1

/ 3

/ 2

/ 1

/ 2

/ 5

/ 6

/ 30

NO 
POINTS

Read list of digits ( 1 digit/ sec. ).

Serial 7 subtraction starting at 100.

Fluency:  Name maximum number of words in one minute that begin with the letter F.

Similarity between e.g. banana - orange = fruit

Category cue
MIS =         / 15Multiple choice cue

Memory 
Index Score 

(MIS)

Has to recall words  
WITH NO CUE

Points for 
UNCUED 
recall only

(MIS)

X3

X2

X1

train - bicycle watch - ruler

The cat always hid under the couch when dogs were in the room.

FACE VELVET CHURCH DAISY RED

(Normal ≥ 26/30)
MIS:       /15

TOTAL 
Add 1 point if ≤ 12 yr edu

© Z. Nasreddine MD
Administered by:

Training and Certification are required to ensure accuracy

www.mocatest.org

NumbersContour Hands
[ ] [ ] [ ][ ]

[ ] [ ] [ ]

Read list of words, subject must 
repeat them. Do 2 trials, even if 1st trial is successful. 
Do a recall after 5 minutes.

MEMORY

ATTENTION

LANGUAGE

ABSTRACTION

DELAYED RECALL

ORIENTATION

FACE VELVET CHURCH DAISY RED

1ST TRIAL

2ND TRIAL

[ ]

[ ]
Subject has to repeat them in the forward order. 2   1   8   5   4

7   4   2Subject has to repeat them in the backward order.

[ ]

[ ] [ ]
4 or 5 correct subtractions: 3 pts,          2 or 3 correct: 2 pts,          1 correct: 1 pt,          0 correct: 0 

Repeat:  I only know that John is the one to help today. [ ]
[ ]

[ ]

[ ] [ ]

[ ] [ ] [ ]

 F B A C M N A A J K L B A F A K D E A A A J A M O F A A B
Read list of letters. The subject must tap with his hand at each letter A.  No points if ≥ 2 errors

(N ≥ 11 words)

[ ] [ ] [ ] [ ] [ ] [ ]Date Month Year Day Place City

[ ]

93 86 79 72 65
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2

3 BEFORE: THE HONORABLE KIMBERLY A. MOORE

4     THE HONORABLE RICHARD G. TARANTO

5        THE HONORABLE SHARON PROST

6

7      IN RE: COMPLAINT NO. 23-90015

8

9           ***SEALED HEARING***

10

11              ***CORRECTED***

12

13         NATIONAL COURTS BUILDING

14          717 Madison Place, N.W.

15             Washington, D.C.

16          Thursday, July 13, 2023

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25  Reported by:  Susanne Bergling, RMR-CRR

PUBLIC REDACTED VERSION
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2
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7         New Civil Liberties Alliance
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17
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For The Record, Inc.

1                   P R O C E E D I N G S

2                   -    -    -    -    -

3        (Proceeding called to order at 2:00 p.m.)

4         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Good morning.  We're here for

5 argument -- or afternoon -- we're here for argument

6 today.

7         Mr. Dolin, are you going to proceed?

8         MR. DOLIN:  I am.

9         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Please proceed.

10         MR. DOLIN:  Thank you, Judge Moore.  Good

11 afternoon, Your Honors.  Gregory Dolin, senior

12 litigation counsel from the New Civil Liberties

13 Alliance, for The Honorable Pauline Newman.  With me are

14 senior litigation counsel John Vecchione and, to his

15 left, Mark Chenoweth, president and general counsel of

16 the NCLA.

17         Before I begin on the merits, with the

18 Committee's permission, I would like to read our

19 objections in for the record.

20         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Before you begin with that,

21 let me -- as a housekeeping matter, I just want to

22 remind counsel at the outset that our rules prohibit any

23 audio or video recording of this argument, and I want to

24 ensure that you are not recording it in any way.

25         MR. DOLIN:  Judge Moore, we have read your order,
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1 and we certainly have no intention of violating it.

2         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.  And then I just want

3 to remind counsel that all aspects of this hearing are

4 confidential until we agree otherwise, okay?

5         MR. DOLIN:  Yes.  And, actually, I would like to

6 come back to that point, but, yes, I do understand that.

7         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Please proceed.

8         MR. DOLIN:  So, first, just objections for the

9 record.  First, we object to this proceeding before this

10 Committee and the Judicial Council of this Circuit due

11 to the inherent risk of an actual bias which we have

12 documented in our submissions.

13         We particularly object to the Special Committee's

14 membership given that all three of the members of this

15 committee attempted to convince Judge Newman to retire

16 in exchange for not launching this investigation.  We

17 simply do not understand, given the constitutional and

18 statutory requirements, why the Chief Judge and/or the

19 Judicial Council have refused to request a transfer of

20 this matter.

21         Second, we object to this Committee's orders

22 excluding parts of Judge Newman's legal team and her

23 chambers staff from attending this hearing.

24         Third, we object to the Committee's refusal to

25 either provide us with a recording of this proceeding or
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1 permit us to create one.

2         Fourth, and perhaps most importantly, we object

3 to Judge Newman's continued and illegal suspension from

4 the duties of the office to which she was nominated and

5 confirmed, and our appearance here today should not be

6 viewed as a waiver of any of the above objections.

7         Finally -- and this, I guess, goes to your last

8 point, Judge Moore -- we reiterate our request that all

9 of our materials submitted to this committee, including

10 our letters of July 5th and 12th, the Committee's order

11 of July 7th, 11th, and 12th, and a transcript of this

12 hearing be released with appropriate redactions pursuant

13 to Rule 23(b)(7).

14         With these objections noted for the record, I am

15 ready to address the substance of today's hearing.  On

16 the merits we take issue with the Committee's

17 characterization of Judge Newman's behavior as failing

18 to cooperate.  Quite the contrary.  Judge Newman did not

19 fail to cooperate with this investigation.

20         As we've stated in our letter of April 4th --

21 sorry, April 21st, that Judge Newman is willing to

22 cooperate with an investigation that's conducted

23 consistent with the limits that the Constitution, the

24 Judicial Disability Act of 1980, and the rules of the

25 Judicial Conduct and Judicial Proceedings impose on such
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1 investigations.

2         In our May 9th letter, at pages 45, we've

3 indicated that Judge Newman is willing to cooperate --

4 i.e., work together -- as the word "cooperate" is

5 defined in the dictionary.  In our letter on May 25th at

6 3, we once again said that Judge Newman is committed to

7 providing records and undergoing appropriate medical

8 examination if this matter is transferred.

9         JUDGE PROST:  But Mr. -- I'm sorry --

10         MR. DOLIN:  Of course.

11         JUDGE PROST:  -- but on that matter of

12 cooperation, even the citation you had in your brief,

13 that was predicated on our transferring the case, as I

14 understood it, and on our restoring her to sitting.  Am

15 I -- and that's the quote that was in your brief --

16         MR. DOLIN:  That is correct, because as of our

17 letter on May 25th, Judge Newman was suspended,

18 according to Judge Moore's own email, "pending

19 conclusion of this investigation."  Respectfully,

20 there's no authority for such suspension.

21         We, of course, question the authority to suspend

22 even to -- at the conclusion of the investigation

23 because we submit that the Constitution does not permit

24 suspensions, but that aside, there's absolutely no

25 authority to suspend a sitting judge pending the
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1 investigation.

2         JUDGE PROST:  No, I appreciate that.  I just

3 wanted to clarify your statements about her willingness

4 to cooperate and the predicate of --

5         MR. DOLIN:  Correct, and so -- correct, and she

6 was willing to cooperate predicated on appropriate due

7 process proceedings and this Council and this Committee

8 behaving in an appropriate and legal manner as well.

9 So, yes, that was predicated on those matters.

10         And in contrast, this committee has refused to

11 work cooperatively, because as we've pointed out in our

12 letters, cooperation is a two-way street.  It means

13 working together.  This committee, on matters big and

14 small, refused to cooperate and work together with Judge

15 Newman, as we have now said a number of times, and

16 refused to transfer, even though every circuit faced

17 with a similar situation has transferred any

18 investigation of a circuit judge to another circuit, and

19 in refusing to do so attempted to support this refusal

20 with misleading data.

21         Just to point out that how every other circuit

22 dealt with this issue, even when a judge was no longer a

23 member of the Circuit Court, as was the case with then

24 Judge Kavanaugh when complaints were filed against him

25 citing his alleged misbehavior during Senate
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1 confirmation hearings for his current seat, by the time

2 complaints were filed, he was already confirmed to the

3 Supreme Court.

4         The complaints went to the D.C. Circuit Judicial

5 Council, and even though Judge Kavanaugh -- but now

6 Justice Kavanaugh -- was no longer a member of that

7 Council, the matter was transferred.  Chief Judge

8 Srinivasan was requested to transfer the matter, and it

9 was transferred to the Tenth Circuit.  We were able to

10 find not a single instance when a complaint against a

11 circuit judge that was not dismissed outright was

12 handled in his home circuit, whether it's a complaint

13 against Judge Kavanaugh, Judge Maryanne Trump Barry, or

14 Judge -- I'm blanking on his name -- but the former

15 judge of the Sixth Circuit, Judge Jones of the Fifth

16 Circuit.  Every single one was transferred.

17         This is the only time that it was not.  The

18 Federal Circuit Judicial Council stands alone, and,

19 again, I fail to understand the logic behind it, and it

20 does show that this committee and council has refused to

21 cooperate with Judge Newman.

22         Of course, it has refused to reinstate Judge

23 Newman, and as I've pointed out, Judge Prost, there is

24 absolutely no basis -- at least there was no cited basis

25 up until the order of the Judicial Council of June 5th.
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1         JUDGE TARANTO:  Can I just ask you, the word

2 "cooperation" you're using with reference to the

3 committee based on what source?

4         MR. DOLIN:  Based on the definition of that word

5 in the dictionary.  It means working together, Your

6 Honor.

7         JUDGE TARANTO:  The -- and the -- this is about

8 Judge Newman's refusal to cooperate with compliance with

9 the orders of the Committee, right?

10         MR. DOLIN:  The hearing is certainly meant to

11 address that issue.  What I am submitting to this

12 Committee is that in order to cooperate, in order to

13 work together, there must be -- both parties must

14 actually work together.  At no point was the Committee

15 willing to entertain any of Judge Newman's requests,

16 whether it's her restoration or, in fact, even given an

17 explanation up until June 5th after we filed our suit as

18 to why she remains suspended.

19         JUDGE TARANTO:  So we're here on a -- as you

20 know, a very specific three-part issue, whether there

21 was a failure to cooperate with respect to the directive

22 with medical records, that's first; second, with respect

23 to the directive regarding the neurological and

24 neuropsychological examinations; and third, the request

25 for interview.
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1         Can we just start briefly with the last one?

2 Twice, I think on April 17th and May 16th, the Special

3 Committee specifically invited Judge Newman to sit down

4 for an interview to discuss any alleged factual errors

5 or, more generally, in the April 17th one.  What was the

6 good cause for Judge Newman's refusal to take up that

7 express invitation for an opportunity to discuss the

8 claims with us?

9         MR. DOLIN:  Well, Judge Taranto, I think I would

10 respectfully disagree with the characterization.  I

11 don't think it was an invitation to discuss, as you

12 said, factual errors or other general matters.  In fact,

13 the invitation --

14         JUDGE TARANTO:  I think the April 17th order was

15 perfectly general as to sit down for an interview.  The

16 May 17th focused on -- was -- didn't limit it but

17 focused on some things that I think you all had said in

18 response to an earlier order and said there's been

19 assertions that we have made factual errors and we would

20 like an opportunity to have an interview to hear about

21 those factual errors, and yet Judge Newman has said no.

22         MR. DOLIN:  So, Judge Taranto, so to finish my

23 previous answer and then kind of to expand on it, I --

24 again, I so respectfully disagree with the

25 characterization and the following sentence.  I think
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1 that the order did not specify exactly what the

2 Committee wished to interview Judge Newman about.  There

3 was just -- it's open-ended, but it didn't specify --

4         JUDGE TARANTO:  But she said she wanted it.

5         MR. DOLIN:  That's -- respectfully, that's not

6 what it said.

7         JUDGE TARANTO:  The April 17th said sit down for

8 an interview.

9         MR. DOLIN:  But an interview implies that the

10 Committee is asking questions, and so Judge -- it's

11 not -- it's not a conversation, so -- and so we would

12 want to -- but more fundamentally, like I said, we

13 object to this Committee proceeding because this

14 Committee cannot -- by definition cannot be a neutral

15 decision-maker, cannot be the neutral recommender.

16         JUDGE TARANTO:  So it's not, in your view, that

17 there was no opportunity to have an interview with this

18 Committee, but that she's not interested in having an

19 interview with this --

20         MR. DOLIN:  I don't think I suggested there was

21 no opportunity for an interview.  I've suggested that

22 the Committee, in requesting an interview, did not

23 specify why it wants one.  In fact, its request for an

24 interview was contrary to the prior assertion that this

25 Committee and this Judicial Council is apparently aware
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1 of the personalities and aware of what has gone on,

2 which is why, supposedly, it's refusing to transfer the

3 matter elsewhere.

4         But furthermore --

5         JUDGE TARANTO:  I'm sorry, "supposedly"?  Where

6 do you get that?

7         MR. DOLIN:  That was part of the order of -- the

8 first order that denied transfer.  That was the order, I

9 believe, of May 3rd, and that order said one of the

10 reasons we're refusing to transfer is because we, the

11 Federal Circuit Judges, are familiar with the

12 personalities and with the issues in a way that other

13 circuits would not be familiar with.

14         JUDGE TARANTO:  You're referring, I assume, to

15 some elaboration from the Breyer Committee Report about

16 why the Breyer Committee implemented the statute to make

17 transfer an exception, right, as a general matter?

18         MR. DOLIN:  No, Your Honor.  I'm referring to the

19 order of May 3rd, which -- hold on -- on page -- it's a

20 long order.  I have to find it.

21         (Pause in the proceeding.)

22         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I think you want page 10 of

23 the May 3rd order.

24         MR. DOLIN:  Page 10, thank you.  Thank you,

25 right.  So request for a transfer, so it starts at page



13

Complaint No. 23-90015 7/13/2023

(301) 870-8025 - www.ftrinc.net - (800) 921-5555
For The Record, Inc.

1 9, and it suggests that in this case relative ignorance

2 of the judges of another circuit, of local circumstances

3 and personalities that might make them less able to

4 gauge whether corrective action would be effective and

5 appropriate, and judges within another circuit would be

6 in a poor position to persuade a judge whom they do not

7 know well to take the actions they believe are

8 necessary.

9 Of course, that is always true in every complaint

10 about a circuit judge, but this seems to me, at least

11 the way I read it, was a justification as to why this

12 matter was not asked to be transferred.

13 JUDGE TARANTO:  Can I -- can I turn to a

14 different topic --

15 MR. DOLIN:  Of course.

16 JUDGE TARANTO:  -- and this is --

17 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Before you turn to that,

18 could I ask a followup question?

19 JUDGE TARANTO:  Yes, of course.

20 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I guess, Mr. Dolin, I'm

21 perplexed.  All this says is other judges in other

22 circuits would be less familiar with personalities.  How

23 does that not -- how does that equate to, therefore, you

24 don't need to interview Judge Newman to understand the

25 concerns about errors of fact that she claims may exist?
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1         MR. DOLIN:  Well, first, Judge Moore, we've

2 pointed out two obvious errors of fact that -- you know,

3 the claim that she had a heart attack and the claim that

4 she had a cardiac stent placed.  Frankly, we don't even

5 understand where such allegations -- what the source of

6 these allegations are and on what basis they were made.

7         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Before we -- before we

8 potentially discuss that, I guess I'd like to stick with

9 what is the good cause for her refusal to interview.  In

10 the May 16th order, I will read to you the portion of

11 the order which requests an interview.

12         "Judge Newman has suggested that the Committee's

13 prior orders contained errors of fact, but she has not

14 identified any specific errors."

15         I get now that you're saying she did identify one

16 error, at least by now she has, and that's fine.  I'll

17 give you that.

18         "We have previously invited Judge Newman to meet

19 with the Committee for an interview in which she could

20 provide the Committee with information relevant to the

21 investigation -- that's very open-ended, you see --

22 including correcting any errors of fact.  We again

23 request that Judge Newman participate in a videotaped

24 interview with the Committee which will provide her with

25 an opportunity to clarify these matters."
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1         How is the fact that another Circuit may be less

2 familiar with personalities good cause for her refusing

3 to participate in an interview which would create the

4 Committee with an opportunity to gain clarity into the

5 matters before it?

6         MR. DOLIN:  So a two-part answer.  First, I

7 think, as we're now on the same page, we have clarified

8 some of these errors with respect to the heart attack,

9 with respect to the cardiac stent, with respect to the

10 errors on --

11         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Actually, you have attorney

12 argument about them.  You don't actually have evidence,

13 right?

14         MR. DOLIN:  No, I respectfully disagree.  It's

15 not an argument.  It's a statement that --

16         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  What's a statement?

17         MR. DOLIN:  -- Judge -- it's a statement that

18 Judge Newman -- it's not an argument.  It's a statement

19 of fact that Judge Newman did not have a heart attack.

20         JUDGE TARANTO:  I'm sorry.  Is that by somebody

21 with personal knowledge?

22         MR. DOLIN:  Yes, by somebody with personal

23 knowledge.

24         JUDGE TARANTO:  That's you?

25         MR. DOLIN:  That is me, but I -- based on a
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1 personal --

2 JUDGE PROST:  Well, since we're there, and I hate

3 to interrupt the flow, but I would like to ask you about

4 that.  If you feel it's appropriate for you to respond

5 and to detail for us the information with respect to her

6 medical condition, including a heart attack, correct,

7 you've made statements that she never had a heart -- she

8 didn't have a heart attack and she didn't have a stent,

9 but in our May 16th order, we repeatedly, when we talked

10 about getting medical records, we talked about cardiac

11 issues.

12 So can you represent to us, if she is accepting

13 that she didn't have a heart attack and didn't have a

14 stent, did she engage -- have any cardiac issues during

15 the period in 2021 that we're discussing that required

16 hospitalization or medical attention or otherwise?

17 MR. DOLIN:  I'm trying to -- respectfully, Your

18 Honor, I'm trying to think through my answer, not

19 because I don't necessarily know the answer but because

20 of our standing objection to sharing medical information

21 with this Committee.

22 And so I think a better approach would be that

23 I -- I can't provide that answer, because --

24 JUDGE PROST:  Okay.  Well on that point,

25 though --
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1 MR. DOLIN:  -- of our standing objection.

2 JUDGE PROST:  -- in terms of sharing medical

3 information, some of the at least the surface

4 information that we have arises from Dr. Rothstein's

5 1 1/2 page report, in which in at least one paragraph,

6 which he did, which I think most physicians and

7 neurologists would do, they would request certain

8 background medical information, and there's a reference

9 that he makes in that report to 

10 being treated by -- with a Pacemaker, and, 

11

12  a quick review of

13 just the Mayo Clinic's report on defining that -- and

14 you're a doctor, you probably understand this better

15 than I -- is that that is a heart-related problem.

16 MR. DOLIN:  I don't think we dispute -- I think

17 Judge Newman -- I think she has been very open that she

18 has a Pacemaker.  You asked me more specifically whether

19 she had any issues in 2021.  Maybe I misunderstood the

20 question.  And so I think it's not -- it's really not a

21 secret Judge Newman has a Pacemaker.  I believe it's

22 even in newspaper reports, but --

23 JUDGE TARANTO:  But you don't -- you don't want

24 to say whether there was a cardiac event in 2021.

25 MR. DOLIN:  I -- not because there was one and

[a cardiac condition]
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1 I'm trying to hide it, but I do not want to discuss

2 Judge Newman's medical records, especially ones that are

3 entirely irrelevant to her mental abilities, for all the

4 reasons we have stated in our letter or our numerous

5 letters.

6 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But just -- I just want to

7 make sure we're clear.  You -- you have asserted she

8 didn't have a heart attack in the summer of 2021.

9 MR. DOLIN:  Correct.

10 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  You've admitted she's had a

11 Pacemaker installed, but you won't tell us whether she

12 had a cardiac issue that resulted in her hospitalization

13 for any surgical procedures in 2021?

14 MR. DOLIN:  We've admitted that she had the

15 Pacemaker installed for, I believe, over a decade,

16 nothing to do with 2021.  She's had the Pacemaker for

17 quite some time.

18 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But you won't acknowledge

19 whether she was admitted to the hospital, say GW

20 Hospital, on, say, June of 2022, or admitted to another

21 hospital in May or June or July of 2021.  You won't

22 admit or deny or discuss, so you'll say she did not have

23 a heart attack, and you can't imagine where we got that

24 idea.

25 MR. DOLIN:  Correct.
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1 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But you won't say she wasn't

2 in the hospital during that same time for cardiac

3 issues.

4 MR. DOLIN:  Correct, although, of course, I

5 wouldn't know that the Committee also did not indicate

6 as to where its belief that Judge Newman did have a

7 heart attack or had a cardiac stent placed, which is a

8 fairly specific procedure --

9 JUDGE PROST:  But we were -- okay, what we were

10 talking about -- initially I started this by, okay,

11 we're moving away from a heart attack and the technical

12 definition of a heart attack to then whether she suffers

13 from any cardiac issues, which could have, as the

14 symptoms for  indicate, could result

15 in confusion, dizziness, or light-headedness, fainting

16 or near fainting, fatigue, shortness of breath, slower

17 pulse, chest pain, et cetera.

18 MR. DOLIN:  Those are conditions associated with

19 .  I'm not quite sure what, for

20 example, dizziness or shortness of breath have to do

21 with one's ability to carry on and work as a federal

22 judge.

23 JUDGE TARANTO:  How about to finish up the list?

24 MR. DOLIN:  Sorry?

25 JUDGE TARANTO:  Finish the list.  Confusion, some

[the cardiac condition]

[the cardiac condition]



20

Complaint No. 23-90015 7/13/2023

(301) 870-8025 - www.ftrinc.net - (800) 921-5555
For The Record, Inc.

1 of the other items, you think that has nothing to do

2 with -- with the issue of --

3 MR. DOLIN:  It might, but there is no --

4 JUDGE TARANTO:  -- Judge Newman's ability?

5 MR. DOLIN:  Again, anybody -- you know, I have

6 spoken to Judge Newman at length.  Reporters have spoken

7 to Judge Newman at length.  Former judges of this Court

8 have spoken to Judge Newman at length.  No one, except

9 several staff members, have indicated that she was at

10 any point confused.  So, yes, it --

11 JUDGE PROST:  But you have pinpointed the whole

12 heart issue, you have disputed it, and we focused on a

13 particular time frame as the Chief just mentioned, but

14 you are unwilling to disclose to us if any issues

15 related to  would require

16 hospitalization or intensive medical care during that

17 period that we had identified with respect to the heart

18 ailment.

19 MR. DOLIN:  Correct.  But also, I mean, I would

20 point out that the -- I think, again, I may -- I

21 understand that -- you know, in one of the orders, the

22 Committee said that the underlying question may come

23 into the purview, as we're discussing, refusal --

24 alleged refusal to cooperate, but, of course, again,

25 this hearing is focused on whether or not Judge Newman

[the cardiac condition]
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1 cooperated, and it's not to whether she had a good

2 cause, and if she does not, what is the appropriate

3 sanction, so --

4 JUDGE PROST:  Well, with respect to the

5 cooperation aspect of the medical records, as our May

6 16th order indicated, what we said was those records --

7 the medical records we were talking about would be

8 provided to the neurologist or people examining her, and

9 that seems to be kind of what happened even in, you

10 know, whatever limited medical exam was performed by

11 Dr. Rothstein.

12 MR. DOLIN:  And I --

13 JUDGE PROST:  These records with respect to her

14 medication and coronary issues were provided to

15 Dr. Rothstein, correct?

16 MR. DOLIN:  Dr. Rothstein was provided with such

17 records as he deemed necessary.

18 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I guess that's a little bit

19 hard for me to understand.  Was Dr. Rothstein provided

20 with any medical records or is his statement about her

21 condition in his report based on her oral discussion of

22 her medical conditions?

23 MR. DOLIN:  I will refer you to the answer I made

24 just moments ago.  Dr. Rothstein was provided with such

25 information as he deemed necessary to conduct his
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1 examination.

2 JUDGE TARANTO:  And you think that that's an

3 answer to the question, what the source of the

4 information was?

5 MR. DOLIN:  That I -- I believe that is the --

6 the answer that -- that I can give.

7 JUDGE TARANTO:  Okay.

8 MR. DOLIN:  Again, I'm -- for reasons stated

9 before, Your Honor -- and I do mean no disrespect -- but

10 for reasons stated before, we're not willing to discuss

11 Judge Newman's medical records with this Committee --

12 JUDGE TARANTO:  And remind me what those reasons

13 are, please.

14 MR. DOLIN:  Again, this Committee -- again, this

15 Committee --

16 JUDGE TARANTO:  You keep saying "again," and if

17 you can state it so that I understand it clearly.

18 MR. DOLIN:  We believe this Committee is

19 improperly constituted.  We believe this matter should

20 not stay with the Federal Circuit.  We believe this

21 Committee has not made a prima facie case as to why the

22 evaluation is needed in the first place.

23 So, for example, if you will allow me to

24 sidetrack a little bit, one of the main points that the

25 Committee has made on numerous occasions was that Judge
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1 Newman has extraordinary delays.

2         JUDGE TARANTO:  And I need to back up, get off

3 the statistical point, or before we get to it, do I

4 remember your response -- your July 5th response

5 objected to providing information to or agreeing to

6 undergo examinations with the two medical professionals

7 that our medical consultant identified, partly -- maybe

8 entirely -- anyway, you say because there hasn't been

9 some sort of Daubert qualification of them?

10         Is it your position that the Daubert standard

11 applies to the examiners or other submitters of expert

12 evidence to us?

13         MR. DOLIN:  My position is that we have no idea

14 of who these people are or why -- on what basis they

15 were chosen --

16         JUDGE TARANTO:  Can you answer the question about

17 whether you're asserting that the Daubert standard

18 applies?

19         MR. DOLIN:  Well, I think if you let me finish my

20 answer, I think -- I'll get to the answer --

21         JUDGE TARANTO:  Just try to answer the direct

22 question.

23         MR. DOLIN:  I understand, but I promise I will

24 get to it.  Give me just a little bit of leeway.

25         We don't know who these people are, we don't know
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1 why they were chosen, and, therefore, we have no idea

2 whether they are or are not experts.

3         And so whether it's the full Daubert that applies

4 or any kind of smaller version of it, I think the

5 general idea that people doing the examination and then

6 providing supposedly an expert report to the Committee

7 have -- we have to have some assurance that these are

8 actually qualified people, and we have -- that they're

9 not biased, that they're not -- and we have no idea on

10 what basis these individuals were chosen.

11         So I don't -- I -- I think, ultimately, when

12 these reports are submitted and they're considered by

13 the Committee, I think Daubert has application

14 whether -- you know, whether it's verbatim or it's

15 just -- or it's general idea, but, you know --

16         JUDGE TARANTO:  So let me ask you then about

17 that, and this is now turning back to Dr. Rothstein.

18 The essence of Daubert is that qualifications are in the

19 beginning, that the substance of the testimony must have

20 a sound foundation, a reliable foundation, and that it

21 is for that reason absolutely standard, that when the

22 expert testifies, he or she has to disclose the basis,

23 the materials he or she looked at and what their

24 reasoning was from them.

25         So if that's right, how is it that you think it's
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1 irrelevant what materials Dr. Rothstein was supplied?

2         MR. DOLIN:  I don't think it's irrelevant.  I --

3 but for reasons stated previously -- and, again, of

4 course, Dr. Rothstein is not testifying --

5         JUDGE TARANTO:  So you don't think it's

6 irrelevant.  You just think that we're illegitimate

7 outfits that doesn't deserve to get that answer.

8         MR. DOLIN:  I don't think it's illegit -- I

9 wouldn't call this an illegitimate outfit, Your Honor.

10 I think this Committee is improperly constituted and is

11 an improper body to adjudicate this matter, and because

12 of the -- both the bias --

13         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Counsel -- Counsel, in your

14 brief, you pointed us to Dr. Rothstein's evaluation of

15 Judge Newman.  You told us his conclusion, that her

16 cognitive function is sufficient to continue her

17 participation on the Court, and then you expressly told

18 us that this examination should obviate the need for

19 further testing.

20         This is a hearing about whether it was misconduct

21 for Judge Newman to refuse to undergo the medical

22 testing we requested.  Your answer in your brief to us

23 was, no, it wasn't misconduct, because she did different

24 testing with a different person, and that should

25 suffice.
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1 Why, then, would it be improper for us to seek to

2 know the basis upon which that other testing was

3 rendered, like the material that doctor considered in

4 forming his opinion?  You've asked us to accept that

5 testing in lieu of the testing we requested.  So why

6 don't we then have an opportunity to inquire about the

7 reliability or the basis of that testing?

8 MR. DOLIN:  Your Honor, respectfully, I would

9 again say that this Committee is not a proper body to

10 conduct an evaluation or examination for these

11 proceedings because --

12 JUDGE TARANTO:  And from that answer, what you

13 submitted from Dr. Rothstein counts for nothing, because

14 it cannot be examined under Daubert standards.

15 MR. DOLIN:  What we have submitted from

16 Dr. Rothstein is -- mostly was a point of information

17 that the Committee could choose to credit or not credit

18 as it wishes.  Our response was to the Committee's

19 inquiry as to Judge Newman's cooperation, or lack

20 thereof, her reason for it, and the appropriate sanction

21 for doing so if she didn't cooperate.

22 We wanted the Committee --

23 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But didn't you tell us in

24 your July 5th submission that this Dr. Rothstein report

25 should put an end to the concern about Judge Newman's
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1 medical history and should, therefore, obviate the

2 concern of misconduct for not taking the testing that

3 was required?

4 MR. DOLIN:  I've mentioned the report or we've

5 mentioned the report as part of the broader information

6 to the Committee that should, in our view, frame this

7 proceeding that should have never started to a close.

8 If you look at --

9 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  This examination should

10 obviate the need for any further testing.

11 MR. DOLIN:  Correct, and any further proceedings

12 before this Committee or this Judicial Council, because

13 if you -- looking at Judge Newman's opinions submitted

14 since March, looking at Judge Newman's public

15 statements, looking at this evaluation, there is no

16 basis to conclude that she's in any way disabled.

17 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Well, this is not about

18 whether she's disabled, Counsel.  This is about whether

19 or not this Committee had a reasonable basis to order

20 the medical testing, to ask to interview her, and to

21 request her medical records be provided to someone who

22 would evaluate her.  This is not a proceeding about

23 whether she's disabled.

24 MR. DOLIN:  So can we get -- and so this goes to

25 the answer I've provided to you, Judge Taranto, but can
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1 we go to the basis --

2 JUDGE TARANTO:  Sure, we can get to that in just

3 one second.  Just one thing that I wanted to make sure

4 about.  After your July 5th responses, you know, we

5 issued an order two days later saying please supply us

6 three categories of documents, the unredacted version of

7 Dr. Rothstein, the actual filled-out MoCA form, and then

8 the category of written materials given to or relied

9 on -- I'm not sure what the word is -- accepted by

10 Dr. Rothstein, and in your July 12th response, you say,

11 as to that last category, the medical records, we're not

12 going to give you any more for the reasons we've already

13 discussed.

14 But the category, what we asked you about or

15 directed you to supply July 7th is not just medical

16 records.  It was all materials.  So, for example, that

17 would include all written materials, would include all

18 of the written materials that you have from this

19 proceeding, declarations and other things that supplied

20 the basis for concern about Judge Newman.  In your July

21 12th letter, it doesn't say anything at all about that

22 category.  Were those materials supplied to

23 Dr. Rothstein?

24 MR. DOLIN:  Your Honor, are you referring to

25 affidavits, various affidavits that --
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1         JUDGE TARANTO:  All of the written materials that

2 you -- yes, that were a part of this proceeding that

3 have been given to you as undergirding the -- in

4 particular the May 16th order for --

5         MR. DOLIN:  It is -- it is my understanding that

6 materials that are sealed were not provided to

7 Dr. Rothstein.

8         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  What about the orders?  Were

9 any of the orders which have been made public provided

10 to Dr. Rothstein?

11         MR. DOLIN:  I don't know that he's reviewed the

12 orders either.

13         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I'm sorry.  I couldn't hear

14 you.

15         MR. DOLIN:  I do not know whether he reviewed the

16 orders either.

17         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But were they provided to

18 him?  You don't know whether he reviewed them --

19         MR. DOLIN:  I was not in the room, Your Honor.

20         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Pardon?

21         MR. DOLIN:  I was not in the room, Your Honor.

22         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Oh, so you don't know if

23 Judge Newman provided him with those orders?

24         MR. DOLIN:  I can't comment on that.

25         JUDGE TARANTO:  You can't?
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1         MR. DOLIN:  I can't comment on that as to whether

2 or not -- whether or not they were provided or whether

3 he reviewed them or -- et cetera.  I do know that he

4 reviewed those materials that he deemed in his

5 professional judgment appropriate before administering

6 the test and reaching his conclusion and writing the

7 letter.

8         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Mr. Dolin, can you speak up

9 just a little bit?  I'm having trouble hearing you.

10 Sorry.

11         MR. DOLIN:  He was provided such materials as he,

12 in his professional judgment, of decades of experience,

13 and being a full professor at George Washington School

14 of Medicine, deemed appropriate to conduct his

15 examination and reach his conclusions, and I was not in

16 the room, and I'm -- you know, despite my medical

17 degree, I am not going to second-guess a full professor

18 of neurology --

19         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Well, let me ask you a couple

20 of questions about his report.  We did ask you to come

21 here today prepared to discuss the report and his

22 scoring of the report.  Is it true that Judge Newman

23 either had at the time of his evaluation a cast on her

24 arm or her right wrist?

25         MR. DOLIN:  It is.
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1         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And he says in two places she

2 was, therefore, unable to write.  Is that correct?

3         MR. DOLIN:  That's correct.  She was advised

4 by -- she was advised by her orthopedic surgeon not to

5 hold a pen until the bone was healed.

6         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  So not to hold a pen until it

7 healed.  So she was not able to do any written part of

8 the MoCA, correct?

9         MR. DOLIN:  Correct.

10         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Correct, okay.  So I am going

11 to provide you with the MoCA, which is the same MoCA --

12 you can step forward if you don't have --

13         MR. DOLIN:  I have it.

14         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  You have it?

15         MR. DOLIN:  I have it.

16         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I think you have a copy.  So

17 this is the same thing we provided to you as an exhibit.

18         MR. DOLIN:  Yep.

19         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And this is the MoCA.

20         MR. DOLIN:  Yep.

21         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  As you can see, across the

22 top, there are three portions of the MoCA that require

23 writing.  There is what I'll call connect-the-dots.  I'm

24 not a doctor, so I am going to use layman's language.

25         MR. DOLIN:  Fair enough.
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1 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Connect-the-dots on the left,

2 and there's copy a cube, and Dr. Rothstein noted that

3 she couldn't do either of those because she can't write

4 at all, right?

5 MR. DOLIN:  Yes.

6 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.  So each of those is

7 worth one point, correct?

8 MR. DOLIN:  Um-hum, yep.

9 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.  Then you have to draw

10 a clock where you actually fill in all the numbers and

11 put the hands of the clock on the correct time that's

12 assessed.  If she can't write, how could she do that?

13 MR. DOLIN:  Again, Your Honor, I'm -- I can't

14 comment on how she accomplished that task.  I can

15 comment on Dr. --

16 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Did she accomplish that task?

17 MR. DOLIN:  Again, I was not in the room.  I --

18 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.  So do you understand

19 on the face of Dr. Rothstein's own report, there seems

20 to be an inconsistency?  The inconsistency is he said

21 she was unable to write in two places.  You confirmed

22 that she's been instructed by an orthopedic surgeon not

23 to even hold a pen.

24 MR. DOLIN:  Yes.

25 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  There are three parts of this
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1 test that require writing.  Dr. Rothstein said she

2 couldn't do two of the three of them because she

3 couldn't write, so how did she do the third?

4 MR. DOLIN:  I suspect that there are ways to do

5 the third by either having the clock identified --

6 JUDGE PROST:  Again, I'm sorry, I can't --

7 MR. DOLIN:  I suspect there are ways to do it.

8 Instead of drawing it, you have a clock identified, as

9 well as time identified, et cetera.

10 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Actually, it turns out

11 there's not on the MoCA website.  Do you know that the

12 MoCA website itself explains exactly how to administer

13 the test when you're unable to write?  Let me provide

14 you with a copy of it.  Here you go.

15 MR. DOLIN:  Ah, was --

16 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And this is what they say all

17 qualified practitioners should do when a patient is

18 unable to write.

19 MR. DOLIN:  So, with respect, Judge Moore --

20 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  The MoCA website is -- yes?

21 MR. DOLIN:  -- with respect, Judge Moore --

22 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Yes, yes?

23 MR. DOLIN:  -- if it were up to me, I would rely

24 on several decades' worth of experience of a full

25 professor of neurology at one of the nation's leading
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1 medical schools as opposed to a --

2 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Counsel, this whole professor

3 of neurology may generally be great, but his own report

4 is internally inconsistent.  It says she couldn't write

5 in two places.  You've confirmed she couldn't hold a

6 pen.  He says because she couldn't write, she couldn't

7 connect the dots, and she couldn't copy a cube, but then

8 when it comes to drawing a clock, which is required by

9 the test to be drawn by the patient -- if the patient

10 can't write, according to the MoCA, they can't do any of

11 those three questions according to the MoCA's own

12 rubric.

13 So I'm wondering whether or not it's possible

14 that he erred in his report because he said she couldn't

15 write at all, but then he seems to have given her full

16 credit for drawing a clock.

17 MR. DOLIN:  Of course, anything is possible.

18 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But that's why the Committee

19 has concerns and would like to see the document, is

20 because his report is internally inconsistent on its

21 face.

22 MR. DOLIN:  Okay.  If you'll permit me to finish

23 my answer I was beginning to go to, with respect, I

24 would put some trust in the -- or put trust in a full

25 professor of neurology and at one of the nation's



35

Complaint No. 23-90015 7/13/2023

(301) 870-8025 - www.ftrinc.net - (800) 921-5555
For The Record, Inc.

1 leading medical schools over a -- a well respected

2 judge's interpretation of a MoCA website.  And so I

3 understand what you've read, Judge Moore.  Nevertheless,

4 I suspect that Judge -- that --

5 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Why -- you haven't seen the

6 MoCA test result, have you?

7 MR. DOLIN:  I have not.

8 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.  So you haven't seen

9 it.  He says that she couldn't write, so she couldn't do

10 the written portion.  You don't think it's fair for us

11 to be concerned that possibly he mis-scored the test

12 since he has given her credit for portions that require

13 writing on its face?  Draw a clock?

14 MR. DOLIN:  Again, I suspect -- I suspect that

15 Judge -- again, that -- not Judge -- that Dr. Rothstein

16 knows how to administer this test, knows how to score

17 it, and he was advised before -- in fact, when the test

18 was scheduled, he was advised before that Judge Newman

19 was in a cast, and he asked whether or not we should

20 wait --

21 JUDGE TARANTO:  Would you agree -- I don't know

22 what kind of experience you have with respect to

23 expert-laden cases -- that highly credentialed experts

24 sometimes make mistakes?

25 MR. DOLIN:  Of course.  Everybody makes mistakes,
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1 including this Committee, but --

2 JUDGE TARANTO:  And we don't have the basis for

3 determining that in a document that you submitted to

4 obviate concern here.

5 MR. DOLIN:  Perhaps, but, again, I think I would

6 go back to the point that this shouldn't be here in the

7 first place, that that's my -- I do want to get back to

8 the numbers, and so because Judge Moore asked --

9 JUDGE PROST:  Well, before you do that, just a

10 quick question, because you mentioned in passing and you

11 moved over it, and you made the statement -- I think I'm

12 accurately stating it -- that we had no idea who these

13 people were, the people that we identified as --

14 MR. DOLIN:  No, we don't.  I'm sure the Committee

15 does.  We don't have any idea.

16 JUDGE PROST:  Yes, yes, excuse me.

17         And did we not, in our order, when we identified

18 Dr. , give you a way, suggest that you feel free

19 to contact him if you had any questions about anything,

20 and did you take advantage of that?  If you had a

21 concern that you don't know either his qualifications or

22 the qualifications of the doctors that were being

23 proposed, did you take advantage of going and asking

24 him?

25 MR. DOLIN:  No, because one of the -- because we
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1 would also -- we would not ever learn as to on what

2 basis was he selected.  So, no, we don't know -- no, we

3 did not contact Dr. .

4         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Did you do any other research

5 at all on your own to ascertain the credentials of the

6 doctors whose names you were given as far back as April

7 7th?

8 MR. DOLIN:  I have looked at their website

9 profiles.

10 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And did that cause you to

11 have reason to be concerned about their credentials?

12 MR. DOLIN:  It didn't suggest to me that they are

13 either -- you know, that they -- they have their

14 diplomas, they have done their residency, they have

15 their licenses.  That's all I know.

16 JUDGE PROST:  Did you ask or inquire of

17 Dr. Rothstein if he had any information?  He's a

18 renowned specialist that you've identified.  Would he

19 be -- wouldn't he be an appropriate person to inquire in

20 terms of the credentials of these other people --

21 MR. DOLIN:  No.

22 JUDGE PROST:  -- if you know and trust him?

23 MR. DOLIN:  No.

24 JUDGE PROST:  He wouldn't be?

25 MR. DOLIN:  No.  We would not ask Dr. Rothstein
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1 of his opinion of some other doctor in a different

2 state.

3 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.  Just to be clear,

4 Judge Prost said you know and trust him.  I just want to

5 make it clear for you.  For your purposes, for the

6 record --

7 MR. DOLIN:  I don't.

8 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Yes, that's where I was

9 going.  You didn't -- you didn't choose Dr. Rothstein,

10 correct?

11 MR. DOLIN:  I did not.  As with every American

12 who seeks medical care, generally in this country we

13 pick our own providers, and Dr. Newman picked this

14 provider.

15 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Her name is Judge Newman.

16 MR. DOLIN:  She is actually a doctor as well.

17 She is a Ph.D.

18 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  To your knowledge, did she

19 have a prior relationship with Dr. Rothstein before this

20 test?

21 MR. DOLIN:  She knows -- she has known

22 Dr. Rothstein for some time.

23 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Personally or professionally?

24 MR. DOLIN:  Both.

25 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Does that raise any concerns
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1 with you about whether or not he's rendering an

2 independent judgment?

3         MR. DOLIN:  It does not.  He rendered this

4 judgment as -- again, in his capacity as a professor of

5 neurology.  He put it on his letterhead.  His license is

6 on the line --

7         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But he has both a personal

8 and a professional relationship with her.

9         MR. DOLIN:  But that is not surprising.  I mean,

10 people often have both a personal and professional -- I

11 to this day have a professional relationship -- personal

12 relationship with my pediatrician.  That is not

13 surprising.

14         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Are you still seeing the

15 pediatrician?  That was a joke, just trying to insert

16 some levity.

17         MR. DOLIN:  Sometimes.  I'll give you an answer.

18 Sometimes.

19         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.

20         MR. DOLIN:  Although not recently because she

21 retired.

22         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I really want to give you a

23 chance, and I know that it says three minutes left, but

24 I will extend the time because on several occasions you

25 sought to try to move to something that you wanted to
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1 talk about, and we kept you on the topics that we wanted

2 to ask questions about.

3         So I feel like if there's something you wanted to

4 move to, I want to give you the chance to --

5         MR. DOLIN:  No, I am here to answer the

6 Committee's questions, but I guess two points, and I'll

7 try to make them quick.  One of the main concerns, I

8 suppose, of this Committee throughout was Judge Newman's

9 alleged delays in production of the opinions, including

10 that compared to an average time for -- for an average

11 judge of this Court and her, the difference between

12 those average times is 141 days.  If you do the math,

13 between 199 that it takes Judge Newman and the 58 that

14 it takes an average judge --

15         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Fifty-three.

16         MR. DOLIN:  -- 53, so it works out to be 141

17 days.  In a recent paper by Dr. Katznelson, he

18 calculates that the average difference between a

19 unanimous opinion and an opinion with a dissent is 143

20 days.  So a unanimous opinion issues 143 days earlier,

21 on average, than an opinion with a dissent or a

22 concurrent opinion.  That seems to track pretty well

23 with Judge Newman's delays given the fact that she

24 dissents in more than half of the cases.

25         So her dissents -- her delays are not
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1 extraordinary, but even more important -- and that's

2 leaving aside the Dr. Katznelson paper -- this is based

3 on the Court's own data.  Judge Newman's delays between

4 2020 and 2021, where there was apparently no suspicion

5 of any disability, and 2021 to 2023, have been reduced.

6 She's now --

7         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Counsel -- Counsel, her

8 sittings were reduced.  She sat 65 cases through the

9 second period where the average judge sat 128.  She sat

10 closer to the normal level of everyone else in the

11 earlier period.  So the explanation, with all due

12 respect, to why she might have been able to get the same

13 number of opinions out quicker is because she sat on,

14 like, half the cases than she had the previous time

15 period compared to how --

16         MR. DOLIN:  Of course, Judge Moore, but that was

17 not her choice.  You -- it's hard -- it's hard for me to

18 understand how --

19         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  You say that was not her

20 choice?  None of the time period that we measured, just

21 to be clear, was any period of time in which she was

22 prevented from sitting by any of us.

23         MR. DOLIN:  My understanding, based on my time in

24 clerking on the Court and my conversations with Judge

25 Newman, is that judges don't just pick their cases, that
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1 the assignment -- and also reviewing the clerical

2 procedure -- the assignment is done by the Chief Judge

3 together working with the Office of the Clerk.  Maybe

4 I'm wrong.

5         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Completely false.

6         MR. DOLIN:  So...

7         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  The Chief Judge has no input

8 whatsoever --

9         MR. DOLIN:  Not assignment, but assignment to the

10 panels, assignment to the panels, for how many --

11         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  That's completely false.  The

12 Chief Judge has no input whatsoever.  Every judge does

13 their own selection.

14         MR. DOLIN:  Fair enough.  I apologize for that

15 misunderstanding.

16         And the second point that --

17         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And just to be clear, the

18 assignment of cases is random in the event that somehow

19 this transcript didn't make that clear.  No judge

20 chooses their individual cases --

21         MR. DOLIN:  Of course.

22         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  -- and the assignment of

23 cases to each panel is random, but the judge's choice to

24 sit or not sit has always been the judge's choice

25 prior -- during these time periods that were measured.
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1         MR. DOLIN:  Well, fair enough, and then I

2 apologize for my misunderstanding and my misreading of

3 the clerical procedures.

4         I guess -- I know I'm out of time, but I did want

5 to touch on the potential sanctions.  As we indicated

6 in --

7         JUDGE PROST:  I'm sorry?

8         MR. DOLIN:  Potential sanctions.

9         JUDGE PROST:  Thank you.

10         MR. DOLIN:  As we indicated in our letter, not

11 only is the requirement that Judge Newman sit for

12 medical exam unprecedented, has never been done, I know

13 this Committee cited the Adams case.  Judge Adams never

14 actually did sit for the medical exam and had no

15 sanctions imposed for it.

16         JUDGE TARANTO:  I'm sorry, but there was an order

17 upheld by the Judicial Conference Committee that

18 required him to do so.  Then on remand he -- basically

19 he reformed his behavior, and the Judicial Council,

20 after a certain waiting period, decided that the

21 proceeding didn't need to go forward.  So there has been

22 an affirmed order compelling in that case a psychiatric,

23 I think, examination, correct?

24         MR. DOLIN:  Which he declined to do and received

25 no sanction for it.  Even on remand, he declined to sit
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1 for -- because on remand, the judicial investigating --

2 the Special Committee requested that he sit for the exam

3 again.  He declined to do it again.  The Special

4 Investigative Committee recommended a six-month

5 suspension, which the Judicial Council of the Sixth

6 Circuit refused to endorse.

7         UNIDENTIFIED:  Um-hum.

8         MR. DOLIN:  So the requirement -- so Judge Newman

9 would be the first Judge in the history of this country

10 to sit for a forced medical examination, okay?

11         But on the sanctions, to get back to the six

12 months, one, of course, our position is no sanctions are

13 warranted because we do not believe that Judge Newman

14 either refused to cooperate or that, if she did, that

15 such refusal was without a good cause, but to the extent

16 that this Committee or this Judicial Council believes

17 that a sanction is warranted, we would note that Judge

18 Newman has already been suspended from sitting on cases

19 for six months.

20         My understanding is that the September calendar

21 is out, so it would be April, May, June, July, August,

22 September -- six months.  If it takes some time for this

23 Committee to issue its report, then, of course, we will

24 have 21 days to review it and file our appeal to the

25 Judicial Council, et cetera, et cetera.  That gets us
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1 probably into the October calendar.  So at least on that

2 point, the sanction imposed, even taken into Judge

3 Adams' precedent, they suggested six months, and

4 certainly no more is appropriate here.

5 I'm happy to answer any other questions, but I do

6 have one question for the Committee if it will permit

7 me, and this goes back to, Judge Moore, at the very

8 beginning you said this matter is confidential, and I

9 said I understand, but I do want to go back to that.

10 We would like some guidance from the Committee as

11 to what can -- obviously we understand that no witness

12 names or witness statements can be discussed, I

13 understand that, and we have tried to keep that -- you

14 know, to keep that within that order, but we would like

15 to have some guidance as to which part of, beyond the

16 fact that this hearing has occurred, can be discussed.

17 CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  At this point, nothing.  You

18 can submit a 23(b)(7) request to have the transcript

19 made public.  You and I can work collectively on making

20 certain it's redacted.  For example, quite a bit of

21 Judge Newman's personal medical information was

22 discussed, and I'm not 100 percent positive what about

23 that you would like to have redacted or not have

24 redacted.  I don't remember if witness names were

25 discussed at all, but in any event, you know, I think
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1 that probably we should wait and see the transcript and

2 then collectively work together to ensure that what is

3 released is something that we're both comfortable with.

4 Does that sound reasonable?

5         MR. DOLIN:  That sounds reasonable.  I'm

6 certainly happy to put in a formal 23(b)(7) request.  I

7 think I've made it in my letter -- in my last letter to

8 the Committee, as well as here orally --

9         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  If you want me to, I will

10 just assume this oral request is a 23(b)(7) request --

11         MR. DOLIN:  Right.

12         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  -- to have the transcript

13 made public --

14         MR. DOLIN:  After --

15         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  -- and if it's okay with

16 you --

17         MR. DOLIN:  -- right, correct.

18         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  -- I would like to review the

19 transcript first to ensure that nothing about it

20 contains information that should be otherwise kept

21 completely confidential.

22         MR. DOLIN:  Of course, and vice versa.

23         And then, with that, I guess I'll close with

24 just, you know, again, reiterating our request that our

25 letter brief, which, of course, the Committee can, you
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1 know, edit for -- I don't think that there's any witness

2 names there, but the letter brief as well as

3 everything -- all the submissions up until now be

4 released pursuant to 23(b)(7), and we have made those

5 requests in the submissions themselves.

6         CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Anything further?

7         Okay.  Thank you, Counsel.  This case is taken

8 under submission.

9         (Whereupon, at 2:51 p.m. the hearing was

10 adjourned.)
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From:
To: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore
Cc: Judge Richard G. Taranto; Judge Sharon Prost; 
Subject: Re: interview
Date: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 3:54:09 PM

Yes, I will be in Your Honor's chambers at 1:00 tomorrow.  Thank you for the flexibility.

Regards,

From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 3:50 PM
To: 
Cc: Judge Richard G. Taranto ; Judge Sharon Prost

; 
Subject: RE: interview
 
Would 1:00 pm tomorrow work? 
 
The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
 

From:  
Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 3:47 PM
To: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Cc: Judge Richard G. Taranto  Judge Sharon Prost

; 
Subject: Re: interview
 
Hello Chief Judge Moore,
 
I appreciate the urgency of Your Honor's need to interview me in this matter.  Would it be
possible to conduct this interview tomorrow morning, April 12th?  I have duties and
commitments in my role as Judge Newman's clerk in New York for the remainder of this
week.  Please let me know if this would be suitable.
 
Regards,

Law Clerk to the Honorable Pauline Newman
 

From: Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore 
Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 2:40 PM



To: 
Cc: Judge Richard G. Taranto ; Judge Sharon Prost

; Chief Judge Kimberly A. Moore ; 

Subject: interview

In connection with an on-going investigation being conducted by our court, the
undersigned judges need to interview you regarding Judge Newman.  There is
some urgency to this matter and we propose to interview you at 10:00 am on
Thursday, April 13, 2023 in 901.  Your presence and cooperation is required by
the court.  At this stage of our investigation, we hope that this interview can be
conducted informally.  Please confirm by close of business today that you will
attend. 

Chief Judge Kimberly Moore
Judge Sharon Prost
Judge Richard Taranto

The Honorable Kimberly A. Moore
Chief Judge
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
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1               P R O C E E D I N G S

2               -    -    -    -    -

3          (Proceeding called to order

4 9:06 a.m.)

5          :  I'm .  I

6 represent  with respect to this

7 proceeding, and I wanted to say that there was

8 improper service of the subpoena.  She was not

9 given reasonable notice.  She was given notice

10 of less than 48 hours, which is not considered a

11 reasonable period, and she was also served by

12 , who is an agent of the

13 Court, and the Court is a party to this action,

14 and, therefore, is not a reasonable person to

15 choose to give service.

16          Also, the lack of timeliness imposed an

17 undue burden on my client.

18          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay.

19          LAW CLERK:  , if you will

20 remain seated and raise your right hand, please.

21 Whereupon --

22                    

23 a witness, called for examination, having

24 previously been duly sworn, was examined and

25 testified further as follows:
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1                   EXAMINATION

2          BY CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:

3     Q.   Please state your name.

4     A.   .

5     Q.   And your address?

6     A.   ,

7 .

8     Q.   And what is your current job?

9     A.   I am a  clerk to the Honorable

10 Pauline Newman at the U.S. Court of Appeals for

11 the Federal Circuit.

12     Q.   If you don't understand any questions

13 that I ask today, please let me know and I will

14 rephrase them.  If you answer a question without

15 asking for clarification, we will assume you

16 understand the question.  Do you understand

17 that?

18     A.   Yes, I do.

19     Q.   Do you understand you're under oath

20 today?

21     A.   I do.

22     Q.   As a judiciary employee, you're

23 required by law to cooperate with this

24 proceeding, including answering our questions

25 here today.  Do you understand this?
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1     A.   I do.

2     Q.   How long have you been working with

3 Judge Newman?

4     A.   Three years and a few months.

5     Q.   We understand that you are her 

6 clerk.  Can you tell us about that role and what

7 your responsibilities are?

8     A.   I am going to invoke my right under the

9 Fifth Amendment to avoid self-incrimination.

10     Q.   You can't tell us what your

11 responsibilities are in your job?

12     A.   I am --

13          :  I am going to say asked

14 and answered.  Objection.

15          :  How does this have

16 anything to do with a criminal --

17          :  This is not a criminal

18 case.  It's a civil case.

19          :  Exactly.

20          :  You can invoke the

21 Fifth Amendment in a civil case.

22          :  If there is some basis

23 for thinking they may be a crime involved --

24          :  That's not the --

25 actually not the law.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  You are refusing to

2 tell us what your responsibilities are for Judge

3 Newman?

4          THE WITNESS:  I am invoking my

5 privilege under the Fifth Amendment to avoid

6 self-incrimination.

7          JUDGE PROST:  Are you aware whether or

8 not there any's document in Personnel or in

9 chambers that would describe the duties of your

10 position?

11          :  Objection.  There's too

12 many people questioning the witness.  There's

13 only one person who's allowed to question the

14 witness at one time.

15          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  With all due

16 respect, that's not correct.  Under our rules,

17 that's not correct.  This is not a formal court

18 proceeding.  This is a special investigation.

19 The committee is required to be three people,

20 and we are required to all participate.  So you

21 are incorrect under the rules of the proceeding.

22          :  All right.  Well, can

23 we have one person questioning her at one time,

24 because you're asking and answering the same

25 question repeatedly.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  No.  You can lodge

2 your objection if you wish, but we are going to

3 proceed, because this is an interview by a

4 special committee under a judicial proceeding.

5          :  All right.  I object to

6 too many people questioning the witness, and

7 asked and answered.

8          JUDGE PROST:  Maybe I was

9 misinterpreted.  My question was not the same as

10 the one previously asked.  I simply asked if

11 there was documentation she's aware of in our

12 Office of Personnel or in her chambers that

13 describes the duties of a law clerk in her

14 position.

15          THE WITNESS:  I don't know.

16          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you manage or

17 otherwise review the work of other clerks in

18 chambers?

19          THE WITNESS:  I, on advice of counsel,

20 am invoking my Fifth Amendment privilege to

21 avoid self-incrimination.

22          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How often do you

23 come into the building?

24          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

25 am invoking my Fifth Amendment privilege.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you ever

2 communicate with Judge Newman?

3          THE WITNESS:  By advice of counsel, I

4 am invoking my Fifth Amendment privilege against

5 self-incrimination.

6          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How could you

7 incriminate yourself if -- by answering a

8 question of whether you communicate with the

9 person that you work for?

10          :  Objection.

11 Argumentative.  You can answer.

12          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

13 right under the Fifth Amendment to avoid

14 self-incrimination.

15          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How could you

16 incriminate yourself by answering a question

17 about whether you communicate with the person

18 that you report to?

19          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

20 right against self-incrimination under the Fifth

21 Amendment.

22          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How often do you

23 see Judge Newman in person?

24          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

25 Fifth Amendment right.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you ever meet

2 with her by Zoom?

3          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

4 Fifth Amendment right.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you ever talk to

6 her on the phone?

7          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

8 Fifth Amendment.

9          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How are cases

10 assigned in your chambers?

11          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

12 Fifth Amendment right on that.

13          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How many bench

14 memos would you estimate that you have drafted

15 for Judge Newman in the last year?

16          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

17 Fifth Amendment.

18          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you draft

19 opinions for her?

20          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

21 Fifth Amendment.

22          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Does Judge Newman

23 discuss cases you?

24          THE WITNESS:  I am not going to answer

25 that.
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1          :  Let her finish the

2 question.  Let her finish.

3          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Does Judge Newman

4 discuss cases with you in advance of oral

5 argument?

6          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

7 Fifth Amendment.

8          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Are you aware of

9 any instances in which Judge Newman has offered

10 an opinion with a disposition contrary to what

11 was voted on by judges?

12          THE COURT:  I am going to invoke my

13 Fifth Amendment.

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Are you aware of

15 any instances in which Judge Newman has changed

16 her mind about the appropriate disposition of a

17 case that you have been working on?

18          THE WITNESS:  I am going to invoke my

19 Fifth Amendment.

20          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Judge Newman has

21 seven current cases assigned to her.  I am going

22 to walk through each one and ask you if you're

23 working on that case.

24          One of the cases is 

.  Are you currently working on that case?
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1          THE WITNESS:  Fifth Amendment.

2          :  Say the whole sentence,

3 please.

4          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

5 invoke my Fifth Amendment right against

6 self-incrimination.

7          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Judge Newman has a

8 case .  Are you

9 working on that case?

10          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I'm

11 invoking my Fifth Amendment right against

12 self-incrimination.

13          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  

, a second case --

15 not the same one -- are you working on that one?

16          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

17 am invoking my Fifth Amendment right against

18 self-incrimination.

19          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  

, are you working on that case?

21          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

22 am invoking my Fifth Amendment right against

23 self-incrimination.

24          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Counsel, could you

25 explain why you're advising your client to
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1 refuse to answer the simplest of questions about

2 her job?

3          :  That's privileged.  My

4 communications with my client is privileged.

5          BY CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you

6 understand,  that this is a

7 proceeding that is involving our investigation

8 into issues related to Judge Newman, and it

9 isn't an investigation into anything related to

10 you?

11          THE WITNESS:  I'm invoking my right

12 against self-incrimination under the Fifth

13 Amendment.

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand

15 that refusing to cooperate with this proceeding

16 could result in a misconduct charge because

17 you're obligated as a judicial employee to

18 participate?

19          :  Objection.  She is

20 participating.

21          You can answer.

22          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

23          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand

24 that the rules to this proceeding suggest that

25 any employee who fails to participate could be
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1 terminated for misconduct?

2          :  Objection.

3 Argumentative and threatening.

4          You can answer.

5          THE WITNESS:  No.

6          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Is it your intent

7 to answer every question that I ask you by

8 invoking the Fifth Amendment?

9          THE WITNESS:  No.

10          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Okay, then I'll

11 continue.

12          , are you

13 working on that case with Judge Newman's

14 chambers?

15          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I'm

16 invoking my right under the Fifth Amendment to

17 avoid self-incrimination.

18          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  

.  Are you working on that?

20          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

21 am invoking my Fifth Amendment right to avoid

22 self-incrimination.

23          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  , how

24 could you incriminate yourself by simply

25 acknowledging whether you are working on any
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1 certain cases?

2          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

3 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

4 against self-incrimination.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  

.  Are you working

7 on that case?

8          THE WITNESS:  I am invoking my right

9 against self-incrimination under the Fifth

10 Amendment.

11          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  

.  Are you working on

13 that case?

14          THE WITNESS:  I am invoking my right

15 against self-incrimination under the Fifth

16 Amendment.

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  

.  Are you working on that case?

19          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

20 am invoking my Fifth Amendment privilege against

21 self-incrimination.

22          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you ever send

23 Judge Newman drafts of opinions?

24          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

25 am invoking my right against self-incrimination
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1 under the Fifth Amendment.

2          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  On average, how

3 many drafts of an opinion does Judge Newman

4 receive before the opinion gets circulated to

5 the panel?

6          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

7 am invoking my Fifth Amendment right against

8 self-incrimination.

9          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How could you

10 possibly incriminate yourself by revealing how

11 many drafts of opinions are created?

12          :  Objection.

13 Argumentative.  You can answer.

14          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I'm

15 invoking my right against self-incrimination

16 under the Fifth Amendment.

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  She didn't advise

18 you to say that it was the Fifth Amendment and

19 that you shouldn't answer.  She actually said

20 you could answer.

21          :  She can answer however

22 she wants.

23          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But she started by

24 saying that, on advice of counsel, she was doing

25 it, but you didn't actually give her that
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1 advice.  So is it your decision, then, that it's

2 a Fifth Amendment privilege that you would

3 incriminate yourself if you answered the

4 question?

5          :  Objection.

6 Argumentative.

7          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

8          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Does Judge Newman

9 have any physical health issues that you're

10 aware of?

11          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

12 am invoking my right under the Fifth Amendment

13 for self-incrimination.

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How could you

15 incriminate yourself under the Fifth Amendment

16 by telling us whether the Judge has any health

17 issues?

18          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

19 am invoking my Fifth Amendment right against

20 self-incrimination.

21          JUDGE PROST:  Can I interrupt and ask,

22 I think you had said earlier that there might be

23 a line of questioning in which you would not

24 invoke the Fifth Amendment with respect to your

25 duties, or did I misunderstand?
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1          THE WITNESS:  You did not

2 misunderstand.

3          JUDGE PROST:  So there are certain

4 things that you would be prepared to discuss in

5 response to questions, so could you give us some

6 indication about where that line is drawn to

7 save us all a lot of time?

8          THE WITNESS:  Until you ask a question,

9 I can't answer that.

10          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Why don't we take a

11 five-minute break.

12          :  And can I get your

13 card?

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I don't have a

15 card.

16          :  Can I get name?

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Chief Judge Moore.

18          :  Okay.

19          (A brief recess was taken.)

20          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Can we go back on

21 the record?

22          :  Before we continue, I

23 just want to know who you are at the end of the

24 table.  That's the one person that my client

25 doesn't know who you are.
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1          :  , general

2 counsel.

3          :  Okay.

4          JUDGE PROST:  Let me just, in order to

5 expedite this for all of us, I guess I am going

6 to probe further, and you'll say what you say,

7 but I guess we are in need -- or I feel I'm in

8 need of some guidance in terms of getting you to

9 respond to questions we have.

10          So I guess are there -- I would like to

11 ask if there are any conditions, preconditions,

12 that would provide you comfort or a basis for

13 answering -- we've already had a number of

14 questions, you know, the type of questions

15 related to your job responsibilities and your

16 work.  Are there any conditions that we could

17 provide that would permit you to respond?

18          THE WITNESS:  I don't understand the

19 question.  Can you rephrase that?

20          JUDGE PROST:  I guess I don't know how

21 to restate it other than conditions,

22 preconditions.  I mean, just off the top of my

23 head, this isn't apt necessarily, but just

24 immunity, I mean, is that the kind of thing that

25 you are -- would satisfy you?  That's just
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1 really off the top of my head.

2          THE WITNESS:  No, no.

3          JUDGE PROST:  So there are no

4 conditions that you can think of, such as

5 immunity, that would allow you to answer the

6 questions?

7          THE WITNESS:  For the questions already

8 asked, no.

9          JUDGE PROST:  The type -- yeah, the --

10 okay.

11          And then I guess -- and this follows up

12 to my question earlier about can you give us

13 some guidance in order to expedite this in terms

14 of you -- I think you noted that there might be

15 questions you would be willing to answer.

16          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

17          JUDGE PROST:  If you could give us any

18 guidance, would that be -- for example, we think

19 we have already asked questions related to your

20 job duties and responsibilities.  Are there

21 questions in that realm that you'd be willing to

22 answer or is that category off the table?

23          THE WITNESS:  That category is off the

24 table.

25          JUDGE PROST:  I'm trying to think
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1 generally what I --

2          :  Can you tell us what

3 categories are on the table?

4          THE WITNESS:  I am not going to give

5 you questions to ask.

6          :  We're asking for topics

7 of questions.

8          THE WITNESS:  I understand.  I can't

9 give you topics either.  I don't know what you

10 want to know.  I've been given absolutely no

11 information what this is about.  So I can't

12 anticipate what you might ask.

13          JUDGE PROST:  And are you willing to

14 provide a further basis or information as to

15 your invocation of the privilege just so that

16 maybe there's some way to make you more

17 comfortable -- yes, ma'am?

18          :  And objection to that,

19 just because anything related to what we said is

20 privileged and confidential.  So anything

21 relating to her advice of counsel, I would tell

22 her not to answer that question.

23          JUDGE TARANTO:  If we are in the

24 position of having to decide whether you're

25 violating a duty of cooperation, we would want
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1 to know whatever you could tell us about the

2 basis for invoking a privilege against

3 self-incrimination.  Is there anything you can

4 tell us to --

5          THE WITNESS:  Not at this time, do I

6 feel comfortable divulging what we've discussed

7 during --

8          JUDGE TARANTO:  I didn't ask you about

9 what you discussed.  I asked about what basis

10 might there be to help us think about the

11 question of duty of cooperation.

12          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

13 am not going to answer the question under the

14 Fifth Amendment right against self-

15 incrimination.

16          JUDGE TARANTO:  And does the category

17 exclusion that you mentioned in reference to

18 work in chambers also apply more generally to

19 your dealings with Judge Newman?

20          :  Objection.  Confusing

21 question.  I didn't understand.

22          JUDGE TARANTO:  You answered the

23 question from Judge Prost that the category of

24 your work in chambers was -- I think your

25 language was "off the table."  Does the same
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1 apply to a category of questions about your

2 dealings with Judge Newman?

3     A.   Yes.

4     Q.   Okay.

5          :  Can you explain to us --

6 I'm asking the attorney -- when the Fifth

7 Amendment can be invoked?

8          :  The Fifth Amendment can

9 be invoked in a civil case by a nonparty.

10          :  I'm not asking what

11 proceeding types it can be invoked in, but the

12 basis on which it can be invoked.

13          :  It can be invoked when

14 the nonparty has a risk of self-incrimination.

15          :  A risk of self-

16 incrimination in a criminal proceeding

17 or evidence used against them.  Is that correct?

18          :  Evidence that can be

19 used against them.

20          :  And can you try to

21 explain, on whatever basis you can, what

22 reasonable basis would come up here?

23          :  I cannot at this time.

24          :  Because it's difficult

25 for us to understand why some of the questions
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1 about -- any of the questions being answered

2 have anything to do with --

3          :  Anything I would

4 respond to that would relate to my attorney-

5 client privilege, of advice that I have given to

6 my client.

7          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  , before

8 today, were you aware of a potential judicial

9 disability proceeding involving Judge Newman?

10          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

11          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How did you become

12 aware of it?

13          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

14 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

15 against self-incrimination.

16          :  Why did you answer the

17 first question and not this one?

18          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

19 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

20 against self-incrimination.

21          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Have you read any

22 documents given to Judge Newman in this case?

23          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

24 am going to invoke the Fifth Amendment right

25 against self-incrimination.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand

2 that this judicial disability proceeding is

3 required to be confidential?

4          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand

6 that if you were to share information about it

7 with others, that that would be a breach of the

8 rules for this proceeding?

9          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

10          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  If I tell you right

11 now that we will grant you immunity and not

12 prosecute you, not find it to constitute an act

13 of misconduct, whatever you tell us you have

14 shared or have not shared, would you be willing

15 to answer questions then?

16          THE WITNESS:  No.

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Why?

18          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

19 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

20 against self-incrimination.

21          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  There is no law

22 that prevents you from sharing this information.

23 It is just rules of our Court that says you

24 can't share confidential information.  So if

25 we're willing to grant you immunity, guarantee
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1 that you will not be found guilty of misconduct

2 for any acts of sharing that you may have

3 participated in, why can't you answer these

4 questions?

5          :  Objection.  That goes

6 to attorney-client privilege, but you can answer

7 the -- it goes to privilege, but you can answer.

8          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

9 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

10 against self-incrimination.

11          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Have you spoken to

12 others about this proceeding?

13          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

14 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

15 against self-incrimination.

16          :  Can you explain the

17 basis for your right against invoking the

18 privilege?

19          THE WITNESS:  By advice of counsel, I

20 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment --

21          :  Or can counsel explain

22 the reason?

23          :  Not at this time, no.

24          :  So there is no stated

25 basis for invoking the privilege?
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1          :  There is a basis.

2 There is a basis, but the basis is what I've

3 discussed with my client, so it's privileged and

4 confidential, and I can't discuss it with you.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But, Counsel, you

6 are giving her advice not to answer questions in

7 an investigation about a judge.  It doesn't have

8 anything to do with her.

9          So can you explain to us why you're

10 advising her not to answer these questions?

11          :  Not at this time.

12          JUDGE PROST:  When you say "not at this

13 time," does that suggest that if you had more

14 time, if you need more time, that you don't want

15 to do it in this setting -- in other words, you

16 would provide it to us in writing at some other

17 time -- when you say not at this time, I just

18 want clarification, not at this --

19          :  Not in this setting,

20 not given what -- she had exactly one day to

21 prepare for this interview with you guys, and,

22 therefore, she hasn't had time to prepare her

23 answers, and right now she needs to have the

24 time to -- to have her interview in a timely

25 manner, which she was not allowed to do.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Oh, so, please,

2 help me understand.  So if we gave you a week,

3 would you be prepared to come back and answer

4 the questions at that time, because if you just

5 need time, we are certainly willing to give you

6 time.

7          :  Nope.  She would still

8 not answer the questions.

9          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But your stated

10 reason was that she didn't have time to prepare.

11          :  Right, which she didn't

12 have time to prepare.

13          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But we are happy to

14 give you that time.

15          THE WITNESS:  But even with that time,

16 she should still invoke the privilege.

17          :  On what basis?

18          :  Again, I can't tell you

19 the basis because it's attorney-client

20 privilege.

21          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand

22 that if you talk about this proceeding with

23 others going forward, it would be an act of

24 misconduct?

25          THE WITNESS:  No.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  You don't

2 understand that this proceeding is required to

3 be kept confidential?

4          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  You do understand

6 that it's required to be confidential?

7          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

8          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And do you

9 understand that the requirement it be

10 confidential bars you from discussing it with

11 other people?

12          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

13          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  So you understand

14 that you can't discuss this proceeding with

15 other people.

16          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand

18 that if you do discuss it with other people,

19 that would be an act of misconduct?

20          :  Do you understand that

21 that would be viewed by the committee as an act

22 of misconduct?

23          THE WITNESS:  Are you telling me that

24 or are you asking me a question?

25          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand
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1 that it would be an act of misconduct to violate

2 the confidentiality?

3          THE WITNESS:  I don't understand that.

4 I'm asking you -- if you're telling me that, I

5 will take -- I understand your words.  I have no

6 knowledge of whether that would be considered an

7 act of misconduct or not.

8          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  The rules regarding

9 this proceeding require that every judicial

10 employee maintain all aspects of it in

11 confidentiality.  Did you know that?

12          THE WITNESS:  I know that the statute

13 requires that it is a confidential proceeding.

14 That is all that I know.

15          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Are you familiar

16 with the rules regarding this proceeding?

17          THE WITNESS:  No.

18          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Counsel, if you are

19 going to represent your client, I would suggest

20 that you get a copy of these rules, because,

21 , anyone that you share even the fact

22 of this proceeding with is a breach of the

23 rules.

24          So going forward, it would be

25 considered an act of misconduct if you speak
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1 with people, any people, about this proceeding.

2 Do you now understand what I'm telling you?

3          THE WITNESS:  I understand your words,

4 yes.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Will you agree not

6 to speak to anyone about these proceedings?

7          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

8 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right to

9 avoid self-incrimination.

10          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Does that mean you

11 are not --

12          THE WITNESS:  Can we take a break,

13 please?

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Sure.

15          (A brief recess was taken.)

16          :  If you could ask your

17 last question.

18          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Will you agree not

19 to speak to anyone about these proceedings?

20          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

21          JUDGE TARANTO:  I want to ask one -- at

22 least one followup question on this categories

23 of subject matter, and I think you've identified

24 two that you are -- that you view as off the

25 table for present purposes.  One had been work
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1 in chambers.  I think I asked you a question, to

2 which you gave the same answer, off the table,

3 about dealings with Judge Newman.

4          I'm going to ask the same question

5 about your perceptions of Judge Newman and her

6 ability to carry out her job.

7          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

8 am going to invoke the Fifth Amendment against

9 self-incrimination.

10          JUDGE TARANTO:  For that category as

11 well?

12          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

13          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Just to make sure

14 that we have a clear record for future purposes,

15 when you agreed that you will not speak to

16 anyone about these proceedings, that includes

17 people in chambers, people outside of the Court.

18 Do you understand that?

19          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

20          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  That includes the

21 fact of a disability proceeding as well as this

22 interview.  Do you agree with that?

23          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

24          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  So you will not

25 disclose with anyone or discuss with anyone this
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1 interview, correct?

2          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

3          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Has Judge Newman

4 instructed you in any way about how to testify

5 today?

6          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

7 would like to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

8 against self-incrimination.

9          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Has Judge Newman

10 asked you or encouraged you to talk about these

11 proceedings with other people?

12          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

13 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

14 against self-incrimination.

15          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you understand

16 that under the law, when you invoke a Fifth

17 Amendment right to invoke self-incrimination,

18 that that allows a body to draw adverse

19 inferences against you with regard to every

20 question that you invoke the privilege?

21          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

22          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Have you ever

23 stolen money from the Court?

24          :  Objection.

25 Argumentative.  You can answer.
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1          THE WITNESS:  No.

2          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you ever perform

3 any legal work related to any case here at the

4 Court?

5          THE WITNESS:  I don't understand your

6 question.

7          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you ever work on

8 any case here at the Court?

9          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

10          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you work on any

11 currently pending cases here at the Court?

12          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

13 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

14 against self-incrimination.

15          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  If you aren't

16 working on any pending cases in front of the

17 Court, what are you doing?

18          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

19 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

20 against self-incrimination.

21          :  Have you ever discussed

22 as a matter with anybody else, outside the

23 Court, the judicial proceedings, judicial

24 disability proceedings?

25          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I
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1 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

2 against self-incrimination.

3          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Have you discussed

4 the judicial proceedings in this matter with

5 people outside the Court at Judge Newman's

6 direction?

7          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

8 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

9 against self-incrimination.

10          JUDGE TARANTO:  And just circling back

11 for a little clarification for my understanding,

12 you initially expressed concern about the short

13 time frame you had to prepare for this, and then

14 what I understood that Chief Judge Moore asked,

15 if we gave you additional time that you

16 considered reasonable, if that would change your

17 responses you had to the questions that have

18 arisen today, and I think your answer was no,

19 but I just want to confirm that.

20          THE WITNESS:  It would not.

21          JUDGE TARANTO:  It would not change.

22 So it's nothing that -- no matter how much time

23 you had, this would remain the same.

24          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

25          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Can you give us
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1 some indication of why you believe that any of

2 these questions could cause you to incriminate

3 yourself?

4          :  Objection.  Calls for

5 privileged communication.

6          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  No.  I'm asking her

7 for her belief, not anything about any

8 communication.

9          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

10 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

11 against self-incrimination.

12          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Can you give us the

13 names of your co-clerks in chambers?

14          THE WITNESS:  

16          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And how long have

17 you worked with each of them?

18          THE WITNESS:   is, I believe,

19 two and a half years, roughly.   is

20 six months.   is three, four

21 months.

22          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Can you remember an

23 instance where I came down to chambers and spoke

24 to all of you?

25          THE WITNESS:  Yes.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you remember

2 that that instance involved Judge Newman

3 disclosing confidential or sensitive 

4 information ?

5          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

6 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

7 against self-incrimination.

8          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Did Judge Newman

9 disclose confidential or sensitive 

10 information ?

11          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

12 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

13 against self-incrimination.

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  After or at that

15 meeting, I asked you to agree that you would not

16 discuss that sensitive confidential information

17 further.  Do you remember that?

18          THE WITNESS:  I do.

19          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Did you agree?

20          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

21          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Have you discussed

22 it since then?

23          THE WITNESS:  No.

24          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Do you ever work

25 with ?
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1          THE WITNESS:  I do.

2          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Can you tell me

3 what his role in chambers is?

4          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

5 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

6 against self-incrimination.

7          :  Can you explain a basis

8 for invoking the privilege?

9          :  Again, the privilege is

10 invoked because of the communications I had with

11 my client, so I'm not willing to discuss it.

12          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Will you provide us

13 with a basis for believing that these kinds of

14 questions could cause you to incriminate

15 yourself?

16          THE WITNESS:  Not at this time.

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And, Counsel, do I

18 understand that you will also not provide us

19 with any basis for how any of these questions

20 could incriminate her?

21          :  Not at this time.

22          :  Is there a time that

23 would be appropriate or acceptable to you or

24 that you could do it?

25          :  I'm not sure.  I don't
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1 know.

2          :  Can you do it in a week?

3          :  No.  I don't know.  I'm

4 not sure.

5          :  If you were to do it,

6 will you provide a written response?

7          :  It depends on who you

8 order to do what.

9          :  The basis for invoking

10 the privilege to these questions.

11          :  At the moment,

12 everything related to why my client is invoking

13 the privilege is privileged and confidential,

14 and I cannot tell you why we're invoking the

15 privilege without violating attorney-client

16 privilege.

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  , do you

18 understand that we could grant you immunity from

19 any sort of misconduct proceeding in this

20 context?

21          THE WITNESS:  No.

22          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  If we did grant you

23 immunity from any sort of misconduct proceeding,

24 would you be willing to answer all of the

25 questions that we've asked today?
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1          THE WITNESS:  No.

2          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Are there any of

3 the questions we've asked today that you would

4 be willing to answer?

5          THE WITNESS:  I would continue to

6 invoke my Fifth Amendment right for the

7 questions for which I've already invoked my

8 Fifth Amendment right.

9          JUDGE TARANTO:  If immunity included

10 criminal immunity from the United States

11 Attorney, what would your answer be to that

12 question?

13          THE WITNESS:  No.

14          :  When you say "no," you

15 mean you still won't answer the questions?

16          THE WITNESS:  I will not answer those

17 questions.

18          :  So my understanding is

19 under no circumstances will you answer

20 questions.  Is that fair to say?

21          THE WITNESS:  For those questions that

22 I've already invoked, I will continue to invoke.

23          :  Okay, thank you.

24          JUDGE TARANTO:  And let me just, I

25 guess, add any state-level criminal immunity,
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1 too, if that also was provided, would you answer

2 the questions?

3          THE WITNESS:  I don't understand your

4 question.  Could you rephrase it?

5          JUDGE TARANTO:  Sure.

6 Self-incrimination is a concern about criminal

7 prosecution.  If the sovereign United States

8 provided you immunity from criminal prosecution

9 and a sovereign of any relevant state or --

10 let's add in the District of Columbia -- did the

11 same, would you still invoke your Fifth

12 Amendment privilege?

13          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Are there any

15 circumstances that would permit you to answer

16 the questions and not invoke your Fifth

17 Amendment privilege as to the questions already

18 asked?

19          THE WITNESS:  I can't speculate.

20          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  I'm not asking you

21 to speculate.  I'm saying what could we do to

22 make this a cooperative proceeding.  That's all

23 I'm seeking.

24          THE WITNESS:  I am cooperating.  I'm

25 here.
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1          :  Well, you're not

2 answering --

3          THE WITNESS:  I'm answering those

4 questions that I can answer.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  But we asked some

6 very basic questions about your duties in

7 chambers or whether you've drafted opinions or

8 whether you've written a bench memo, and these

9 are typically jobs that all law clerks do, and

10 you've refused to answer any of those questions.

11          So I'm confused, why?

12          :  And I'm just going to

13 say again that this goes to her privileged

14 communications with me, and she cannot answer

15 related to anything that we have discussed, but

16 you can answer her question.

17          THE WITNESS:  There was no question.

18          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Actually, it was,

19 why?  Why are you refusing to answer any

20 questions about your job duties in chambers?

21          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

22 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

23 against self-incrimination.

24          JUDGE PROST:  Is there a telework

25 policy in your chambers?
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1          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

2 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

3 against self-incrimination.

4          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  How many hours a

5 week do you work?

6          THE WITNESS:  Forty to 100.

7          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  And is that 40 to

8 100 for work you do for judicial matters here at

9 the Court?

10          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

11          JUDGE PROST:  And is that work

12 typically performed in person, in chambers, or

13 elsewhere?

14          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

15 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

16 against self-incrimination.

17          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  You've indicated

18 that you work 40 to 100 hours a week for

19 judicial matters here at the Court.  Can you

20 give us any examples of work you've done in the

21 last week?

22          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

23 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

24 under self-incrimination.

25          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Can you give us any
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1 examples of work you've done in the last year?

2          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

3 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

4 against self-incrimination.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  What do you spend

6 the 40 to 100 hours a weeks doing?

7          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

8 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

9 against self-incrimination.

10          JUDGE PROST:  Were you hired as a term

11 law clerk or did the position convert after a

12 certain period of time?

13          THE WITNESS:  It converted.

14          JUDGE PROST:  Do you recall

15 approximately when?

16          THE WITNESS:  At about two years,

17 roughly.

18          JUDGE PROST:  And that's two years --

19 when did you start your employment here?

20          THE WITNESS:  Early December of 2019,

21 and it converted in December -- November,

22 December of 2021.

23          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Did you tell anyone

24 that you were subpoenaed to appear here today?

25          THE WITNESS:  Yes.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Who did you tell?

2          THE WITNESS:  On advice of counsel, I

3 am going to invoke my Fifth Amendment right

4 against self-incrimination.

5          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  We have an ongoing

6 judicial misconduct and disability proceeding.

7 I am going to instruct you now that you do not

8 delete any emails in your court account.  Do you

9 understand that instruction?

10          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

11          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  Will you agree to

12 comply with that instruction?

13          THE WITNESS:  Yes.

14          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  , we

15 have no further questions at this time given

16 that you have taken off the table so many topics

17 related to your work here at the Court, and are

18 refusing to answer those questions.

19          We reserve the right to call you

20 again at some point in the future, and if at

21 some future date you can come up with

22 circumstances that you think would change

23 whether you're willing to cooperate or not,

24 please let us know.

25          THE WITNESS:  Okay.
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1          CHIEF JUDGE MOORE:  This concludes the

2 proceedings.

3          (Whereupon, at 10:15 a.m., the

4 deposition was concluded.)
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AFFIDAVIT OF 

1. My name is and I worked as Judge Newman's paralegal from 

December 28, 2021 until April 19, 2023. The statements made in this affidavit 

come from my own personal observations and experiences to the best of my 

recollection. 

2. I assisted Judge Newman with the day-to-day administration of her chambers,

including: maintaining and updating her law library; preparing financial
disclosure reports; maintaining chambers information and storage filing

systems (electronic and paper); preparing orders, notices, and opinions for filing

in the court's electronic and case management filing system; arranging meetings

and conference agendas; providing assistance for law clerk orientation and

training; providing chambers staff with assistance on the court's automated

computer and software systems; monitoring deadlines, tasks, and determining

need for action by Judge Newman; coordinating all general activities and serving

as a liaison; performing a wide variety of special projects at Judge Newman's
request; calendaring; receiving guests and visitors; scheduling and confirming

appointments; helping prepare bench-books for argument; performing legal

research for speeches and public appearances; tracking the status of draft

opinions from Judge Newman's chambers; tracking draft opinions from other

chambers that were circulated for vote; incorporating Judge Newman's edits;

reviewing legal documents assigned by Judge Newman for completeness and

accuracy; preparing draft opinions; and answering phones.

3. I provided the Special Committee investigating this matter a copy of reports that

I routinely provided Judge Newman to monitor the status of opinions assigned

to Judge Newman and the status of cases that Judge Newman was on but not

the authoring judge. Those reports are labeled "Cases Assigned to Judge

Newman Draft Tracker"; "Workload and Case Assignments" list; and "Cases

Assigned to Other Panel Members." To the best of my knowledge, those reports

were an accurate reflection of the status of cases in Judge Newman's chambers
as of the time I provided the reports.

4. I was physically present in chambers almost every day. I typically worked from

7:30am to 4:30pm Monday through Friday. Judge Newman worked primarily
remotely from her home, coming to the court approximately once or twice a

month for the most part of my time at the court.

5. As part of my responsibilities, I had a one-on-one call with Judge Newman every

workday at 9:30am to discuss these reports and the day-to-day administration

of chambers, including Judge Newman's daily calendar. I also participated on

1 
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AFFIDAVIT OF 

1. My name is and I work in the Information Technology Office (ITO) 
of the United States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit. My current title is 
Acting HelpDesk Supervisor. I have been employed in ITO since 2007. My 
responsibilities currently include supervising the work of ITO helpdesk team 
members. The facts in this affidavit come from my own personal observations to 
the best of my recollection. 

2. On April 17 the ITO helpdesk received a request from Judge Newman's 
paralegal, about assisting Judge Newman. Another member of the 
ITO staff, called Judge Newman at approximately 3:30pm that 
afternoon to see how we could assist her. -had the call on speaker. 

3. Over the course of that call, I heard Judge Newman say to-that someone at
the court was deleting her emails and I heard Judge Newman threaten that she

�oing to get her lawyers to investigate why her email was being "hacked."
-offered to assist her to locate any missing files or emails. In our experience,
Judge Newman frequently misplaces her files or emails by moving them to other
folders and forgetting were she put them or inadvertently deleting them. She
refused-offer to help her locate the missing material indicating that she
believed the court was responsible. I would describe Judge Newman as ranting,
rambling, and paranoid.

4. The following day, April 18, 2023, ITO received more phone calls from Judge
Newman's chambe • tely 3:00pm,_ received a call from Judge
Newman's laced the call on speaker so that I could 
also listen. man's phones were being forwarded 
to Judge N told that we would 
investigate the issue and the and I then checked the Cisco Call 
Manager, which indicated that her phones were not being forwarded. 

5. A few minutes later, I answered a call from and Judge Newman. They
said that the reason why Judge Newman had been unable to hear incoming calls
was because the volume on her phone had been turned all the way down.

6. At that point, I thought it was best to double check that Judge Newman's phones
were properly working. When I called Judge Newman's line, Judge Newman
picked up the phone. I informed Judge Newman that we were calling to make
sm·e her phone was working correctly and that she could hear the calls properly.
I recall Judge Newman then asking why was on her line. I informed
Judge Newman that the system was always set up to allow her paralegal to
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AFFIDAVIT OF 

1. My name is . I have worked in the Information Technology Office 

(ITO) of the United States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit for 17 years. 

My current title is Acting IT Director. Before that role, I worked as the court's 

Helpdesk Manager. As the Helpdesk Manager, my responsibilities included 

taking calls and answering emails asking for IT assistance and supervising the 

work of the more junior ITO helpdesk team members. The facts in this affidavit 

come from my own personal observations to the best of my recollection. 

2. In my time with the court, I have worked with Judge Newman on several occasions

in assisting with IT issues. When I first started, I was amazed that someone in

her 80s, like Judge Newman was at the time, could pick things up so quickly and

easily. However, particularly over the last few years, I've noticed a significant

increase in Judge Newman forgetting how to perform basic tasks that used to be

routine for her. Judge Newman seems to contact the ITO helpdesk once or twice

a week usually confused because she forgets how to remotely connect to the court's

network or because she forgets where she stored a file or an email.

3. Judge Newman routinely blamed her inability to find a file or email on someone

"hacking" her computer. I would describe her on these calls as sounding paranoid.

However, when I would scan for malware and viruses, there would be nothing that

would suggest any malicious interference with her computer, and I would usually

be able to find the file she was looking for on a desktop folder or other location

where she had forgot she saved it to. Rather than take responsibility for the

errors, she would blame hackers or the computer.

4. It now takes at least double the time to help Judge Newman with an IT issue than

it does an average court user because she often cannot recall routine steps or

processes and we will need to walk her through the entire process and repeat the

same steps over and over again. These are things like remoting into the system

that used to be no problem for Judge Newman until more recently.

5. Judge Newman was also unable to complete an annual security awareness

training two years ago. That training required a user to watch a short 10-20

minute video presentation and then answer a series of questions based on the

information provided in the video. The test is multiple choice and asks the same

questions when a user retests. I believe Judge Newman tried and failed multiple

times to answer enough questions to pass the training, because she was unable to

retain the information from the video she had just watched. I had to sit with her

and help feed her answers to the questions in order for her to pass the training. I

do not have any record of her taking it last year and she hasn't started this year.
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AFFIDAVIT OF 

My name is . I have worked in the Clerk's Office of the United 

States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit for seven years, and I have served as 

Court Services Coordinator since March 2021. Before that, I served as Legal 

Specialist and in other positions within the Clerk's Office. In these capacities, I have 

served as a courtroom deputy, and in my most recent position I have been responsible 

for coordinating courtroom and argument logistics. Among other tasks, I greet judges 

and make certain they have everything that they need for argument. I have 

interacted with Judge Newman routinely on a monthly basis. The facts in this 

affidavit come from my own personal observations to the best of my recollection. 

1. When the court decided to postpone in-person oral arguments due to the

COVIU-19 pandemic, I helped prepare Judge Newman and all other judges for 

telephonic arguments. During this period, from March 2020 to August 2021, we 

frequently experienced delays connecting Judge Newman to the telephonic 

arguments. Judges provided both primary and backup phone number, but there were 

several instances when we were not able to reach Judge Newman at either number 

she provided. In those instances, we contacted the Information Technology Office, 

and after their support staff reached out to Judge Newman we were only then able to 

connect her for argument. These connection delays were significantly more common 

for Judge Newman than other judges and would occasionally delay the argument 

start time by several minutes, and in some cases more than ten minutes. 

2. I also recall spending considerably more time preparing Judge Newman for the

transition to telephonic and video arguments than any of the other judges. Of the 

three orientation sessions that I scheduled with Judge Newman and that I lead, each 

took around 45 minutes to an hour. For comparison, sessions with other judges 

averaged 15-20 minutes and were often conducted in a group of several judges. While 

judges frequently had questions, Judge Newman's questions would often be 

premature (i.e., questions that would have been answered in the normal course of the 

orientation) or occasionally repetitive. Many of the questions I would receive from 

other judges in these settings centered on how these new procedures would impact 

Judge Newman, and in at least two circumstances I scheduled orientations for other 

judges to assist specifically in preparing them for panels they served on with Judge 

Newman. 

3. In one orientation session I held with Judge Newman about nine twelve

months ago, which I expected would take no more than 15 to 20 minutes, the session 

lasted around one hour. The bulk of the time was not spent on the technical 

procedures, but instead on an unrelated issue involving our system-generated final 

calendar that I had not caught. I told Judge Newman that I would correct the 

calendar and explained to her how the issue arose. She was suspicious and confused 
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United States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit 

In re Complaint No. FC-23-90015 

*** 

                      DECLARATION [Affidavit 12]

I, declare from my personal know ledge that the following 

is true. 

1. From the period of Decembe1· 26, 2016, through the date of this declaration, I

have served as the appointed chief deputy clerk for the U.S. Court of Appeals

for the Federal Circuit.

2. As the senior deputy clerk, the circuit clerk has designated me as his primary

custodian of the court's records and papers pursuant to Federal Rule of

Appellate Procedure 45(d), which includes the data and information stored

within the court's electronic filing system (CM/ECF).

3. Data from the CM/ECF can be retrieved in several ways for purposes of

performing data analysis, including thl'Ough formatted reports and through

raw data extractions.

4. The Cl�rk's Office uses Microsoft SQL Server Reporting Services {SSRS) to

prepare regular internal reports, including monthly reports fo1· Federal

Circuit judges including information about the status of their cases and

overall internal statistical information.

5. The Clerk's Office also uses Db Visualizer to retrieve the raw data from

CM/ECF that supports the formatted data on the SSRS reports.

Page 1 of 9 



















 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Exhibits A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, I, J, K, L, M, N, and O  

have been redacted in their entirety for confidentiality purposes. 



United States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit 

In re Complaint No. FC-23-90015 

*** 

                       AFFIDAVIT [Affidavit 13]

I, do hereby swear under oath that the following is true to 

the best of my know ledge. 

1. From the period of December 26, 2016, through May 30, 2023, I served as

the appointed chief deputy clerk for the U.S. Court of Appeals for the

Federal Circuit. On May 31, 2023, I was designated as acting clerk of

court for the U.S. Court of Appeals.

2. As then senior deputy clerk at all times relevant to this affidavit, the

circuit clerk has designated me as his primary custodian of the court's

records and papers pursuant to Federal Rule of Appellate Procedure 45(d),

which includes the data and information stored within the court's

electronic filing system (CM/ECF).

3. Data from CM/ECF can be retrieved in several ways for purposes of

performing data analysis, including th.i·ough formatted reports and

through raw data extraction.

4. The Clerk's Office uses Microsoft SQL Server Reporting Services (SSRS)

to prepare regular internal reports, including monthly reports for Federal

Cfrcuit judges including information about the status of thefr cases and

overall internal statistical information.
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